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Azle ISD board trustees 

voted to approve the hiring 

of six additional police of-

ficers for the district’s po-

lice department during the 

board’s June 20 meeting.
“The safety of our stu-

dents and staff has always 
been a priority and will re-

main a top priority of Azle 

ISD,” said AISD Superin-

tendent Todd Smith.
“The district is committed 

to adding police officers to 
the Azle ISD Police Depart-

ment in an effort to have a 
licensed peace officer at all 
campuses. Azle ISD Police 
Chief Darren Brockway is 
working diligently to fill 

A protest in Azle
Women demonstrate against Supreme Court decision

Carlee Brackett and Tammy staged a protest Saturday morning in Azle. Photo by Don Munsch SEE STORY PAGE 3A.

BY JESSICA MCKINNEY
azlereporter@azlenews.net

North Texas residents 

saw firsthand the danger of 
fireworks being discharged 
during a period of severe 

drought over the Fourth of 

July weekend.
Professional pyrotechnics 

shows like the one at Pan-

ther Island Pavilion in Fort 

Worth had to be canceled 

almost as soon as they be-

gan because of grass fires 
that were ignited by the fire-

works.
The same happened in 

Hudson Oaks at its Boomin’ 
Fourth celebration, with dry 
grassy fields being ignited 
and quickly spreading at the 

start of the show.

Fourth of July is over, but fire dangers continue
Tarrant and Parker coun-

ties are both at 100% ab-

normally dry conditions, 

according to www.Drought.
gov, with no immediate re-

lief in sight.
Currently, more than 95% 

of Tarrant County and near-

ly 67% of Parker County 
are classified under severe 
drought. The rain chances 
forecasted for the next 10 
days are less than 20%.

The dry conditions 

prompted Parker County 

Judge Pat Deen to issue an 
emergency order preventing 

the discharge of fireworks 
before the holiday week-

end. The order was then ex-

tended by Gov. Greg Abbott 

ESD 1 Firefighters handled a grass fire just north of the FM 1885 and 920 intersection the morning of July 5th on Box 4610. Courtesy photoSEE FIRE DANGERS, PAGE 7A.

SEE AISD OFFICERS, PAGE 4A.

AISD adding more police 

officers to department

these positions. In addition, 
we will continue our ongo-

ing commitment to meeting 

the mental health needs of 

all students.”
The AISD police depart-

ment has consisted of a po-

lice chief, Darren Brockway, 
and Officer Steve Stutsman, 
who primarily teaches crim-

inal justice courses at Azle 

High School.
AISD also has five Azle 

Police Department police 

officers serving as school 
resource officers during the 
school year. The SROs have 
been present mainly at the 

high school and junior high 

campuses, and officers rotat-
ing through the elementary 

BY DON MUNSCH
don@azlenews.com

A new Starbucks is still a 
couple of months or so away 
from opening in Azle.

Some day in the future, 

it might have some serious 

coffee competition from 

Azle’s retail offerings continue to expand

another retail establishment 

that could come to Azle. It’s 
a place also known for its 
donuts, a place where people 
can wash down their donuts 
with coffee.

David Hawkins, director 
of planning and develop-

ment with the city of Azle, 

gave an update last week on 
new retail development in 
Azle. 

Starbucks will operate in 
Walmart’s parking lot, on 
the side of the lot near FM 

730. 
“They have not provided 

us a completion date, but we SEE NEW RETAIL, PAGE 2A.

just found out that the sewer 
line has been constructed,” 

Hawkins said. “The shell of 
the building looks like it’s 
finished, but I have not seen 
a final sign-off on that yet. 
They still have to finish up 
the inside. I would imagine 
it’s still about two to three 

months away.”
City officials found out in 

March that there was a miss-

ing sewer line that was orig-

inally placed by Walmart, 

so Starbucks had to extend 

an additional sewer line to 
serve the building.

“That was unanticipat-

ed additional cost and a 

three- to four-month delay,” 

Hawkins said. “Otherwise, I 
think they would have been 
done by now, if that sewer 
line was there.”

On Highway 199, next 

The new Starbucks is expected to open in a few months. Photo by Don Munsch
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JumpPro’s Texas July Savings! 

Receive your choice of a free game or free table 
and 6 chairs rental with any reservation!

817-899-0932
Visit us on Facebook at @JumpprosTexas to book for your party or event needs today! 

Dr. Joseph McCreary, III 
FAMILY & COSMETIC DENTISTRY

Family dentistry for all ages. Serving the Azle, Texas area

209 Roe Street, Azle TX 76020 • 817-444-3209

Go ahead 
& smile!

PREVENTATIVE • RESTORATIVE • COSMETIC

Crowns & Bridges • Whitening • Dentures • Dental Veneers 

Implant Restoration • Cosmetic Dentistry • Pediatric Dentistry & More...
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MON CLOSED

door to Pinnacle Bank, a 

new Discount Tire location 

should be finished by fall. 
Construction began in Janu-

ary on the building. 
“They’re shooting for 

October-November of this 
year to finish that project,” 
Hawkins said.  “It looks like 
the building’s almost done. 
They still have to finish all 
the paving and drainage and 
stuff like that.”

On FM 730 across from 
Walmart, some drainage and 

engineering still need to be 

completed for some retail 
development. Wendy’s and 
Panda Express restaurants 
are the first new businesses 
planned for the development 
and are expected to open 
early next year, Hawkins 
said. Wendy’s will be locat-
ed next to Domino’s Pizza. 
The developer is currently 
pursuing other restaurants to 
be built on the tract of land, 
Hawkins said.

Down the road on 730, 

next to Capriccio’s restau-

NEW RETAIL, CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1A.

rant, there’s a development 
being planned called Hor-
nets Plaza. A parking lot 
and 8,400 square foot multi-
tenant building with a drive-

through are expected to be 

constructed. That tract of 
land is zoned commercial, 
and it could attract medical 

and retail establishments or 

restaurants. Hawkins said 
the developer actually just 

had it all re-platted into a 
single lot for both a parking 
lot and new retail building 

south of Capriccio’s. The 
new parking lot is expected 
to be shared with the Capric-

cio’s restaurant.
“Hopefully in the next 

week or so, we’ll start see-

ing a lot of activity there,” 
Hawkins said. “The owner 
had indicated that he‘s been 

in contact with a Dunkin’ 
Donuts as a potential candi-
date for that drive-through. 
It’s not definitive yet, but 
it’s my understanding he’s 
been in contact, so I’d like to 
think that once the building 

starts going up, he’ll try to 
tighten that one down a little 

bit and get that one in.”
Main St. Tacos will open 

near South Stewart Street 

and South Main Street. The 

restaurant will operate in a 
renovated building.

“We were told a few days 
ago that they’re trying to 
open on Aug. 15, so right 
now they’re working on fin-

ishing up the inside of the 
building as well as signage,” 
he said.

That business has a lo-

cation in Mansfield in that 
city’s downtown area. 

Also, the Dairy Queen 
building near QuikTrip 
should be demolished soon.

“We just issued a permit 
today for asbestos to be re-

moved from the building,” 
Hawkins said July 8. “So 
it looks like a demolition 

permit is going to be com-

ing up pretty quick to tear 
down that building. We ac-

tually have a pre-develop-

ment meeting scheduled for 

next week with the property 
owner about future plans 
with that property, so I think 
they’re wanting to come in 
with a QSR, quick serve res-

taurant, to go in that same 

spot. I don’t think it’s going 
to be Dairy Queen, but it will 
be something else. So, we’ll 
find that out next week.”

The building is about 50-
60 years old, Hawkins said, 
and he hopes it can be de-

molished in the next few 
weeks. 

“Hopefully, we’ll get a 
permit for redevelopment of 
that site later this fall,” he 
said.

Another development in 
the works is Katie’s Express 
Car Wash that will go up on 
199 next to Russell’s Feed & 
Supply store, Hawkins said. 

The new Discount Tire location is expected to be finished by fall. Photo by Don Munsch

Main St. Tacos will open near South Stewart Street and South Main Street in a renovated building. 

 Photo by Don Munsch
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By Local Health 
Expert Dr. Robert 

Moss PT, ScD, 
OCS, FAAOMPT

Attention: Springtown And 
Azle Back Pain Sufferers

FREE Report Exposes Back Pain Myths and 

Dangerous Treatments…
“Not everyone will qualify to receive this report that uncovers Back Pain 
Myths and Dangerous Treatments …Take the qualification quiz to find out if 
YOU are eligible: 

Springtown, TX - If you or a loved one suffer from back pain, then reading 

this may be the most important thing you do this year. It may unlock the 

agonizing mystery of your back pain and show you a way to get back the 

life you deserve….

•  A life where you can get a restful night’s sleep without tossing and turning 

trying to find a position that doesn’t hurt

•   A life where you can walk in the grocery store without the embarrassment 

of hanging on the cart because of your back pain

•  A life where you can play with your kids or grandkids without worrying about your back 

“going out” and having to take a handful of dangerous pills 

• A life where you can do and enjoy all the things you see so many others doing and 

enjoying but your bad back has kept you watching from the sidelines. 

Basically a life without the curse of back pain. 

This report exposes common myths about back pain that other “medical professionals” 

don’t want you to know…How pain medications, muscle relaxers and back surgery don’t 

work and can leave you with crippling side effects. 

Here’s What You Will Learn Inside This Eye Opening Report:

• The ONE Everyday Activity Back Pain Sufferers are Doing WRONG which Blocks Healing 

and Actually Makes Back Pain WORSE…

• The 3 Most Common Causes of Lower Back Pain and Sciatica 

• The shocking truth about lower back surgeries. 

• What the drug companies don’t want you to know about pain relievers that can actually 

hurt you.

•  Why your insurance company prefers that you stay sick and injured all the time. 

• A 100% Natural, Safe Solution Exists - and How You Can Access It!

You should Only Order This Report If You Pass This “Qualification Quiz”. 

1. Are you between the ages of 35-70?

2. Do you currently have or have had back pain in the last 6 months?

3. Is your back pain affecting your daily activities?

4. Are you open minded and willing to take action to end your back pain?

Please do not call if you are just curious! We only have 

a limited number of reports, please don’t take one from 

someone who really needs the help.

If you passed the qualifications quiz 

above and would like your free copy, call

817-220-6677 

BY DON MUNSCH
don@azlenews.com

Carlee Brackett and Tam-

my staged a protest Saturday 

morning in Azle.

The two Azle women – 

Tammy asked that her sur-

name not be used – held 

signs in the right of way 

in front of a parking lot on 

West Main Street, just south 

of City Hall. Both support 

women’s rights, including 

abortion rights, in light of 

the Supreme Court decision 

that overturned Roe v. Wade 

on June 24. Other protests 

were held in the rest of the 

country over the weekend.

Some Main Street drivers 

rolled past and honked or 

gestured in a positive way 

to the two women as they 

stood with signs. Many just 

glanced at the signs and con-

tinued on their way. Tammy 

said one man made a derog-

atory comment to her and, 

later, another man rolled by 

and seemed to take a picture 

with his phone and com-

mented on the size of the 

protest. 

“I’m here to support wom-

en and equal rights for peo-

ple who need them,” Brack-

ett said. “Abortion is health 

care, and health care is a 

fundamental human right.” 

Tammy said she received 

a communication from a 

woman who was being in-

duced into labor Monday – 

she was due on Sunday – and 

A protest in Azle

said she would have been at 

the Azle protest otherwise.

A registered nurse for 30 

years, Tammy said she con-

siders herself “very much 

pro-life” but also supports 

abortion rights, self-determi-

nation and the right to health 

care. She said the Supreme 

Court decision on abortion 

rights was “callous” and 

said she is concerned for 

women’s health, including 

for  young women.

“Especially in Texas, our 

mortality rate is so high,” 

she said. “And then we also 

don’t have the social servic-

es to support single moms.” 

(The Supreme Court’s deci-

sion allows states to make 

their own laws regarding 

abortion rights.)

Now that abortion rights 

will be banned in Texas 

– with the exception of a 

mother’s life or major bodily 

function being endangered, 

as reported in The Texas Tri-

bune – Tammy doesn’t think 

lawmakers will put more 

money into social services.

“(Gov. Greg) Abbott’s 

notorious for taking money 

from children and social ser-

vices,” she said. 

She thinks more chil-

dren and women will live 

in poverty as a result of the 

new abortion restrictions 

in Texas. She also worries 

about how doctors will re-

act to the new laws, as they 

will fear getting into trouble 

and being sued, fined or los-

Women demonstrate against Supreme Court decision

ing their licenses. The Texas 

Tribune also reported no ex-

ceptions for abortions will 

be made for rape or incest. 

Last week, President Joe 

Biden signed an executive 

order that seeks to safeguard 

reproductive health services. 

Tammy discussed a num-

ber of topics around abor-

tion and the fallout of the 

Supreme Court decision, 

including Justice Clarence 

Thomas writing in his con-

curring decision on June 24 

that other issues based on the 

same legal foundation as Roe 

v. Wade should be brought 

to the Court’s attention, 

including contraceptives, 

same-sex relationships and 

same-sex marriage. Tammy 

noted that Thomas did not 

bring up interracial marriage 

as an issue that should be 

reviewed by the Court, ex-

plaining that he mentioned 

other cases involving equal-

ity should be brought before 

the Court. (Thomas, a Black 

man, is married to a white 

woman. Loving v. Virginia, 

a Supreme Court decision 

from 1967, overturned laws 

that banned interracial mar-

riage.)

“How does he justify that 

he deserves equality more 

than women?” Tammy said. 

Carlee Brackett and Tammy held signs in the right of way in front of a parking lot on West Main Street. They were the only two people at 

the protest.  Photo by Don Munsch
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• Serena Frieberg - Concessions
• Joni Hall - Fundraising/Concessions
• Eric Hunter - Pyrotechnician

Follow the Flag Planning CommitteeFollow the Flag Planning Committee

• Azle Dental Care
• Community Waste Disposal
• Cornerstone Community Church
• Pinnacle Bank
• The Church at Azle
• The Word - Lakeside Church of God
• The Office on Main St.

Title Sponsorship Title Sponsorship (Min $1,000)(Min $1,000)

Special Donations & SupportSpecial Donations & Support
• Ash Creek Baptist Church
• Eric & Loretta Hunter
• First Baptist Church Lakeside
• First United Methodist Church of Azle
• JBI Electric
• JP Bowlin
• Larry’s Carpet
• The Abbey Church 

Gold Sponsorship Gold Sponsorship (Min $500)(Min $500)

• Azle Christian Church
• David Melville Excavating
• Frost Bank
• Moses Druxman (Briar/Reno Fire Chief)
• Paul Crabtree, CPA
• Ray & Ruth Ivey

Silver Sponsorship Silver Sponsorship (Min $250)(Min $250)

The Azle Area Ministerial Alliance is so grateful for all the sponsors, volunteers, and support that made 
‘Follow the Flag 2022’ a huge success. This event would not be possible without your generosity and love for our 

community. Special Thanks to the following Churches, City Services, Businesses, and individuals.

THANK YOU SPONSORS

• Ken Lemon - Misting Tent/Water Station
• Glyn Murphy - General Advisor
• Stony Stonebreaker - General Advisor

• Azle Fire & Paramedics
• Azle Library
• Azle News
• Azle Parks & Recreation
• Azle Police Department
• Adult & Teen Challenge
• Boys Scout Troop 243
• Briar/Reno Fire Department
• Brookshire’s of Azle
• Chicken Express Springtown
• Christians Engaged
• CMA Chapter Koinonia Riders
• City of Azle
• Community Bible Fellowship
• Eric Boggs

• First Baptist Church Azle
• Gateway Chiropractic (Dr. Walls)
• Greg & Carey Boggs
• Jerry Cotten
•  Jim Magnuson (drone pilot) 

& Lisa Hartman (co-pilot)
• Phillip Lalonde family
• Safe Harbor
• Servolution Network
• Sam & Carol Boggs
• Sandy Shaffer
• Sonshine Ministries
• The Edge Church
• The Gideons
• The Optimist Club

campuses.
Brockway has already 

begun screening appli-
cants and hopes to have the 
six positions filled before 
school starts on Aug. 17.

“I’ve got four that are 
looking pretty good,” he 
said. “I’m strongly looking 
at people with extensive 
years of law enforcement 
experience.”

Brockway is considering 

AISD OFFICERS, CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1A.

candidates who have over 
20 years of experience, 
“somebody who knows 
what they’re doing.”

By hiring six more dedi-
cated Azle ISD officers, 
that means added security 
at all campuses across the 
district.

Brockway said that the 
district will still consider 
implementing the Texas 
School Guardian program, 

which would allow campus 
teachers and staff to volun-
teer to be armed on campus 
after undergoing 16 hours 
of training and passing a 
written test.

 The Azle ISD Safety 
Committee will meet again 
before school starts to dis-
cuss state safety require-
ments and any needs that 
have to be met before stu-
dents are on campus again.

BY MADELYN EDWARDS
madelyn@azlenews.net 

Reno Police Chief Scott 
Elsner reported an increase 
in calls for service in June.

As of June 20, the Reno 
Police Department received 
527 calls in June, accord-
ing to Elsner’s report to city 
council last month. Elsner 
described this as an increase 
from May, which he attrib-
uted to kids being out of 
school for the summer. 

“Summer typically brings 
more investigative calls as 
kids are out of school and 
are staying out later. Calls 
for service always go up 
during the summer months 
and there are a lot of reasons 
for this,” Deputy Chief Na-
than Stringer said. “More 
people tend to be out and 
about more often in the sum-
mer months and college-
age students are typically 
home for the summer. More 
people equals more calls 
for service. This does not 
necessarily mean they are 
committing more crimes. 
Remember, calls for service 
include traffic accidents 
and the like, so an increase 
in call volume could mean 
there’s more vehicles on the 
roads, which can drive call 
volume up.”

The increase also may be 
the result of the police de-
partment’s move to provide 
24-hour service, Stringer 

Reno calls for 
service up in June, 
police chief reports

said.  
By the end of June, Reno 

police officers responded to 
587 calls for service, String-
er said, which is slightly 
more than the average of 
about 580 calls per month 
though call volume varies 
throughout the year. The 
monthly figure refers to all 
types of police activity in 
June, both officer-initiated 
and the public calling for 
police service. 

Out of all police activi-
ties, the most common one 
is traffic stops, Stringer said. 
In terms of calls from the 
public, the category with 
the highest call volume was 
disturbances, which includes 
calls regarding assault, sexu-
al assault, child in need of su-
pervision, civil disturbances, 
domestic disturbances, fight 
in progress, and person with 
weapons calls. 

Three arrests were made 
in June as a result of ser-
vice calls, not including ar-
rests made on traffic stops 
for other agency’s warrants, 
Stringer said.

Animal control calls have 
increased as well, Elsner 
reported at the June council 
meeting. The animal con-
trol officer, a position estab-
lished this year, has received 
eight to 10 calls per month in 
the previous month. Stringer 
said the animal control offi-
cer had 19 calls by the end 
of June. 

The chief also gave an 
update on the department’s 
progress on closing old cas-
es. Elsner said there were 
over 100 open cases when 
he started his position in No-
vember. 

“It was from a report man-
agement system that hadn’t 
been maintained properly in 
quite some time, and it was 
also an aging system, and it 
was starting to shut down on 
us whenever we were trying 
to pull up case files,” Elsner 
said. 

Stringer said the backlog 
of open cases is relatively 
current.  

Some of the cases had 
been open since 2004, El-
sner said. 

Detective Brandy Bennett 
said some of the cases had 
been solved, but the cases 
hadn’t been closed. Other 
cases had investigative work 
that needed to be done. 

Bennett said the depart-
ment’s work to close the cas-
es had a positive response 
from the residents involved 
in these cases, some of 
whom assumed they would 
never get closure. 

“They don’t know, so as 
far as they’re concerned, no-
body is working on it,” she 
said. “We communicated 
very well and contacted ev-
erybody that had an open 
case that we needed to. We 
got a lot of positive response 
from that.”

Azle Lions Club backpack 
sale starts July 23
FROM STAFF REPORTS

 The Azle Lions Club 
will soon hold its an-
nual backpack fundraiser, 
which  sells backpacks 
full of Azle ISD school 
supplies. 

Money raised helps the 
organization purchase 
backpacks and supplies to 
hand out for free to needy 
district students.

The sale will run from 8 
a.m. to 2 p.m. for three Sat-
urdays in a row - July 23, 30 
and Aug. 6 - at One Azle, 
412 Commerce St., across 
from the post office.

Backpacks for PPCD 
and pre-K students will be 
$60; for K-4 students, the 
price is $75; and fifth and 
sixth grade backpacks are 
$90.

Each backpack contains 
all of the requested supplies 
for that grade level.

Free backpacks are not 
distributed during the 
event. They are handed 
out by the schools.

For more information 
about the sale or about Li-
ons Club in Azle, call Kathy 
at 817-237-8484 or Rebec-
ca at 817-689-7232.

Quilter’s Guild of Parker 
County to meet next week
FROM STAFF REPORTS

The Quilter’s Guild of 
Parker County next month-
ly meeting will be July 21. 

The guild will meet in-
person and via Zoom at 
Lakeshore Drive Baptist 
Church, 200 S. Lakeshore 
Drive in Hudson Oaks. The 
meeting begins at 6:45 p.m. 
but attendees are encour-
aged to come earlier to so-
cialize. 

The program this month 
will be speaker Melinda 

Stanton. Stanton has taught 
several classes for quilt 
guilds across the U.S. She 
loves to introduce quil-
ters to the fine art of Eng-
lish Paper Piecing. Stanton 
will show interested quil-
ters how to tame this chal-
lenge with the Lucy Boston 
Patchwork of the Crosses 
block. She will also be lead-
ing a workshop on July 22 
teaching the basics of Eng-
lish Paper Piecing including 
choosing fabric, fussy cut-

ting and putting it together. 
Those who are interested in 
the workshop should con-
tact the guild to sign up. 

Visitors are welcome in-
person and online. Attend-
ees who are planning to at-
tend online must email their 
name and telephone number 
to qgpc2000@gmail.com. 

To learn more about the 
guild, visit its website quil-
tersguildofparkercounty.org 
or find the guild on Face-
book.
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Attention Seniors!
Did you know Medicare will help pay for your eye exam?

Dr. Jeffrey R. Crabtree

6921  Fos te r  D r. Lake  Wor th ,  TX  76135

www.lakewortheye.com •฀817-439-9455

Call 

Today!
Call 

Today!

416 Commerce St., Ste 3, Azle • 817-612-0074

Follow us onFollow us onFollow us onFollow us on

$999 2 Medium Original™ 
2 Topping/Specialty/Premier Pizzas

MUST BUY 2 PIZZAS

2 MEDIUM PIZZAS

WGD
whiskey golf delta

Shaye Hogle Hogye Hogle

HOGLE
Insurance Group

167 W. Main • 817-444-6389
www.HogleInsurance.com 

“Our Best Policy is Personal Service”

Life Insurance
NO MEDICAL EXAM UP TO $250,000.00

Term and Permanent Policies 
Guaranteed Premiums and Death Benefit 

Company based in Fort Worth, Texas

$10,000 Minimum Deposit

4.50% 60 Month 
Rate Guarantee 3.65% 36 Month 

Rate Guarantee

Azle Arts Popcorn Players Presents

FOR RESERVATIONS: TICKETSTOTHECITY.COM

1012 SE Pkwy, Azle 817-238-PLAY

July 
22-24, 29-31

Friday and 

Saturday 7:30 PM 

Sunday 2:30 PM

$15 Adults
$12 Seniors/Students
$10 Sunday Matinee

WRITTEN BY 
BILLY ST. JOHN

Directed by Emily Ball

BY TERRI SCHLICHENMEYER

Dad used to pride himself 

on being handy.

He could make anything, 

imagine anything, fix any-

thing. He was handy, from 

tools to toys and kitchens 

to kids. But last week, Dad 

got lost on his way home 

from the grocery store, a trip 

he’s made once a week for 

30 years, and it scared you 

both. You might imagine 

what’s coming. Find “Living 

in the Moment: Overcoming 

Challenges and Finding Mo-

ments of Joy in Alzheimer’s 

Disease and Other Demen-

tias” by Elizabeth Lands-

verk, MD, with Heather Mil-

lar, and be prepared for it.

So you noticed some 

memory or cognitive issues 

and Dad’s not himself lately. 

How do you know if this 

new behavior is eccentricity 

or early dementia? Is this a 

normal sign of aging, or is 

it outside of normal?  What 

kind of dementia might he 

suffer from, and to what de-

gree? You’ll want to get an 

Insight and solutions for managing the challenges of dementia

BOOK REVIEW

official diagnosis, so you 
know what to do in the fu-

ture, and why. 

The first thing to know 
about what Dad’s going 

through is that dementia 

doesn’t mean “It’s all over.” 

There’s still plenty of life 

ahead for you both, perhaps 

for many years to come.

Next, remember that your 
loved one isn’t “trying to be 

difficult.” Their wild out-of-
the-ordinary behavior can’t 

be helped, and the disease 

is “so uncertain, so uneven.” 

There are many possible 

ways to deal with forgetful-

ness, frustration, anger, and 

acting out, and there are 

things to avoid. Says Lands-

verk, solutions can some-

times be pleasant, even de-

lightful.

Because Alzheimer’s and 

dementia cannot be cured, 

have a plan in place for your 

loved one’s care but review 

it often. Things will change 

as time and the disease pro-

gresses, so be willing to look 

at “the bigger picture.” That 

includes thinking about end-

of-life issues, power of at-

torney papers, and legal and 

financial protections for the 
long-term.

Watch for scams; there are 

too many people who prey 

on our vulnerable seniors. 

Encourage physical activ-

ity, a good diet, and as much 

autonomy as currently pos-

sible. Learn how to craft a 

work-around for the easier-

to-deal-with issues. And re-

member that “it takes a vil-

lage to care for an elder with 

dementia” and “you are not 

alone.”

The sand is not your 

friend.

It’s certainly not where 

you want to stick your head 

when a loved one shows 

signs of dementia because 

that life’s not a beach. No, 

it’s manageable, and “Living 

in the Moment” can help.

Though it’s perhaps not as 

comprehensive as you may 

want later, author Lands-

verk (with author Millar) 

says in her introduction that 

she wanted this book to be 

easy to use. She succeeded, 

with a broad overview of 

the basics, things to know 

now, medicines that will 

and won’t work, problems 

to watch out for, and what to 

ready yourself for in the fu-

ture. The case studies inside 

this book are strong and are 

scary enough to spur quick 

action, and they’re balanced 

with quiet paragraphs of 

comfort.

This book is great for 

caregivers, but it’s also an 

essential read for anyone 

who’s in any way related 

to a dementia patient. Find 

“Living in the Moment” and 

keep it handy.

“Living in the Moment: Over-

coming Challenges and Finding 

Moments of Joy in Alzheimer’s 

Disease and Other Dementias” 

by Elizabeth Landsverk, MD with 

Heather Millar

c.2022, Citadel, $16.95, 288 

pages
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Obituaries

Azle฀•฀Springtown฀•฀Mineral฀Wells฀•฀Weatherford฀
817-444-3211฀•฀www.whitesfuneral.com

Our family serving your family since 1908

Full Service
Funeral Home

Cremation
Services

Pre-Need
Plans

Bob White,
Anita White
and Zack Bellenger

A church alive is worth the drive! For more information or rates on listing your church, call Johnna at 817-270-3340

THE ABBEY CHURCH 
Pastor: Paul Brownback 

10400 Jacksboro Highway 
817-238-1404  

www.TheAbbeyChurch.com 
Morning Worship ���������������������������10:30 AM 
Community Groups ��������������� Various Times

ASH CREEK BAPTIST CHURCH 
Pastor: Dr� G� Wesley Shotwell 

300 South Stewart St� 817-444-3219 
www.ashcreekbc.org 

Sunday School ��������������������������������9:30 AM 
Contemporary Worship-TMP ���������10:45 AM 
Traditional Worship  ����������������������10:45 AM 
Evening Worship �����������������������������6:00 PM 
Wednesday Youth Refuge ����������������6:00 PM 
Wednesday Evening ������������������������6:15 PM

AZLE CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
(Disciples of Christ) Senior Minister, Ashley 

Dargai, Katie Medlin, Worship Minister 
117 Church St� • 817-444-3527 

Sunday School ������������������������������10:00 AM 
Morning Worship ���������������������������11:00 AM 

AZLE FIRST ASSEMBLY of GOD 
Pastor: Tim Stevens 

1020 S�E� Parkway, Azle 817-237-4903 
Sunday School ��������������������������������9:30 AM 
Morning Worship ���������������������������10:30 AM 
 Wednesday Evening �����������������������7:00 PM

COMMUNITY BIBLE 

FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 
Pastor - Alton Davis 817-521-4510 

1405 Reynolds Rd�, Azle 817-444-7117 
Directions: 730 N� to 1542 �5 mi� right  

on Cardinal, left on Reynolds 
Sunday School ��������������������������������9:45 AM 
Morning Worship ���������������������������11:00 AM 
Sunday Evening ������������������������������6:00 PM 
Wednesday Evening ������������������������7:00 PM

CORNERSTONE COMMUNITY CHURCH 
2233 Hwy 199 E� • Springtown 

817-221-LIFE (5433)  
Sunday Worship Service  �������10:00 AM 
Wednesday   ����������������������������7:00 PM

CROSSROADS BAPTIST CHURCH 
Pastor - Jon Baker 

Corner FM 730S & FM 1886 
817-755-0279 

Transportation Available 
Worship Service ����������������������������10:30 AM 
Wed� Prayer Service ������������������������7:00 PM

THE EDGE CHURCH - AZLE 
1313 S�E� Pkwy, Azle 817-237-4822 

Missouri Synod 
“Love God - Serve Others - Share Jesus” 

Traditional Worship �������������������������9:30 AM 
Contemporary Worship������������������11:00 AM

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
Pastor: Dr� Richard Reed 

200 Church St�, Azle 817-444-3323 
Morn� Worship ���������������8:30, 9:45 & 11 AM 
Sunday School ������������������������9:45 & 11 AM 
Youth (UMYF) ����5:00 PM Sun & 6:30 PM Wed

HOLY TRINITY CATHOLIC CHURCH 

800 Highcrest Dr� -  Azle 817-444-3063 
Saturday �����������������������������������������5:00 PM 
Sunday �������������������������������������������9:00 AM 
Sunday �������������������������������11 AM (Spanish) 
Daily Mass (M, T, Th, F) �������������������8:00 AM 
Wednesday Mass Religious ED �������6:30 PM 

Confessions �����������������������������������Sat 4 PM

HOPE LUTHERAN CHURCH ELCA 
4795 E� Hwy 199 - Reno 817-221-HOPE 

Follow us on Facebook for streaming 
services 

Sunday School ��������������������������������9:00 AM 
Traditional Service ������������������������10:00 AM

SOLID ROCK BIBLE CHURCH 
591 S� Reno Rd, , Springtown, Texas 76082 

Pastor - Bill Gay - 817-304-7443 
Coffee and Donuts ��������������������������9:00 AM 
Sunday School ��������������������������������9:30 AM 
Morning Worship ���������������������������10:30 AM 

Children’s Church After Music Service 
Wed� Prayer Meeting �����������������������6:30 PM 
Wed� Bible Study �����������������������������7:00 PM

LEGACY CHURCH 

Assembly of God Church 

Pastor: Gary D� Veazey 

Hwy� 199 & Jaybird Lane 

817-221-2983 

Morning Worship ����������������9:15 & 11:00 AM 

Kidz Zone���������������������������9:15 & 11:00 AM 

Weds Evening Legacy Group Legacy Youth, Kids  

All Services �������������������������������������7:00 PM

SILVER CREEK 

UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev� Sheila Fiorella - Pastor 

2200 Church Rd�, Azle 817-444-1382 

www.silvercreekumc.org 

Sunday School 9:30 AM • Worship 10:30 AM

SILVER CREEK BAPTIST CHURCH 

Pastor:  Jay Ditty   

Minister of Music: David Musick 

Corner FM 730 S� & Veal Station Rd� 

Church 817-444-2325  

www.silvercreekbc.org  

Sunday School �������������������������������9:45  AM 

Morning Worship ���������������������������10:50 AM 

Evening Worship �����������������������������6:00 PM 

Wed� Prayer Service ������������������������7:00 PM

THE WORD@LAKESIDE CHURCH OF GOD 

9396 FM 1886 Fort Worth, TX 76135 

817-237-5500 

thewordatlakeside�com 

Pastors: Brandon and Kelly Bohannon 

Worship Pastor: Christen Moody 

Family Life and Young Adult Pastors: Jodie 

and Mark James, Kids Pastor: Katie Pearson, 

Student Pastors: Taylor and Sheridan 

Tomlin, Creative Directors: Logan and Carrie 

Edwards, Connections Coordinators: 

Preston and Ashley Larrew

Equip Sunday School at the WORD 9:30 AM 

Empower Worship at the WORD � 10:45 AM 

Kids at the WORD����������������������� 10:45 AM 

PreK at the WORD ���������������������� 10:45 AM 

Emanate at the WORD  

(Special Needs Ministry) ������������ 10:45 AM 

Nursery at the WORD ����������������� 10:45 AM 

Young Adults at the WORD ����������� 6:00 PM

Wednesdays 

Adult Bible Class ���������������������������7:00 PM 

The WORD Students (6th-12th grades) 6:30 

PM 

Awana Kids at the WORD  �������������6:30 PM 

Life at the WORD Life Groups Various Times

... ATTEND THE CHURCH OF YOUR CHOICE THIS SUNDAY

James R. Plowman 

Norma Plowman

913 N. Elm St.  
Weatherford, TX 76086

www.galbreaithpickard.com

1-800-593-2747

817-594-2747฀•฀Fax฀817-596-7803

COMMERCIAL & RESIDENTIAL

A/C TUNEUP $55
NOW HIRING! 

11345 FM 730N
Azle 817-696-6421
Owner Kenny Bates 817-361-3695

GET READY FOR SUMMER!

The Azle News, 
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William “Fred” Steinly 
1929 - 2022

William Freddie “Fred” 

Steinly, 93, of Azle, Texas, 

entered into his eternal rest 

on Friday, July 1, 2022 in 

Azle, Texas.

Visitation will be from 4 

- 8 p.m. on Thursday, July 

14, 2022 at Shannon Rose 

Hill Funeral Home in Fort 

Worth, Texas. Funeral ser-

vices will be held on Friday, 

July 15, 2022 at 10 a.m. at 

Shannon Rose Hill Funeral 

Home with Pastor Thomas 

Kolb, officiating. Burial will 
follow at Isham Cemetery 

at 11:15 a.m. Arrangements 
are made by Shannon Hill 

Funeral Home.

 Fred was born in Carn-

egie, Oklahoma to Fred 
and Dola Steinly on March 

2, 1929. He married Min-

nie Bolton on April 2, 1948 
in Fort Worth, Texas. He 

worked as a master of many 
trades throughout his life-

time. He was a veteran of the 

Korean war and served in the 

Army. He was involved in 

the American Legion, VFW, 
and many Musical Venues. 

He is most widely known for 
his legendary fiddle playing. 

 Fred is preceded in death 

by his parents Fred and Dola 

Steinly, son Rickey Wayne, 
and siblings Shirley, Irma, 
Dorita, LaVae, Lew, and 

Movita. 

 Fred is survived by his 

wife of 74 years, Minnie 

Steinly, his children, Freddie 

Steinly and spouse Vivian, 

Jemmie Steinly and spouse 

Terry, and Jack Russell 
Steinly and spouse Sherry; 

his sisters, Rhonda and 

Deanna; seven grandchil-
dren and 11 great-grandchil-
dren. 

 The Steinly family wishes 

to extend our sincere thanks 
to the nurses and staff of 
Solaris Hospice and Pastor 

Thomas Kolb.

Russell Curtis Posey 
1956  - 2022

Russell Curtis Posey, 65, 

passed away July 9, 2022 in 

Alexandria, Louisiana.

Funeral is at 11 a.m. 

Wednesday at Alexander’s 

Midway Springtown. Visi-
tation from 10 to 11 a.m. 

Wednesday.

Russell was born Oct. 6, 
1956 in Columbia, Loui-

siana to Curtis Lee Posey 

Jr. and Virginia Lea (Rus-

sell) Posey Nelson. Russell 

was a skilled tradesman and 
enjoyed working with his 
hands. He was an outdoors-

man who enjoyed fishing, 
and spending time with fam-

ily. 

Russell was a loving son, 
brother, and uncle who will 

be dearly missed by all who 

knew him. 
 Russell was preceded in 

death by his father, Curtis 

Posey Jr.

 He is survived by his 

mother Virginia (Russell) 
Nelson; sisters, Lisa Cash 

and her husband Cecil and 

Cathy Blackwell along with 
numerous nieces and neph-

ews.

The Azle News, 
July 13, 2022 Edition

FROM STAFF REPORTS

The Azle Area Ministerial 

Alliance presents the Lew & 

Sandy Shaffer Award each 
year at its annual Follow the 

Flag event on July 4, and 
this year’s award went to 

David and Daniele Shaffer.
Besides awarding schol-

arships, this is the only other 

award given by the AAMA, 
according to a news release 
from the ministerial alli-

ance. Started in 2012, the 

award highlights a person 
or couple who has consis-

tently exhibited Christian 

leadership while serving 
the community in a variety 

of roles. The recipients are 

selected by a committee of 

prior award winners. 

The award is named af-

ter Lew and Sandy Shaffer, 
who co-founded Son Shine 

Ministries in 1977 with Ted 

and Barbara Platt. It recog-

nizes the challenges Lew 
and Sandy overcame af-

ter Lew suffered a massive 
stroke at the age of 49, and 
honors how they as a couple 

expressed the love of Christ 

to all they encountered, the 

release stated.

David took over the reins 
of Son Shine Ministries 

Ministerial Alliance recognizes Shaffers
from his late father, Lew 

Shaffer, and Ted Platt in 
2002. He and Daniele have 

been active in the Azle com-

munity and throughout the 
Metroplex since the 1980s, 

the release stated. Local 

involvement has included 

AAMA membership and 

board service, Chamber 

membership and Board and 
Ambassador service, mar-

riage and family ministry in 
area churches and directly 

with couples, and regular 
parental engagement with 
Azle ISD as parents of two 

boys who began at Sil-
ver Creek Elementary and 
continued on through Azle 
High School before heading 
to Texas A&M.

David and Daniele were 

in Germany visiting her 
family at the time of Fol-

low the Flag but expressed 
their gratitude in a state-

ment that was read at the 

event: “Daniele and I are 

deeply honored to receive 

this year’s Lew & Sandy 

Shaffer Award. We love this 
community and enjoy shar-

ing Jesus and equipping 
families through our work 
in Son Shine Ministries. We 

also love the people associ-

ated with this award and are 

blessed to be connected in 

this unique way. We are sor-
ry to miss this year’s Follow 

the Flag but are there with 
you in spirit. Thank you for 
this special award. It means 

a great deal to us.”

FROM STAFF REPORTS

Upper Trinity Groundwa-

ter Conservation District’s 

hearing and regular board 
meeting are set for 5 p.m. 
July 18 at the district office 
at 1859 W. Highway 199 
in Springtown or via Zoom 
videoconference, a UTGCD 

news release stated. 

In addition to the regu-

lar board meeting agenda, 
which begins at conclusion 
of Public Hearing, another 
item of interest includes a 

public hearing regarding 

UTGCD to hold hearing, board meeting
multiple applications for an 

operating permit for three 
commercial water systems 

in Parker County.
The public is welcome 

and encouraged to remotely 
attend via online videocon-

ference/teleconference. Join 

Zoom meeting by accessing  

us02web�zoom�

us/j/82018726507 

1 (346) 248-7799 – US 

Meeting ID: 820 1872 6507

The mission of UTGCD, 

established in November 

2007, is to develop rules to 

“provide protection to ex-

isting wells, prevent waste, 
promote conservation, pro-

vide a framework that will 
allow availability and acces-

sibility of groundwater for 
future generations, protect 
the quality of the ground-

water in the recharge zone 
of the aquifer, ensure that 
the residents of Montague, 
Wise, Parker, and Hood 
Counties maintain local 

control over their ground-

water, respect and protect 

the property rights of land-

owners in groundwater, and 
operate the District in a fair 

and equitable manner for all 
residents of the District,” 

the release stated.

For more information 

about UTGCD, includ-

ing meeting dates and well 
registration forms, visit its 
website at www.uppertrini-

tygcd.com or call the Dis-

trict’s office in Springtown, 
817-523-5200.

David and Daniele Shaffer while in Germany this summer visiting 

Daniele’s family� Courtesy photo
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FAMILY OWNED AND OPERATED FOR 20 YEARS

State Inspection for Tarrant & Parker Counties

Automotive

• Tune-ups

• Diesel

•  Suspension 

Computer 

Diagnostics

• A/C Repair

• Brakes

• Emission Repairs

•  Repair & Restore 

Classic Cars

Motorcycles 

& ATVs

•  Maintenance & 

Repairs

• Dirt Bike Parts 

PACKAGE
DROP OFF 
STATION

Motley’s AUTOMOTIVE & 
MOTORCYCLES

817-444-8529
817-456-0907

Monday - Friday 

8:30 am - 6:00 pm

Kerry Lane
Kerry Lane

NW Pkwy Hwy 199

Service Rd

Jackson Tr.

W
estline Rd.

1304 NW Pkwy (Hwy 199) 
www.motleyautomotive.com

Specializing in Residential & 

Commercial Makeready & Restorations

Interior Services:
• Demo & Renos

•  Plumbing Fixture Repair & Installation

• Sheetrock Repair/Replacement

• Interior Painting

•  Door/Hardware Repair 

& Replacement

Family Owned & Operated

GET FREE CONSULTATION

682-302-5501
Se Habla Español

Email: info@tpg1.net

www.tpg1.net

SERVICES
•  Residential and Commercial Roofing
•  Kitchen and Bathroom Remodeling
•  Outdoor stair wells, fences and carpentry
•  Door and window installation
• Plumbing
• Hardwood and Tile Flooring
• New custom construction
• Hail & insurance claims
•  Post and beam farm homes
•  Outdoor kitchen, deck trellis, fire pit & waterfalls

StrongStrong
Construction

& Hail Claims

866-222-2311
Nelson Bran, Project Manager 

www.strongconstr.com

Cowtown Home Center specializes in 

helping people get into affordable homes. 
With the market exploding in DFW, our 
homes and prices are hard to beat!

We currently partner with six different 
builders who are experts at what they do. 
One thing we do not do is partner with 
any builder who only builds to minimum 
requirements.

We offer singlewides and doublewides 
that range from two bedrooms, two baths 
all the way up to five bedrooms, three baths, 
and are anywhere from 900 sq ft to 2,400 sq 
ft. Prices start as low as $79,990.

All of our homes come with “Holy Cow 
Pricing,” a package that includes delivery 
up to 250 miles from the office, completion 
of your home by trained craftsmen, two 
sets of steps, air conditioning installed by 
licensed contractors, appliance package, 
walkthrough and home orientation and final 
cleaning before you move in. Plus, lifetime 
warranty at no extra cost!

Home consultants John, Jay, Josue and 
Tim will help you select the home that 
meets your needs. Nikki, our customer 
care coordinator, oversees the delivery and 
move-in process. Derek is our construction 
manager who oversees the entire build pro-

cess of your home. Denise Boschetti takes 
care of all of our customers’ finance and 
title documents.

We are a local family-owned business 
that does not have a corporate structure 
with layers of managers vying for a pay day.

Instead of higher prices, we pass the sav-
ings onto our customers. Our houses are 
at least $10,000 less expensive than our 
competitors.

Hassle-free homebuying is how we op-
erate. We start by giving you all the facts 
upfront and all of our pricing is on our 
website and Facebook page. No pressure, 
no gimmicks. 

We want to help our customers make the 
best homebuying decision. If we can help 
educate them to make a better decision, then 
we’ve done our job.

Come see us at 9000 Jacksboro Hwy. 
Fort Worth, 76135 or visit our website 

www.cowtownhomecenter.com. We’re 
open Monday through Friday 8 a.m. to 6 
p.m. and Saturday 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Call 
817-200-7010 for more information or to 
schedule an appointment.

Mention our ads in the Azle News or 
Springtown Epigraph to receive a $500 
discount towards your new home!

Cowtown Home Center
Hassle-free homebuying is our motto.

Visit our website www.cowtownhomecenter.com or come see us at 9000 Jacksboro Hwy., 

Fort Worth, TX 76135. We’re open Monday through Friday 8 a.m. to 6 p.m. and Saturday 9 a.m. 

to 5 p.m. Call 817-200-7010 for more information or to schedule an appointment.

PEOPLE ARE WHAT MAKE 

AMERICA GREAT

What a day! The Eagle 

Mountain Shrine Club par-

ticipated in the Granbury, 

Texas, parade on July 4. 

What an event! Thousands 

upon thousands of people 

lined both sides of the pa-

rade street and town square.

Our Shrine parade wagon 

was loaded with Shriners, 

Shrine clowns and family 

members. We were the last 

LETTER TO THE EDITOR
wagon in the parade. We 

waited over an hour before 

we entered the parade.  

As we entered the parade 

street, what a sight to see. 

Men, women and children 

dressed up in the stars and 

stripes. Smiles, hand waves 

and thumbs up. Lawn chairs, 

shade tents and tables set 

up. They had been there for 

hours waiting for the parade 

to start.

As I sat on the wagon 

bench and as it slowly 

moved down the street, 

I thought, “What makes 

America great?” I thought of 

many things, but the answer 

was always the same: “The 

people of America make 

America great.” 

What a happy sight! 

America has always been 

great from July 4, 1776, to 

today, July 4, 2022. Why? 

The people – you and me.

Bobby R. Sloan, Azle 

Is it because I’m older or 

is it really hotter than it used 

to be?

I told Mrs. Sweetie yester-

day that I think summer hi-

bernation should be a thing 

in our neck of the woods. 

Just stay inside and sleep 

under the ceiling fan until 

November.

Every time I walk out my 

front door, I start doubting 

all my life choices. Well, 

maybe not all of them – just 

the ones that involve any-

thing outside.

And this heat is making 

everyone act crazy.

Or maybe I’m so hot and 

grumpy and impatient that it 

just seems like they’re act-

BE AMAZING
By Gerry Lewis

Azle resident Dr. Gerry Lewis guides explorers to discover their AMAZING. 

He is an author, musician, and speaker, and a coach-sultant for individuals, 

churches, and organizations. More at www.discoveryouramazing.com.

Cool it! I’m not kidding! 

ing crazy.

I get up in the morning 

with plans for what I hope to 

accomplish and then I walk 

out the door and … “Nope!”

Can we all – including the 

weather – just cool it?

OK, rant over.

I’m 99% certain (holding 

desperately to that unrealis-

tic 1% dream) that there is 

nothing I can do to control 

this Texas summer heat.

I’m equally certain that 

summer hibernation is not a 

viable option.

And if there is any truth to 

the idea that I may be feel-

ing it more at 60 than I felt 

it at younger ages – and I 

suspect there is a measure 

of truth there – turning back 

the clock is neither an option 

nor a preference.

I guess I’m just going to 

have to bring my own inter-

nal coolness with me.

What’s internal coolness? 

I’m glad you asked.

It’s choosing patience 

when everything around is a 

hot mess.

It’s choosing kindness 

when tempers are overheat-

ing.

It’s choosing to cre-

ate emotional and spiri-

tual shade for others – not 

“throwing shade” but being 

safe and letting people rest 

and be refreshed in our pres-

ence.

Proverbs 11:25 says, “A 

generous person will pros-

per; whoever refreshes oth-

ers will be refreshed.”

That doesn’t mean that our 

generosity is simply a means 

for our own benefit or that 

we are really serving our-

selves when create refresh-

ing shade for others.

It means that being part 

of God’s work through gen-

erously sharing refreshing 

“shade” is to participate in 

a community of refreshment 

where God multiplies the 

supply to meet the need in 

ways that often surprise us.

Take a minute right now 

and try to remember a time 

when someone – maybe 

someone you didn’t even 

know – provided you a mo-

mentary unexpected respite.

Maybe it was a smile and 

a kind word that was just at 

the right time.

Maybe someone held the 

door for you when your 

hands were full or stopped to 

help you pick up something 

you dropped.

Maybe someone let you 

get ahead of them in the 

checkout line.

Maybe someone sent you 

a card, text or email just 

to let you know they were 

thinking about you.

Shade.

Refreshing.

Coolness.

Now think about how you 

could do that for someone 

else. Watch for opportunities 

over the next few days.

Cool it.

Be amazing today, my 

friend.

through July 5 in an effort 
to curb the number of fires 
that would be sparked by 

residents setting off fire-

works at home.

But the order did not pre-

vent many holiday revelers 

from setting off fireworks 
anyway.

Azle Fire Chief Will 

Scott said that his depart-

ment responded to eight 

fireworks-related calls for 
service during the holiday 

FIRE DANGERS, CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1A.

weekend.

Moses Druxman, the fire 
marshal and chief for Briar-

Reno Fire Department, said 

that his department also 

stayed busy during that 

weekend.

“During the holiday 

weekend, we had the fol-

lowing: 22 firework vio-

lations in Pelican Bay; 

15 firework violations in 
Reno; four firework viola-

tions in Sanctuary; 45 fire-

work violations in North-

east Parker County as a part 

of the Parker County Fire 

Marshal’s Office; 18 EMS 
calls, three major accidents 

with injuries, five fire re-

lated incidents,” Druxman 

said.

On July 1, the Parker 

County Commissioners 

Court approved an exten-

sion to the fireworks prohi-
bition that extends through 

Sept. 6.
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AAZLEZLE A AREAREA  CLUBSCLUBS

AND AND OORGANIZATIONSRGANIZATIONS

Rotary
Club 

of Azle

MEETS AT NOON 
THURSDAY

412 Commerce St. 
(across from Azle Post Office)

Optimist
Club of Azle

Meets every 
FRIDAY at 6:45 AM

Moe’s Country Kitchen 
316 W. Main, Azle

Daily meetings at Noon & 6:30 pm 
Sunday at 3 pm

229 S. Stewart St. • Azle
817-332-3533

Faced with a 
DRINKING Problem?

Perhaps Alcoholics Anonymous can HELP.

Post your clubs or 
organization 

meetings here!

Only $100 
for 52 weeks of 

advertising

Call Johnna for details:

817-270-3340

Azle Boy Scout 

Troop 243
Meets Mondays 7 PM

Azle First Assembly of God

1020 Southeast Parkway

troop243azle.org

Eagle 
Mountain 
Pregnancy 
Help Center

10328 Jacksboro Hwy
Fort Worth TX 76135

817-237-1819
www.emphc.org

Mon 12-6 PM Thurs 12-6 PM

SE HABLA ESPAÑOL

Addiction wants to destroy 
you & everyone around you.

The Finish Line

With Jesus there 
is Victory over 
addiction.

GET BACK IN 

THE RACE!

Meetings held every Friday from

7:30PM-9:30PM at The Church at Azle

1801 S. Stewart • Azle • 817-401-8513 

www.ourfinishline.com

Floor School or Work 
7:30 PM 

THURSDAY NIGHT

Chris Akers - Worshipful Master

Rocky Gralla - Secretary

Clint Hall - Treasurer

Azle Lodge

No. 601

817-444-2300
412 Commerce St.

Volunteer Caregiver 
Training Classes

Classes open to 
public at no charge

Good N.E.W.S.

Our 
Volunteers 

Make a 
Difference!

Caregiver Volunteer Meeting
1st Monday of 

Each Month at 6pm

Living at Home Block Nurse Program

Meets 2nd TUESDAY 6:30 PM 

412 Commerce, Azle 
e-clubhouse.org/sites/azle_tk/

Curren McLane - president 

817-689-0074

Azle Lion’s Club

Volunteers Needed 

TexasHealth.org/ 
Volunteer/Our-Process

RAINBOW INN GIFT SHOP 
Inside Hospital 108 Denver Trail 

Azle 817-444-8651

ATTIC RERUNS 
NOW OPEN! FRI 9-4 SAT 9-1 
714 SE Pkwy Azle 817-270-3690

IN THE CLARK SUPERIOR COURT NO. 5

STATE OF INDIANA 

IN RE: THE MARRIAGE OF:  WILFREDO D. ALVARADO, Petitioner, and ASHLEY N. 
ALVARADO (a/k/a ASHLEY N. WILKERSON) Respondent. Case No. 10D05-2109-DC-451  
SUMMONS BY PUBLICATION TO: ASHLEY N. ALVARADO A/K/A ASHLEY N.  WILKERSON 
Whereabouts Unknown The STATE OF INDIANA to the above-named individual as 
Respondent, and any other persons who may be concerned.  YOU ARE HEREBY NOTIFIED 
that a Verified Petition to Enter Permanent Custody Order has been filed in the Clark 
Superior Court No. 5 by WILFREDO D. ALVARADO as Petitioner, naming you as Respondent-
Mother and requesting that the Court enter a permanent custody order with respect 
to your two children, S.A.P.A and G.M.G.A. This Summons by Publication is specifically 
directed to ASHLEY N. ALVARADO a/k/a ASHLEY N. WILKERSON, whose whereabouts are 
unknown, and you are hereby notified that you must respond in writing, personally, or by 
your attorney, within thirty (30) days of the last publication of this and in the event that you 
fail to do so, judgment by default may be entered against you for the relief requested in the 
aforementioned pleadings.  Prepared by: A. David Hutson, #28616-22 6200 E. Hwy 62, Suite 
660 Jeffersonville, Indiana 47130

Telephone: (812) 206-5905 Fax:  (866) 932-5315 Email:  david@hutsonlegal.com

Attest: Clerk, Clark Circuit Courts, Dated: June 21, 2022.  

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

The Zoning Board of Adjustment for the City of Azle will conduct a public hearing 
on Thursday, July 28, 2022, to consider a variance request to Section 2 (3) Setback 
Requirements of the City of Azle Ordinance No. 388 for the property located at 1905 
Spinnaker Lane, and also known as Lot 116, Block 1, Oak Harbor Estates Addition, an 
addition to the City of Azle, Tarrant County, Texas. The purpose of the variance is to allow for 
the construction of a new pergola to encroach the minimum five-foot (5’) side yard setback. 
The meeting will begin at 6:00 P.M. in the City Council Chambers located at 505 W. Main, 
Azle, Texas. 

LEGAL PUBLIC NOTICES

BY JESSICA MCKINNEY

azlereporter@azlenews.net

Mike and D’Andra David-

son thought a lot about what 

they wanted to do with their 

10-acre property on the west 

side of Azle over a decade 

ago. 

While looking at wedding 

venues with their daughter, 

picturing what the perfect 

event space would look 

like, that’s when inspiration 

struck.

The Davidsons opened 

the Orchard Event Venue 

and Retreat in 2011. It has 

seen hundreds of weddings, 

fundraisers, appreciation 

banquets and more over the 

years. Now, it is time for 

them to say goodbye to the 

place they built.

“It’s bittersweet, but it was 

time,” D’Andra said.

As of the end of June, The 

Orchard is under new own-

ership through a company 

The Orchard Event center 
under new ownership

called Unity Venture out of 

Ohio.

“(The new owner) said, ‘I 

want to leave it just as it is,’” 

D’Andra said. “So we were 

happy about that.”

The new owner has plans 

to make changes that the Da-

vidsons “had wanted to do 

for a long time,” including 

enclosing the open-air pavil-

ion so it can be used more.

Even though the new own-

ers are not local, the David-

sons are confident that they 
will keep operations going 

the same direction that they 

did. The current staff at The 
Orchard will remain and 

handle the day-to-day opera-

tions of the venue.

“The proof’s in the pud-

ding,” Mike said. “We’ll see 

what happens when it actu-

ally comes about, but I think 

they will (keep things the 

same).”

Mike will stay busy with 

his construction business, 

ProBuild, and said that they 

are “ready for some more 

things.”

“Yeah, we’re going to 

refill (that time) now,” 
D’Andra said. The couple 

wants to include travel plans 

in the future, as well as plen-

ty of time spent with their 

kids and grandkids.

The Davidsons are sad to 

say goodbye to the venue 

but are thankful for the com-

munity that helped it grow.

“We would like to thank 

the entire community of 

Azle for all their support 

and guidance,” Mike said. 

“We kept all of our busi-

ness locally. … Everybody 

has been so helpful, and it’s 

been a great relationship for 

sure.”

For more information 

about The Orchard Event 

Venue and Retreat, visit 

www.theorchardtx.com, or 

call 817-270-4555.
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•฀Open฀7฀Days
•฀Fast฀Friendly฀Service
•฀Fresh฀Homemade฀Food

425 W. Rock Island Ave.

Hwy 114• Boyd• 940-433-3322

EvEry TuEsday

Dos Chiles 

Grandes Cafe

Dos Chiles 

Grandes Cafe

Two Enchilada Dinners 
& Two Drinks = $15

Professional business Portraits

Commercial Photography 

Drone Photography

Photography Lessons Offered

713-725-5620

817-270-3230 • 817-270-3240

Full Service Mechanic
SMART START CONTRACT SHOP
We install & service alcohol breathalyzers.

704 NW Pkwy, Azle
Open Mon-Fri 9 AM -  PM, Sat 9 AM - 3 PM

 @burrowsauto

Anne Land Real Estate
Land is my name, and real estate is my game.

Anne Land
817-247-5991 Cell

817-220-0633 Office

904 E. Hwy 199, 

Springtown TX

www.AnneLandRealEstate.com

FREE CONSULTATIONS

408 Central Dr., Azle 

817-444-8827
Next to the Drive-thru of PNC Bank

azlenwpt.com

•  Sports, Stroke, Back 

and Neck Rehab

• Post Operation

• Balance Training

• Joint Replacement 

• Return to Work

Over 24 years 
of Experience!

Call Today For Your Appointment

817-444-8025

AIR DUCT CLEANING
•  Clean All 

Supply Vents

• Sanitize

• Return Vents

BRING THIS AD & RECEIVE A FREE SOUVENIR, COURTESY OF VISIT LAREDO!

WCN

Sames
Auto Arena
JULY 15 & 16: 11am–8pm

JULY 17: 10am–5pm

800-361-3360

FREE ADMISSION!

SPONSORED BY

The Texas summer heat 

will stress most anything 

that is subjected to it. We 

generally focus on getting 

our vehicles ready for the 

heat, but many folks will 

overlook their trailers. Many 

of us trailer our boats many 

miles each week. Spending 

a little time on maintenance 

on your trailer can save a big 

bundle down the road. This 

article today covers trailer 

maintenance issues that can 

be applied most any time of 

the year and especially in the 

summer. 

One common failure on 

boat trailers or any trailer is 

the wheel bearings. Wheel 

bearings fail due to insuffi-

cient grease, worn bearings 

or due to water damage. In 

many cases a trailer that is 

not used on a regular basis 

will develop rust pits on the 

bearings which will eventu-

ally lead to failure. A trailer 

that is used more consis-

tently may be less prone to 

pitting provided there is suf-

ficient grease in the hub. 

It’s important to pay attention to details 
involved in summer trailer towing 

ON FISHING

As a licensed professional fishing guide, Michael Acosta 

shows you how to find them. He has been a licensed guide 

since 1998. michael.acosta@att.net

ON FISHING
By Michael Acosta

It is a good idea to rework 

and repack the bearings each 

year. This should keep you 

out of trouble. Make sure 

you refill your bearing pro-

tectors regularly. There are 

many different types of oil 
systems for trailer bearings. 

The idea is to keep water out 

of the bearings.

I usually try to ensure that 

the bearings are full after a 

couple of trips. I also like to 

feel the hub after a long trip 

to see if they’re hot. If they 

are not hot to the touch they 

are probably in good shape. 

If they are hot, you should 

probably replace or repack 

them immediately.

Some of the newer bear-

ing systems even have a 

sight glass to check liquid 

oil levels in the bearings. 

I have found that for most 

trailers, a complete hub with 

new bearings and races is 

just a few dollars more than 

a replacement set of bear-

ings, races and seals. You 

may want to consider pur-

chasing a hub as a backup 

for your trailer especially if 

you trailer long distances. 

Those of you with a single 

axle trailer may want to seri-

ously look into this option.

Trying to replace damaged 

bearing races on the side 

of the road in 100-degree 

weather is definitely not in 
the fun category. Those of 

us with a tandem trailer can 

run on one axle for a short 

time even though it is not 

advisable. It wouldn’t be 

a bad idea to have a spare 

hub for any boat trailer. One 

more thing, don’t overfill 
some bearing protectors as 

they can over pressurize in 

the heat and damage seals or 

pop out seals, allowing wa-

ter to enter more easily. 

As most of you know, 

tires can also fail in the heat. 

Make sure your tires are in 

good shape and properly in-

flated. Blowouts aren’t any 
fun either.

OTHER TRAILER TIPS

Some other tips for traile-

ring include making sure 

that your hitch is rated to 

handle whatever load you 

are pulling. A bumper hitch 

may or may not be suffi-

cient to pull your load. Some 

bumper hitches are only rat-

ed for small loads and trailer 

balls have different ratings. 
For example, a good bumper 

can be rated to pull 5,000 

pounds, but if it only has a 

3,500-pound ball on it, it’s 

only good for 3,500 pounds. 

It is also a good policy to 

make sure that your trailer 

is level when attached to the 

tow vehicle. A trailer that 

is too high in the front may 

sway when running down 

the road. Whatever hitch that 

you do use, make sure that the 

trailer latch is pinned. I use a 

padlock to lock the latch to 

the ball hitch. Make sure your 

safety chains are attached as 

well even on a short trip. Los-

ing a boat on the road would 

definitely not be fun.
Make sure your trailer is 

suited for the load. A real 

stiff trailer carrying a light 
boat can damage the boat by 

transmitting the bumps on 

the road to the hull. A trailer 

that is properly sized for the 

load will better cushion the 

boat down the road.

Also make sure that your 

boat is securely strapped 

down at the bow and at the 

transom. A boat bouncing 

around on the trailer will 

surely get damaged over 

time. I have had an experi-

ence where my boat’s hull 

was damaged due to the 

trailer not properly support-

ing the bow weight. It can 

happen even on trailers pro-

vided with the boat. 

If you are carrying a heavy 

load, position the load if pos-

sible, over the axle(s). For us 

striper fisherman, trailering 
the boat with a large capac-

ity bait tank will add eight 

pounds for every gallon of 

water on board (e.g. 50 gal-

lons will add 400 pounds of 

load). Special consideration 

should be taken for this type 

of load addition.

Another overlooked item 

is the web strap on the trailer 

winch. These straps can dry 

rot fairly quick (mainly due 

to the sun and water). I have 

watched my boat head out in 

the lake with no one aboard 

due to a failed strap while 

launching. Replace the en-

tire strap or remove the dry-

rotted portion that will nor-

mally appear sun-bleached. 

There are normally several 

extra feet of the strap to use 

on the winch.

A big problem most of 

us have to deal with in 

the Brazos River is the 
salt content. It is advis-

able to get an aluminum 

or galvanized trailer when 

you buy a boat. A standard 

steel trailer will rust fairly 

quickly. You should rinse 

your trailer after every fish-

ing trip to remove the salt. 

This will extend the life of 

your trailer. If you do see 

rust, take care of it quickly. 

There are special paints 

that are rust-resistant. 

Make sure you take care 

of that trailer. It has to get 

you there. It is just as impor-

tant as the boat. 

Take care of your boat trailer. Spending a little time on maintenance on your trailer can save a big bundle 

down the road. Photo MCC

FISHING REPORT
Water temperatures are in the middle to the upper 80s. 
Thermocline is present on many areas of Lake Granbury, 
about 20-25 feet down. Sand bass are schooling from 
Indian Harbor to DeCordova. Crappie are good on sub-
merged timber on many areas of the lake. Catfish con-
tinue to be good on baited holes near standing timber. 
Largemouth bass are good in numbers on crankbaits and 
soft plastics fished near main lake points and near deeper 
docks. Striped bass when located are good to 9 pounds on 
live shad and slabs. 

On other reservoirs, Lake Whitney and Possum Kingdom 
Lake continue to boast on limits of striped bass on live 
bait and down-rigged jigs on the lower ends. Possum 
Kingdom striped bass are good to 15 pounds. 

@azlenews



CLASSIFIEDS

Ad Classifications

Reach more than 8,000 households with combo 
advertising in the Azle News and the Springtown Epigraph.

Nobody does it better!

  CLASSIFIED 

AD DEADLINE:  

MONDAY BY 4:30 P.M. 

Most ads require payment in 

advance, but we do accept VISA,  

MASTERCARD, DISCOVER OR 

AMERICAN EXPRESS by phone.

CLASSIFIED 817-270-3340 - Azle - classified@azlenews.net
817-220-7217 - Springtown - shirley@springtown-epigraph.net

1. .. Air Condition/Heating
2. ........................Antiques
3...................... Appliances
4............Appliance Repair
5.......................Arts/Crafts
6............... Asphalt Paving
7..........................Auctions
8..................Autos, Trucks
9....... Auto Repair Service
10...........Backhoe Service
11. .............. Boats, Motors
12.................Bookkeeping
13....................... Business 

Opportunity
14.......... Campers/Trailers
15.............Carports/Patios
16.........Equipment Repair
17.............. Carpet Service
18 ........................Catering
19................ Cement Work
20.....................Demolition
21..................... Child Care
22..................... Cosmetics
23.....Computers/Services

24..................... Electrician
25................. Equipment & 
                         Tool Rental
26 ................... Excavating
27............... Exterminating
28 .......... Farm Equipment
29 .........................Fencing
30 ...................... Firewood
31 ...............................Free
32 ........................ For Sale
33 .......................Furniture
34....................... Garage & 
                       Estate Sales
35 ....Garden/Mowing Svc
36.......................... Hauling
37.................................Hay
38...............Health/Fitness
39 .................Help Wanted
40 .....Home Improvement
41 ............House Leveling
42............ House Cleaning
43..........................Hunting
44..........Janitorial Service
45................... Job Wanted

46............. Looking to Buy
47................ Lost & Found
48... Maintenance/Repairs
49..... Masonry/Stonework
50... Mobile Home Service
51.................. Motorcycles
52...........................Movers
53.....Musical Instruments
54..............Music Lessons
55...............Miscellaneous
56 Party Planning/Events
57.............. Pets/Livestock
58................Piano Service
59..................Pool Service
60..................Professional 

Services
61........................ Personal
62.......................Plumbing
63.................Public Notice
64................. Photography
65..........................Printing
66..........................Roofing
67...................... Recycling
68..........................Storage

69.................. Sand/Gravel
70..................Septic Tanks
71.......Sewing/Alterations
72...............Sewer Service
73........................TV/Radio
74............. Tractor Service
75.....................Upholstery
76......... Vacuum Cleaners
77...........................Wanted
78...................Well Drilling
79..........................Welding
80.................Lots/Acreage
81.....................Business & 

Commercial Property
82.................RV’s for Rent
83............ Houses for Sale
84................Mobile Homes  

for Rent
85................Mobile Homes  

for Sale
86...... Mobile Home/RV Lots
87.............Rent Furnished
88......... Rent Unfurnished
89 ............ Wanted to Rent

RATES

16 Words or Less:

Combo (Azle & Springtown)
Only $10.00 per week!

Over 16 words, add 20 cents per word

Extras such as Bold, Center & Border 

are available for a small fee

Classified boxed display ads also 

available for $9.00 per column inch

(All ads must be paid in advance unless 

you have previously established credit)

 014   Campers & Trailers

2017 Dutchman Voltage
Excellent condition, 3 slide 
outs, sleeps 8. 5th Wheel 
Toy Hauler. $67000.00

Call or text 817-437-2287

 019            Cement Work
Allen Chesney Concrete

All Types of Concrete Work

Residential - Commercial

Foundations, driveways, 

sand, gravel, demolition, 

haul-off, retaining walls

817-271-4541

Concrete Services, Patios, 
Driveways, Sidewalks, Retaining 
Walls, Foundations, Stone Walls. 
Free Estimates. 817-371-8597.

 020                 Demolition

 024                  Electrician

BULLDAWG ELECTRIC CO. 

All types of electrical services 

and MH hook-ups. 

Free Estimates. 817-675-4921

www.bulldawgelectric.com. 

TECL#25253.

 039              Help Wanted

Looking for mature people to 
work with small animals. Must 
have reliable transportation. Call 
for more information 817-926-
3300.

Auto Techs and Transmission 
Rebuilders and R&R Men, Top 
Pay for Top Skills. Call or come 
by 201 E. Hwy 199, Springtown, 
817-757-5144. Rainwater 
Transmission & Auto Repair.

Springtown ISD is accepting 
applications for Bus Drivers and 
Monitors. Training available. 
Contact the Transportation Dept. 
817-220-1418.

MAINSTREAM group homes are 
hiring for FT/PT direct care staff.  
Weekday 3:30pm-8:30am shifts 
as well as 24-hour weekend 
shifts.  Work 2 days a week, get 
paid to sleep, and have a full-
time job!  Paid training, benefits, 
bonuses, and OT opportunities.  
Start $9.00/hr with quick 
advancement possible. Call 
817-270-2747, Monday-Friday, 
9am-3pm.

TK’s Pools is hiring laborers.  Call 
817-677-2494.

Adult male needs Attendant Care 
Worker, Full-time or Part-time 
or Backup work. Great Work 
Environment. Serious Inquiries 
Only. Go to azlecareworker.com 
for more information 682-429-
9067 Text or Leave Message.

Need a full-time receptionist for 
real estate office, 9 to 5, Monday 
Through Friday, general clerical 
and phone skills. Send resume to 
200 W. Main St. Azle 76020. Attn: 
Donna Bransom. 817-925-8281.

Hiring Mechanic, Painter, and 
two general workers. Full or 
part time, pays well. Interesting 
variety of work. Weatherford, call 
Jimmy D 817-629-7531.

Shinola’s Texas Cafe in 
Springtown is hiring for all 
positions! .We are continuing 
to grow as our in house and 
catering business expands. 
Please come by and one of our 
managers will be happy to assist 
you. 301 Martin Ave.Springtown

Azle Chiropractic is seeking a 
P/T position for a Chiropractic 
Assistant, apply at office, 400 
Boyd Court, Azle. 817-444-4357.

NS Repair Services is looking 
to hire a couple more heavy 
equipment mechanics. Super 
busy and lots of work. Start 
immediately here in Azle. Pay 
based on knowledge and 
experience. We have an empty 
truck and a brand new shop that 
are ready and waiting. Call Niel at 
817-412-0621,  Jimmie at 817-
412-0622.

 026                 Excavating

 029                      Fencing
BOBBY’S FENCE. All types, 
Free Estimates, Over 26 years 
experience. 817-444-3213.

KILEY CHESNEY

CONSTRUCTION

All Types Fences - Tractor Work

817-846-6645

 032                      For Sale
Glass China Cabinet, Corner 
Cabinet, Cedar Chest, Oak 
Dresser, Floor Lamp, Brass Bed. 
817-237-3803, 682-338-0665.

 035    Garden/Mowing Service

Need your lawn mowed, trimmed 
or cleaned up? Need your trees 
trimmed or cut? Any job big or 
small give Scooter a call. Free 
Estimates. 817-766-3834.

COWBOY LAWN CARE. 
Residential, farm, gardens, 
landscaping, tree trimming. Free 
Estimates. 817-271-0450. Spring 
Specials.

HOMETOWN LAWN CARE. Best 
Prices Around. Free Estimates. 
Call Cody 817-454-6090.

Wise Outdoor Solutions

Pasture mowing 15 acres or less,

Finish mowing, Lawn Service. 

940-399-1677
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BYRUM CONSTRUCTION
Asphalt Paving

•Driveways •Parking Lots
•Asphalt Repairs & Sealcoating

•Asphalt Millings •Gravel
Bruce Byrum         817-690-2429
Azle, Texas

Absolute Asphalt
New Construction • Overlays

Repair • Seal Coating 

Striping • Gravel Work

See our reviews:  https://www.homeadvisor.com/
rated.AbsoluteAsphalt.96269565.html

817-437-9051
P.O. Box 2031, Azle, TX 76098-2031

Kiley Chesney Construction
Dirt & Concrete Work

Kiley Chesney, Owner

Springtown,฀TX฀•฀Mobile฀817-846-6645

Driveways฀•฀House฀Slabs฀•฀Garages฀•฀Add-ons 

Small฀Land฀Clean-ups฀•฀Gravel฀Driveways

MCNEELY’S 
DEMOLITION & 

CLEAN UP SERVICE

We Create Vacancy

FREE ESTIMATES
817-996-7887

253 Eagles Way, Springtown

•Tear Down 
•Removal 
•Haul Off 
•Mobile
    Homes
•Garages

•Barns 
•Houses
•Bobcat 
    Service
•Dirt/Gravel
    Spreading

E-Conn Electric
Service, Remodel, New Construction

Insured/BBB Accredited

817-615-7164
Customer Satisfaction is our Goal!

C/C ACCEPTED TECL20470

817-523-7248฀•฀817-239-6215

ALL TYPES OF EXCAVATING
Tanks฀•฀House฀Pads฀•฀Clearing

Also ..

Sand฀•฀Top฀Soil฀•฀Gravel

REED EXCAVATING
•฀SITE฀PREPARATION฀ •฀GRAVEL฀ROADS
•฀LOT฀CLEARING฀ •฀PARKING฀LOTS
•฀LEVELING฀ •฀DEMOLITION
•฀FINAL฀GRADE฀ •฀STOCK฀TANKS
•฀LAND฀EROSION

Dump Truck Hauling   817-919-3696

IRRIGATION
REPAIR

Residential/Commercial

License# LI007825

$85 Service Call

OUTDOOR SCENE

682-553-1560

LEON’S TREE SERVICE
Expert take downs 

Stump Grinding
Residential/Commerical

Licensed & Insured • Free Estimates 
817-371-8597

Chad’s Tree Service
Trimming • Removals • Stump Grinding

Systemic Feeding • Brush Chipping • Cable Bracing

817-221-2201 • 817-246-5943 
817-800-6059 CELL

Insured for your protection

FREE
ESTIMATES

STUMP GRINDING
Don’t dig it! Grind it!
1 or 100 - We can do it.
$85 minimum within 5 mi.

817-237-5592

Ruben’s 

YARD SERVICE

Tree Service • Stump Grinding 

Yard Clean-Up

940-730-0916

YARD SERVICES
BOBCAT WORK

SAND INSTALLATION

FENCING

STUMP GRINDING

817-371-8597

WANTED
Property Maintenance

Labor/Person
Gene Thompson & Associates

817-246-4646

Wise 
Ready Mix

1349 NW Parkway • Azle

Now Hiring 
Class B-CDL 
Mixer Drivers
• Production & Safety
     Bonuses Paid Monthly
• Employer Matching
     Retirement Plan 
     Available

Apply in person at

Lindsey State Jail Current Openings
Correctional Officers • Assistant Foodservice Manager 

Academic Instructors • Assistant Maintenance Supervisor - Plumber 
Assistant Maintenance Supervisor - Lock Tech • Lieutenant 

Vocational Instructor • Foodservice Manager • Chaplain
PLEASE CHECK THE WEBSITE FOR JOB QUALIFICATIONS.

Must have HS Diploma or equivalent, be able to pass a drug screen, have a clean 
background and valid driver’s license to be considered for a Correctional Officer. EOE

Apply online at www.mtctrains.com or call 
940-567-2272 and ask for the HR Department. 

Minority/Female/Veteran/Disabled
LINDSEY STATE JAIL

Help Wanted in 
Aurora/Alvord Area

• Mechanic
• Welder
• Equipment Operators

Competitive pay, some 

benefits. M-F day shift only, 

Overtime weekly.

For information 
call 214-802-5157

Karl Klement Properties, Inc.

For consideration of all positions apply to:

Jodi Pettis, Business & H/R Director

Alyssa Jacobs, Assistant H/R Manager

605 N. Business 287, Suite 102, Decatur, Texas

hr@klementford.com

940-627-6362

Klement Distribution, Inc.
(Hershey Ice Cream Distributor)

Body Shop Porter

Performs duties throughout the Body Shop.

Must be responsible, dependable and have a valid 

TXDL. Monday to Friday work week. 

 Parts Drivers/ Warehouse Associates

Must have valid TXDL with acceptable driving 

record. Overtime available and room for 

advancement. Monday-Friday work week.

Service Advisor

Must be committed to customer satisfaction, be 

honest, and dependable. Previous experience 

preferred, but willing to train the right candidate.

No Positions Available at This Time

Route Driver

No CDL required, but must have valid TXDL 

with acceptable driving record. Monday through 

Friday with Flexible time-off schedules, often 

3-day weekends during summer months Fun 

work environment! Promote from within 

advancement opportunities.

No Positions Available at This Time

006                                                 Asphalt Paving

024                                                         Electrician

035 Garden/Mowing Service

035 Garden/Mowing Service

039          Help Wanted

039          Help Wanted

www.azlenews.net 

www.springtown
-epigraph.net

039                                                     Help Wanted

Rescue your Ballerina 
from the local Shelter 

and give her a 
Furever Home

Shelter animals have 

lots of unconditional love 

to share with their 

new best friends.

Feel the Love - Adopt



Classifieds
817-270-3340 - AZLE

817-220-7217 - SPRINGTOWN

Deadline:
4:30 PM Monday

 062                   Plumbing

 066                       Roofing

 068                      Storage

INNERSPACE STORAGE. Hwy 
199, Springtown. Now renting all 
unit sizes, 24-hour access. 682-
842-1414.

 069               Sand/Gravel

 079                     Welding

 081   Business/Commercial
40x50 building For Rent, 

3 miles west of Springtown. 

817-713-7495.

PARKWAY CENTER

Hwy 199 Frontage

Near Hospitol

1500 SQ FT, $1,200/mo

Clean office space

 817-220-2021

The Bryants Company

Real Estate

 082              RV’s for Rent
Nice 1BR RV in adult RV park. 
Great for older person on limited 
income. Starts at $550/mo. All 
Bills Paid. Heritage RV Park 817-
444-3760.

 084  Mobile Homes for Rent
Pelican Bay: 1941 Gale Drive, 
2-2, CH/A, stove only, $795/mo. 
$450 deposit. Owner/Broker 817-
988-9954.

 085  Mobile Homes for Sale
Mobil Home For Sale

Coming soon, newly remodeled, 
3BR/ 2BA Mobil Home on 
one Acre. Between Azle and 
Springtown. $154,999 Call Don 
at 817-692-1996.

 086   Mobile Home/RV Lots

 088      Rent Unfurnished
3-2 Duplex for Rent in 
Springtown. $1,200/mo. $600 
deposit, no pets.  817-980-3066.

1833 PELICAN DR. N.

2-2-1 $1,295 MO. $1,000 DEP. 

Gene Thompson & Associates

817-246-4646 gtatx.com 

3-2 Single wide on one acre in 
Springtown for $1000 per month 
and $1000 deposit, no pets 
allowed.

817-980-3066

 040  Home Improvement
BILL ROSSER PAINTING & 
REMODELING. Big Savings: 
$100 off any job of $1,000 
or more. Painting, Carpentry, 
Porch Covers, Decks. FREE 
ESTIMATES. Call 817-304-9974; 
866-374-3559.

PYRAMID REMODELING. 
PAINTING: Interior, Exterior, 
Tape & Bed, Texture, Popcorn 
Ceilings. FREE ESTIMATES. 817-
944-7658.

BOBBY MCWILLIAMS

PAINTING 817-821-6377.

Interior/Exterior Painting

Residential & New Homes.

50 years experience.

 046          Looking to Buy

 049 Masonry/Stonework

 052                       Movers

U.S. Army Retired-but not tired! 

Careful moving-Cheap.

Call Big Jim @ 817-237-5151.

 057          Pets/Livestock

Will pay top dollar for grazing 

and hay leases. Call 940-389-

1936.

AKC French Bulldog Puppies, 

born  May 8th, 2022. Parent 

on site, vet checked, all shots 

complete. $2,000  817-880-5873
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LOCAL BUYER 
JIMMY D

•  Used/Damaged 

Campers

• Motorhomes
•  Farm Equipment
•  Trucks And Trailers

• Horse Trailers
• Boats
• Golf Carts
•  Propane Tanks
• Fork Lifts
•  Heavy Equipment
• ATVs • Misc.

817-629-7531

All Types Stone & Brick Work
New Construction • Remodels

Free 
Estimates

817-308-6512
email alvarogsilva@verizon.net

commercial • residential

AZLE, TX

Landscape Designs, Outdoor Kitchens 
Patios, Retaining Walls, Mailboxes

,L.L.C.

concrete

GRAHAM 

PLUMBING CO.

817-220-2469

Commercial-Residential

Serving Springtown, 

Azle, Boyd, 

Weatherford Area
M#15899

grahamplumbingco.com

LANDERS
Plumbing Co.

817-444-3054
940-233-2862
Don Landers • M-10078

Plumbing Repairs
Drains Cleaned

ROOFING & METAL 

BUILDINGS

817-304-4224

Tired of always 
replacing your roof?

We’ll be here 
after the storm.

Call us for a 
metal roof quote.

817-523-4137

Commercial & 

Residential

•฀Roofing
•฀Metal฀Roofing
•฀Carports
•฀Metal฀Buildings
•฀All฀General฀
฀฀฀฀฀Contracting

He r e  B e f o r e  T h e  S t o rm ,  H e r e  L o n g  A f t e r .

417฀N.฀MaiN฀St฀•฀SpriNgtowN

Miles Roofing
• Insurance Claim 
     Specialists;
• Free Estimates
817-797-3420

EXPERIENCED 
ROOFING SPECIALIST

FREE ROOF INSPECTIONS
Insurance Claims, Licensed Local Business 34 Yrs

ECE CONSTRUCTION LLC

cell 817-615-7164 | office 817-831-2600

Ash Creek
Storage

Convenient Location

Corner of Main St. & Locust • Azle

817-444-3292

1350 Liberty School Rd
5x10 Units $45/mo.

10x10 Units $70/mo. 

817-246-4646

STORAGE UNITS

Quality
Family Business

Since 1938

(817) 221-2681

CALL

Cliff Hall

We go the extra mile to ensure 
you get more for your $. 

On House Pads, Driveways, 
Lot Clearing & Tractor Work, Etc.

Cozart

Our Business is Metal Buildings
- And We’re Good!

DESIGN    FABRICATION    ERECTION

METAL 

BUILDING SYSTEMS

Fabrication and erection of quality 
metal buildings at reasonable prices, 

any size - any design

Office 817-237-2282
Fax 817-237-0904

Mark Cozart
817-233-6668

Jeremy Cozart
817-237-2028

Metal Building
Specialist

•฀Weld฀Ups/฀Bolt฀Ups
•฀Pipe฀Fencing
•฀Concrete
•฀Horse฀Barns
•฀All฀Types฀Fencing
•฀Metal฀Roofs

NO฀JOB฀TOO฀SMALL
Compare฀Pricing

R฀&฀E Construction

owner Rodney Vick 
817-220-3044 

fax 817-523-7639   
cell 817-253-1614       

Metal Building Erectors
•฀Pre-enginered฀฀Weld-up฀

•฀Barns/Shops฀
•฀Arenas/Hangars

•฀Fencing

1220฀E.฀Hwy.฀199฀•฀Springtown

WELD-DONE CONSTRUCTION LTD.

817-220-2150
www.weld-done.net

• Metal Buildings
• Steel Components
• Welding Supplies
• Concrete Supplies

• Fabrication Supplies
• Pipe Fencing
• Deer Blinds
• Deer Feeders

8894 W Hwy 199 • Springtown
817-220-0008 
www.SolidSS.com

Open to 
the Public

SOLID STEEL SOLUTIONS

POJO RV PARK

30x60 RV Spaces
Available

One small inside pet allowed

302 Allison Road
Springtown, TX 76082 

817-925-3673

NEAR POJO STADIUM

Hidden Meadow
MOBILE HOME COMMUNITY
Community Location: 6501 W. Hwy 199, Springtown

Contact Michael Ocampo for info 318-819-1901 
To apply: www.Turbotenant.com

Enter Property Address: 6517 W. Hwy 199 or property ID: 916548

Brand New 3/2 Single Wide Mobile Homes, many to choose from - 1216 S.F.

For Rent or Rent to Own Programs Available $1600/mo

Kevin’s
Handyman

Services

• Carpentry
• Drywall & Painting
• Tile & Laminate Floors
• Doors & Windows
• Decks & Stairs
• Cabinets & Countertops
• No Job Too Small

Springtown and 
Surrounding Areas

40 Years 
Experience

231-445-1221

Advertising 

Works!

Stewart Bend Duplex Homes: 2 & 3 

bedroom units available at $1,225 & $1,325. 

Quiet, clean, non-smoking. 

CALL 817-401-1796.

Silver Creek RV Park: Designed for local  

long-term stays. Best common building in 

Azle, secluded and quiet, city water/sewer. 

$475 with $75 electricity allotment; ABP 

in winter. CALL or TEXT 682-499-8616 or 

email scrvoffice@gmail.com.

Barton Cottages Tiny Home Community: 

COMING SUMMER 2022! Email 

BartonCottages@gmail.com

Cross Companies 
Residential Properties

Family-owned, family-run

AZLE OAKS

APARTMENT
700 JARVIS • AZLE

817-444-1712

1 & 2 Bedroom 
Unfurnished

Accepting Applications
Rent based on income

TDD: 
800-735-2989

This institution is an equal opportunity provider and employer.

GENE THOMPSON 

& ASSOCIATES
HOMES and MOBILE HOMES 

FOR RENT
gtatx.com

817-246-4646

079                                                             Welding

Need to sell your ATV? 

Call today and ask about our 

($29.95) 3-MONTH SPECIAL!

Azle News 817-270-3340
Springtown Epigraph 

817-220-7217

088                                              Rent Unfurnished

PUBLISHER’S NOTICE

All real estate advertis-
ing in this newspaper is 
subject to the Fair Hous-
ing Act which makes it 
illegal to advertise “any 
preference, limitation or 
discrimination based on 
race, color, religion, sex, 
handicap, familial status 
or national origin, or an 
intention, to make any 
such preference, limita-
tion or discrimination.” 
Familial status includes 
children under the age of 
18 living with parents or 
legal custodians, pregnant 
women and people secur-
ing custody of children 
under 18.

This newspaper will 
not knowingly accept any 
advertising for real estate 
which is in violation of 
the law. Our readers are 
hereby informed that all 
dwellings advertised in 
this newspaper are avail-
able on an equal oppor-
tunity basis. To complain 
of discrimination call 
HUD tollfree at 1-800-
669-9777. The toll-free 
telephone number for 
the hearing impaired is 
1-800-927-9275.

Rescue your Ballerina from 
the Shelter and give her a 

Furever Home

Sell It In The 

Classifieds!

Save a Shelter 
Animal. 

Find your 
furever Friend

Raise some 
extra money 
through the 
Classifi eds. 

Have a 
Yard Sale. 

16 words for 
only $10 
Azle News 

817-270-3340 & 
Springtown Epigraph

817-220-7217

Hometown Papers!
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TexSCAN Week of 
July 10-16, 2022

ACREAGE

Own your piece of Texas TODAY! Prices starting at 

$650/acre. Trans Pecos region. Also the Hill Country 

(Edwards, Menard, Coke, Val Verde Counties - 

free ranging exotics), South Texas (Duval County 

- whitetail, hogs). Large acreage or small. 30 year 

fixed rate owner financing, only 5% down. Call 

toll free or email for individual prices and terms. 

www.ranchenterprisesltd.com, 800-876-9720.

ARROWHEADS

Indian Arrowheads Wanted – Point Type: Clovis, 

Yuma, Firstview & Eden. Must be old, authentic & 

unbroken. Absolute TOP DOLLAR paid – up to 5 

figures for one point. I am a very serious high-end 

collector. Call 979-218-3351.

EVENT

Laredo International Sisters Cities Festival, July 

15, 16 & 17, Sames Auto Arena. Free Admission. 

July 15 & 16: 11 a.m.-8 p.m.; July 17: 10 a.m.-5 p.m. 

800-361-3360.

GENERATORS

Prepare for power outages today with a GENERAC 

home standby generator. $0 Money Down + Low 

Monthly Payment Options. Request a FREE Quote. Call 

now before the next power outage: 1-855-704-8579.

MEDICAL

Portable Oxygen Concentrator May Be Covered by 

Medicare! Reclaim independence and mobility with the 

compact design and long-lasting battery of Inogen One. 

Free information kit! Call 866-747-9983.

DENTAL INSURANCE from Physicians Mutual 

Insurance Company. Coverage for 350 plus 

procedures. Real dental insurance - NOT just a 

discount plan. Do not wait! Call now! Get your FREE 

Dental Information Kit with all the details! 1-855-901-

0467 www.dental50plus.com/txpress #6258

WANTED

FREON WANTED: Certified buyer looking to 

buy R11, R12, and R500 and more. Call Joe at 

312-625-5322.

Texas Press Statewide Classified Network 

221 Participating Texas Newspapers • Regional Ads
Start At $250 • Email ads@texaspress.com

NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We 

urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact the Texas Attorney General at 800-621-0508 or the 

Federal Trade Commission at 877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop.
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ACROSS

DOWN

  1  seat of McLennan

      County 

  5  Texas moonwalker,

      Bean

  6  both Texas Christian

      & Notre ____ claim

      the 1938 national

      championship

  7  “Hook ‘__ Horns!”

  8  gun rights grp.

  9  TXism: “first ______
      out of the box”

15  Tex Ritter sang the

      theme song for 1952 

      western “High ____”

16  TXism: “you’re buy-

      ing oats for a ____

      _____” (waste)

19  TXism: “lower than

      _  ______ belly”

21  Waxahachie’s county

22  most outlandish fish-
      ing story? (2 wds.)

27  popular seasoning

28  abuse sexually

29  deadly

30  illegal pursuer of

      another person

32  this Agee blocked

      for Emmitt Smith

      in 1990 (init.)

33  TXism: “go to _____’

      ___” (Sunday)

36  Texans love black-

      ____ peas

37  a wager at Lone

      Star Park

38  Texas-based film,
      “____  ___ Comin’

      Back, Red Ryder?”

39  “__  ______ she

      wore flannel PJs on
      her honeymoon”

  1  TXism: “tight___”

      (cheapskate)

  2  peach cobbler

      ___ mode

  3  Milam County seat

  4  TX Lucian Adams

      got Medal of Honor

      for ___-___  ______

      against Germans

  8  TXism: “plain as the

      ____ on your face”

  9  TXism: “________

      __  _  ___ in church”

10  Quanah High class

41  cell service provider

42  least serious crime:

      ____  _ misdemeanor

45  “get ___ of it”

46  TXism: “got ___ many

      irons in the fire”
47  Vega High class (2 wds.)

48  TXism: “that’s a horse

      __  _ different color”

49  TX James Baker was
      Reagan’s and George

      H.W.’s Chief __  _____

52  TXism:

      “there’s more

      of them than

      _____ in Texas”

53  Texas Traveling

      Wilbury, Roy (init.)

54  between E.III and

      E.V?

55  president born in 

      Denison, TX (init.)

11  six points on Fri.

      night

12  check phrase: “pay

      to ___  _____  __”

13  sprawl or lie lazily

14  honorary Texas

      Ranger: ____

      Stanley Gardner

15  TXism: “he couldn’t

      drive a ____  ____

      a snow bank”

16  Seur __  __ Salle, an

      explorer in Texas

17  Jenna Bush Hager to
      Barbara Bush Coyne

18  real ______

20  a Houston suburb

22  famous UT and NFL

      QB, Layne (init.)

23  this Myers

      designed the

      Texas Capitol (init.)

24  meat & veggie dish

25  TXism: “he’s a little

      shy in ___  ___

      size” (slow witted)

26  TXism: “he’ll be ___

      __ his own funeral”

28  archaic “reward”

31  Yoakum FM before

      it was KYKM

34  Yankee city (abbr.)

35  this Holliday spent

      time in Texas

37  southern Austin

      suburb on I-35

40  fit of pique
43  unauthorized

      absence for a 

      soldier (abbr.)

44  Mavs fans were __

      _____ up for 2022

      playoffs

50  treasure _____

51  TXism: “drunk __

      _ skunk”

P-1593
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Please call Jim at 817-237-5151

Member: 
• VFW  • DAV
• Sheriff’s Assn
•  American 

Legion 
• ET AL

HU.S. Army retired -  
  but not tired! H

•  Full Service Moving 
- Local & Long Range

•  Gun Safes - Pianos - Auto - Antiques
• Packing & Storage - Large or Small

Courtesy H Punctuality H Care

moverS

Movers

Texas Air Conditioning Contractor License: TACLA014745E

Serving the Springtown, Azle, Weatherford & Fort Worth Area Since 1970

Sales · Service • Residential · Commercial
SPRINGTOWN 817-220-4506

www.jandeac.com

J&E
AIR CONDITIONING

& HEATING

Air Conditioning and Heating 

Home Repair

AFFORDABLE 

HOUSE LEVELING

682-262-0393
FREE ESTIMATES

FLOOR LEVELING • CRAWL SPACE REPAIR 
PIER & BEAM • SLAB 

BRICK AND CONCRETE REPAIR

Trash/Waste Service

Transmissions & Auto Repair

Rainwater’s 
Transmission & Auto Repair

201 E. Hwy. 199, Springtown 

682-615-7250

TRANSMISSION • BRAKES 
A/C • ENGINE SERVICE

LOCALLY 

& FAMILY 

OWNED!

Exterminators

Diesel/Auto Repair

YOUR COMPLETE PEST CONTROL SERVICE

Family owned and operated. Over 50 years of service.

Voted Best Pest Control 
Best of Parker County

817-915-2470

Tom Samples 
Pest Control

ADVERTISE
in the Service Directory!

Call Johnna at 

817-270-3340 for 

details to include 

your business here.

ATEX
TRASH

SERVICE

817-344-8464 ATEXTRASH.COM

$35 per month   WEEKLY PICKUP

Proudly Serving The Community We Live In

Name __________________________________________________________ ___

Address____________________________________________________________

City_____________________________State ________Zip __________________

_______________________________________________________

County_____________________ Daytime ph.____________________

Clip and mail with check to: 

321฀W.฀Main฀Street฀•฀Azle,฀Texas฀76020
For an online subscription, visit our websites: 

azlenews.net or springtown-epigraph.net

- or - 

Azle News

฀P.O.฀Box฀557฀•฀Springtown,฀Texas฀76082

The

 $46.50 
OUT-OF-COUNTY
Texas฀and฀elsewhere฀฀  

 $36.50
SENIOR CITIZEN
60฀years฀and฀older
Tarrant,฀Parker฀&฀Wise฀only฀
  

 $40.00 
IN-COUNTY 
Tarrant,฀Parker฀&฀
Wise only 

Check one:

 $84.00 
OUT-OF-COUNTY
Texas฀and฀elsewhere฀฀ ฀
 

 $66.00
SENIOR CITIZEN
65฀years฀and฀older
Tarrant,฀Parker฀&฀Wise฀only 
  

 $72.00 
IN-COUNTY 
Tarrant,฀Parker฀&฀
Wise only 

 $25.00
ONLINE ONLY
Azle฀News฀
or฀Springtown฀Epigraph

 $45.00
ONLINE ONLY
Azle฀News฀
or฀Springtown฀Epigraph

2 Year Subscription1 Year Subscription

Subscribe Today!

3-Month Special Only $29.95

Find that Perfect Car or Truck in 
the Community Classifi eds.

Do you and your best friend need 

a new car for a road trip?

You can Sell your Auto 
in the same section. 
Call 817-270-3340 

for more info on our

OR
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AW Specialties 
RESALE SHOP Reuse, Recycle, & Collectibles

612 Profit St. Azle • 817-944-0080

Hours: Tues-Fri 10a-5p • Sat 10a-3p

Sale
July 14-1650%

off 

Sale50

DUSTIN HAYWOOD
POINT BLANK POWERWASHING LLC

MOBILE POWER WASHING 
SPRINGTOWN TX 76082

817-751-5731

116 S Stewart St Building 12, 
Azle, TX 76020

(817) 991-3360
 Follow us on Facebook! SCAN ME

Dear Frankie,

I grew up in a quiet and 
loving family. When one of 
us had something to say we 
gave them our full attention. 
None of us felt it necessary 
to share our every thought 
and feeling. We didn’t wag 
our tails a lot, bark much, or 
dance around when someone 
came home. Being reserved 
was never a problem for me 
until now. 

Recently, my boyfriend 
has complained that I never 
share my feelings and ques-
tioned if I really love him. 
He pointed out that he sees 
posts on Facebook where 
girlfriends write glowing 
and loving tributes about 
the man in their lives. I can’t 
imagine sharing such per-
sonal feelings in public, let 
alone on social media. 

I love my boyfriend and 
don’t want to lose him. But 
I’m shy and can’t become 
demonstrative at this stage 
in my life. I’m worried this 

DEAR FRANKIE
By Geneva Woodruff

Frankie is a rescue dog and an emotional support animal for Geneva Wood-

ruff.  Woodruff is a retired educator.

When caring 
becomes 
oversharing

might be a dealbreaker.
Concerned, Flossie

Dear Flossie, 

No, you can’t change your 
personality, nor should you. 
Can a leopard change his 
spots? Of course not. Per-
haps you might ask your 
boyfriend to suggest ways 
he would like you to show 
him how much you care. He 
might say things like write 
him a love note, wag your 
tail when he arrives, or share 
why you love him. These 
suggestions might be do-
able, even for someone shy. 

I agree with you about 
Facebook. Is nothing sa-
cred? You might remind him 
that one of the greatest gifts 
one can give to another is to 
listen to them and provide 
their undivided attention. If 
that’s not enough for him, it 
might be time to rethink the 
relationship. 

Signed, Frankie 

FROM STAFF REPORTS

The Tarrant Area Food 
Bank and Capt. Mark 
McLean on Thursday July 
7 welcomed Holidays and 
Heroes for a check pre-
sentation of $40,000 to 
help assist local military 
families who are stationed 
at the Naval Air Station 
Joint Reserve Base in Fort 
Worth and are struggling 
with food insecurity. This 
donation will be directed 
to provide Thanksgiving 
meals to approximately 
400 military families in 

November, according to a 
news release from TAFB.

The check presentation 
was at the Tarrant Area 
Food Bank Distribution 
Center; 2600 Cullen St. in 
Fort Worth.

Junior-enlisted service 
members and their families 
face many challenges in to-
day’s economy, including 
providing for their families’ 
basic needs. 

“Our service members 
should not have to worry 
about feeding their family 
a special holiday meal at 

Thanksgiving,” the release 
stated. “Holidays & He-
roes generous donation will 
ensure no service member 
in our community will be 
without the Thanksgiving 
meal this year. Holidays & 
Heroes receives monetary 
donations that support the 
organization’s donation to 
the Tarrant Area Food Bank 
to ensure military families 
in need receive the ‘gift of 
food.’” 

The Tarrant Area Food 
Bank has had a long-
standing relationship with 

TARRANT AREA FOOD BANK

Donation to help local military families

Holidays and Heroes gave a $40,000 donation, which will be used to help assist local military families who are stationed at the Naval Air 

Station Joint Reserve Base in Fort Worth and who are struggling with food insecurity. This donation will be directed to provide Thanksgiv-

ing meals to approximately 400 military families in November. Photo courtesy TAFB

the Naval Air Station Joint 
Reserve Base, collabora-
tively providing food dis-
tributions and other food 
security services on base, 
the release stated. Tarrant 
Area Food Bank received 
welcomed and much 
needed assistance from 
both the Army and Air 
National Guardsman dur-
ing the pandemic to pro-
vide necessary large mega 
mobile food distributions 
and packing events for the 
13 county communities 
served.  

AzleNews.net • 817-270-3340
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Standards Link: Life Science: 
Understand renewable and 
nonrenewable resources.

Look through the 
newspaper and find 
five things made of 
plastic. What could 

people use instead of 
plastic for each of 
these five things? 

Example: Plastic bag— 
use a cloth bag instead.

Instead of 
Plastic

The albatross is one of the world’s 
largest flying seabirds.

The most common North Pacific species 
is the Laysan albatross. There are more than 
660,000 breeding pairs just on Midway Atoll 
in the northwest Hawaiian Islands. 

Number the steps below in order.

The wandering albatross is the largest member of the albatross 
family. This bird is one of the largest birds in the world. They 

have the largest wingspan, ranging from 8.23 to 11.8 feet.

ACTIVITY: Stretch your arms out wide. Have a family member 
measure your “wingspan” from fingertip to fingertip.

Wide, Wide   Wingspan

Plastic Problem

How an Albatross Chick Eats

Even though this large group of albatross lives far away 
from people, their young get 
________ and die because of 
people. Small plastic toys, bottle caps, 
toothbrushes, and other small pieces of plastic 
have been found in the _____________ of 
the chicks.

How did plastic end up in the 
stomachs of __________ that live so 
far away from populated areas?

Albatross parents ___________ hundreds 
of miles to find food for their chicks. They 
scoop up squid, krill, fish eggs and other seafood 
from the _______________ of the ocean. But these days, 
they also accidentally swallow floating plastic. 

Replace the missing words!

Hawaiian Islands

Midway Atoll

P A C I F I C  O C E A N

You can keep trash from traveling to the sea by 
recycling, putting trash in trash cans, and choosing 
reusable alternatives over single-use plastic. Less 
plastic on land means less plastic in the sea!

Plastic straws create 
huge problems for the 
environment. Use a 

paper straw or, better 
yet, just skip the straw!

Skip the Straw!

© 2022 by Vicki Whiting, Editor     Jeff Schinkel, Graphics     Vol. 38, No. 33

One bird researcher on Midway saw an adult regurgitate 
a toothbrush and its chick ate it. Chicks are not able to  

regurgitate food or other materials out of their stomachs 
and the plastic food stays there, making them sick and 

sometimes killing them.

If I Had Wings
What would it be like if you had wings 

like a bird? Use your imagination to 
write a short story about life as a 

person with wings.

Standards Link: Letter sequencing. Recognize identical 
words. Skim and scan reading. Recall spelling patterns.
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ALBATROSS

PACIFIC

WINGSPAN

PLASTIC

ISLANDS

CAPS

MIDWAY

TOYS

LITTER

ATOLL

SQUID

OCEAN

SICK

BIRD

EAT

Color each odd number red to reveal the answer.

624864226488648482
59193985972919696
997169296569234
779921654385698
995749298949852
539567836129494
991989472947812
319329698529214
9979692

2
6
2
8
4
6
21696

6
8
4
2
4
2
63492

19559189392

2
6
4
8
6
2
8
6
2199698

824628646824682426

2
6
4
8
2
4
2
4
2
8
6

Cut six numbers from the newspaper. Paste two 
of them on a piece of paper with space between 
them. Make a number sentence by adding a 
“greater than” (>) or “less than” (<) symbol, such 
as 23 > 9. Repeat this with the rest of the numbers.

Standards Link: Math: Compare numbers using the < and > symbols.

Greater Than or Less Than

Are you an eagle-eyed reader? 
Circle the seven mistakes in this 

story. Then, rewrite it correctly on 
the lines. Have a family member 

check your work.

Many people thinks that trash 
found in the ocean is from boats 
or ships. This is knot true. 

Most ocean pollution is litter 
that starts out on land. Even 
hundreds of mile from the 
ocean, rainfall washes bits of 
trash into city storm drains and 
out into streems and rivers that 
lead to the ocean. Wind and 
currents kan carry plastic cups, 
bags, bottles, straws and more 
far out two sea.

Millions of tiny pieces of plastic 
flow into our oceans each days. 
Scientists estimate that over half 
of all see turtles and 90 percent 
of all seabirds on the planet have 
eaten some form of plastic.

By using much less plastic and 
recycling, yoo can help make a 
difference for our planet.

Ocean Pollution

TEA RELEASES 

STAAR RESULTS FOR 

GRADES 3-8

The Texas Education 
Agency has released the 
2022 State of Texas Assess-
ments of Academic Readi-
ness

Results for grades 3-8, 
which showed across-the-
board improvements in all 
grades and subjects, with 
especially significant gains 
in reading.

“The investments that the 
state is making in reading 
academies and accelerated 
instruction are clearly pay-
ing dividends for our stu-
dents, and the results are a 
testament to the hard work 
of teachers across our state,” 
Texas Education Commis-
sioner Mike Morath said.  
“While we still have much 
work to do to recover from 
COVID-related learning 
loss in mathematics, the 
improvements our students 
have made in reading are 
clear."

The spring results include 
exams in mathematics and 
reading for grades 3–8, 5th 
and 8th grade science, and 
8th grade social studies.

MILITARY BASES HAVE 

BIG IMPACT ON STATE’S 

ECONOMY

A study analyzing the im-
pact on the state’s economy 
from U.S. military installa-
tions concludes they con-
tributed at least $114.1 bil-
lion to the Texas economy 
last year and supported more 
than 600,000 jobs across 
the state. Texas is home to 
15 military installations 
and the U.S. Army Futures 
Command, which is located 
in Austin and runs modern-

Gary Borders is a veteran award-winning Texas journalist. He published a 

number of community newspapers in Texas during a 30-year span, includ-

ing in Longview, Fort Stockton, Nacogdoches and Cedar Park. 

gborders@texaspress.com.

CAPITAL HIGHLIGHTS
By Gary Borders

TEA releases STAAR results for grades 3-8, 
COVID-19 cases increase again

ization projects for the U.S. 
Army. 

The study was completed 
by the comptroller’s office 
at the behest of the Texas 
Military Preparedness Com-
mission.

“It is amazing to see the 
tremendous economic im-
pact these military installa-
tions have in Texas,” said 
Texas Comptroller Glenn 
Hegar. “The importance of 
these bases reaches far be-
yond direct jobs and per-
sonal income. The facilities, 
and the men and women 
who work and are stationed 
at them, form the backbone 
of communities and support 
countless businesses and in-
duced jobs throughout the 
state.”

FORMER NFL PLAYER 

INDICTED FOR BOGUS 

MEDICAL CLAIMS

Former NFL player 
Narond “Roc” Alexander 
was indicted recently for 
submitting fraudulent health 
reimbursement claims total-
ing more than $25,000 to a 
health program for former 
NFL players. The case was 
brought by Texas Depart-
ment of Insurance investi-
gators along with the Bexar 
County District Attorney’s 
office.

Alexander allegedly filed 
the bogus claims between 
2014 and 2018 under the 
Gene Upshaw NFL Player 
Health Reimbursement 

Plan, which helps pay cer-
tain medical care expenses 
for former NFL players. He 
could face up to 10 years in 
prison and a $10,000 fine if 
convicted.

“Insurance fraud hurts the 
people who actually need 
these funds to cover their 
health care costs, like the 
NFL players who benefit 
from this particular fund,” 
Bexar County District At-
torney Joe Gonzales said. 
“This indictment allows us 
to seek justice on behalf of 
the NFL players with le-
gitimate claims who rely on 
these funds.”

After playing for the 
University of Washington, 
Alexander signed with the 
Denver Broncos in 2004 and 
later played for the Houston 
Texans.

GRANT PROGRAM TO 

BENEFIT TRAVEL INDUSTRY

The travel industry, hard 
hit by the COVID-19 pan-
demic, is set to receive $180 
million of funds under a 
grant program funded by 
the federal American Res-
cue Plan Act of 2021.The 
program is designed to pro-
vide grants for the recovery 
of Texas businesses in the 
tourism, travel, and hospital-
ity industry affected by the 
pandemic.

“Travel and tourism are 
critical components to both 
the state and local econo-
mies,” said Gov. Greg Ab-

bott. “Visitor spending at 
Texas destinations brings 
new money into communi-
ties and spurs local job cre-
ation across industries in ev-
ery region of the state."

A series of webinars are 
slated to provide informa-
tion for specific businesses. 
To get more details and reg-
ister, go to: https://ttir.gov.
texas.gov.

DEMOGRAPHIC CENTER 

ANALYZES STATE CENSUS 

RESULTS

The U.S. Census Bureau 
has released its 2021 popu-
lation estimates, and the 
Texas Demographic Center 
has crunched the numbers to 
determine:

• Texas is growing both 
older and more diverse. Me-
dian age increased to 35.4 
years in 2021, up from 33.6 
in 2010.

• Texas has more Black 
residents than any other 
state.

• All urban core counties 
in Texas, except for Travis 
County, lost non-Hispanic 
white population.

• The state has the third-
largest Asian population in 
the country.

• Harris County has more 
Black residents than all oth-
er counties in the country 
except Cook County, which 
includes Chicago.

SHARING THE ROAD WITH 

LARGE TRUCKS

Anyone who has driven 
the state’s major highways 
recently likely has noticed 
the number of 18-wheelers 
on the road has risen as busi-
nesses and industries work 
to fill demand in many sec-
tors. The Texas Department 
of Transportation is remind-

ing motorists to take extra 
care when driving around 
big trucks. 

Drivers are especially at 
risk in the state’s energy 
sectors, according to Tx-
DOT. Last year, more than 
79,000 crashes occurred in 
the state’s five major energy 
production areas, resulting 
in 1,119 deaths — a 20% 
increase over the previous 
year.

Among the safety tips of-
fered by TxDOT are stay-
ing away from a truck’s 
blind spot; not tailgating; 
when passing a truck, mak-
ing sure you can see both of 
the truck’s headlights before 
moving back into your lane; 
and never crossing behind a 
truck that is backing up, since 
the driver can’t see you.

COVID-19 CASES 

INCREASE AGAIN

The number of new CO-
VID-19 cases reported in 
Texas during the past week 
by the Coronavirus Re-
source Center at Johns Hop-
kins University rose again to 
84,417, with 115 deaths re-
corded. Both numbers are up 
modestly compared to what 
was reported the previous 
week. However, lab-con-
firmed COVID-19 hospital-
izations in the state continue 
to rise steadily, with 3,007 
reported by the Department 
of State Health Services. 
That’s up 22% from the pre-
vious week and more than 
double what was reported a 
month ago.

The Texas Department of Transportation is reminding motorists to 

take extra care when driving around big trucks.  Photo MCC
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Call 
817-270-3340

Call Call 
817-270-3340817-270-3340

Help readers find 
your Business.

Rodney Gatlin, D.C.
400 Boyd Court

817-
444-HELP (4357)

AZLE

Celebrating over 25 years in business

www.azlechiropractic.com

A RETIREMENT AND ASSISTED LIVING COMMUNITY

113 Denver Trail • Azle 
817-444-3249    Fax 817-444-3275

www.eaglecrestvilla.com

STUDIO - 1 bath , 350 sq. ft.
ONE BEDROOM - 1 bath, 450 sq. ft
TWO BEDROOM - 1 bath, 642 sq. ft.

Joe Rider
Propane, Inc.

PROPANE

TANKS

817-237-3325

SECURITY LIGHTS
Office next door at

Trinity Commerical 

Contractors

817-444-8885
200 Walnut Creek Ave.

TRINITY SELF 
STORAGE

SECURITY GATE 24 HOUR ACCESS

RV, Trailer 

& Boat

45 Years of Quality
ISO 9001:2001 Compliant            Phone 817-444-2533
Check us out on our web site B.J. Clark
www.clarksmachine.com      bjc@clarksmachine.com 

“Serving Azle & The 

Community Since 1986“

113 SPEER ST

817-444-4920

Thank you for your support!

CLEANERS

Clarks Precision Machine & Tool 

636 Profit St., Azle, TxC P M T

HILLTOP FAMILY CHURCH

“Caring about what Jesus
cares about... You!”

1227 Old Cottondale • 817-220-7177

140 W. MAIN ST.

817-444-4613

Compliments of

Rural Gas Supply
P R O P A N E

“In business since 1946”

Your Ad Here!

Call Johnna to reserve this space.

817-270-3340

APOSTOLIC 

CORNERSTONE APOSTOLIC 

CHURCH 

1801 FM 730 N., Azle 
817-400-0612

HARVEST TIME APOSTOLIC 
1 Block N. FM 2048 in Keeter 
817-433-8220

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 

FIRST ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
1020 S.E. Pkwy, Azle 
817-237-4903

FELLOWSHIP OF LAKE WORTH 
4024 Dakota Trail, Lake Worth 
817-237-9433

NEW BEGINNINGS CHURCH 

810 Goshen Rd, Springtown 
817-523-4462 

LEGACY CHURCH 

Hwy. 199 W. at FM 2257, Azle  
817-221-2983 / 817-221-5760

VICTORY CHRISTIAN CENTER 

737 Boyd Rd., Azle 
817-444-LOVE

BAPTIST 

ASH CREEK BAPTIST CHURCH 

300 South Stewart, Azle 
817-444-3219

AGNES INDEPENDENT BAPTIST 

350 Agnes N., Springtown  
817-523-7271

BETHEL MISSIONARY BAPTIST  

408 S. Ash St., Springtown 
817-220-4238

AZLE AVENUE BAPTIST 

2901 Azle Ave., Fort Worth 
817- 626-5556

BRIAR FIRST BAPTIST 

West of FM 730 N. at sign, Briar 
817- 444-3484

CALVARY HEIGHTS BAPTIST 

1 block off Hwy. 199, 
east of David’s Patio, 
Springtown, 817-221-2241

CENTRAL BAPTIST 

4290 Old Agnes Road 
817-594-5918

CHURCH ON THE HILL 

836 NW Parkway, Azle 
817-444-3752

CHRISTWAY BAPTIST 

7673 West Hwy. 199, Agnes 
817-220-9133 or 817-220-3581

CLEAR FORK BAPTIST 

Corner of FM 730 & Ragle Rd., 
Weatherford, 817-594-1154

EAGLE MOUNTAIN BAPTIST 

8780 Eagle Mtn. Circle, Azle 
817-237-4135

FIRST BAPTIST 

CHURCH OF AZLE 

1017 Boyd Road 
817-444-4828

FIRST BAPTIST CASTLE HILLS 

401 Beverly Rd., Azle 
817-797-4706

FIRST BAPTIST LAKE WORTH 

700 Charbonneau Tr., 
west side of Effie Morris Elementary 
817-237-2624

FIRST BAPTIST LAKESIDE 

8801 Jacksboro Hwy., Lakeside 
817-237-8113

FIRST BAPTIST BRIAR 

6 miles N. of Azle on FM 730 
817-444-3484

FIRST BAPTIST COTTONDALE 

1 block N. of FM 2123, Cottondale 
940-433-5539

FIRST BAPTIST PEASTER 

FM 920 in Peaster 
817-596-8805

FIRST BAPTIST POOLVILLE 

1 block W. of FM 920, Poolville 
817-594-3916

FIRST BAPTIST SPRINGTOWN 

5th & Main Street, Springtown 
817-523-7011

FRIENDSHIP BAPTIST 

801 Friendship Rd., 9½ miles S. of 
Springtown off Hwy. 51 S. 
817-594-5940 or 817-599-4917

FUNDAMENTAL BAPTIST 

5th & Main in Springtown 
817-523-5477

GRACE BAPTIST 

3 miles N. of Springtown on Hwy. 

51 across from Radio Tower

GRACE POINTE CHURCH 

4110 E. Hwy. 199, Springtown 

817-221-5683

HERITAGE BAPTIST CHURCH 

3577 FM 51 N., Weatherford 

817-564-3946

IGLESIA BAUTISTA 

Nueva Jerusalen 

6640 Midway Rd., Springtown 

817-694-0444 

INDIAN OAKS PRIMITIVE 

BAPTIST CHURCH 

3229 Shawnee Trail, Lake Worth 

817-237-8441

LAKE WORTH BAPTIST 

4445 Hodgkins, Lake Worth 

817-237-4163

METROPOLITAN BAPTIST 

6051 Azle Ave., Fort Worth 

817-237-2201

NEW HOPE BAPTIST 

782 New Hope Rd., Reno area 

817-221-2184

NORTHWEST BAPTIST 

5500 Boat Club Rd., Lake Worth 

817-237-6063 or 817-270-8476

SILVER CREEK BAPTIST 

730 S. & Veal Station Rd., Azle 

817-444-2325

NEW BEGINNINGS 

BAPTIST CHURCH 

3605 Jacksboro Hwy., Azle 

817-707-2741

PLEASANT GROVE BAPTIST 

FM 2048 and CR 4677, Boyd 

940-433-5477

PRIMERA IGLESIA BAUTISTA 

300 S. Stewart, Azle 

817-500-3641

SPRINGTOWN 

BAPTIST TEMPLE 

201 J. E. Woody Rd., Springtown 

817-523-0376

UNION BAPTIST CHURCH 

3451 Sarra Lane, Springtown 

682-333-1645

WALNUT CREEK BAPTIST 

220 W. Reno Rd. in Reno 

817-221-2110

BIBLE 

COMMUNITY BIBLE 

FELLOWSHIP 

1405 Reynolds Rd., Reno 

817-521-4510

NORTHWEST BIBLE CHURCH 

5025 Jacksboro Hwy., Fort Worth 

817-624-2111

SOLID ROCK BIBLE CHURCH 

591 S. Reno Rd., Springtown 

817-221-3444

CATHOLIC 

HOLY TRINITY CATHOLIC 

800 High Crest Dr., Azle 

817-444-3063

CHRISTIAN 

THE CHURCH AT AZLE 

1801 S. Stewart, Azle 

817-444-9973

AZLE CHRISTIAN FELLOWSHIP 

35 West Forty Estates., Azle 

817-688-3339

GREATER VISION FELLOWSHIP 

1801 S. Stewart St., Azle 

817-825-0485

THE ABBEY CHURCH 

10400 Jacksboro Hwy., Azle 

817-238-1404

CROSSING FELLOWSHIP 

120 E. Main St., Azle 

817-406-4577

CHURCH OF CHRIST

AZLE CHURCH of CHRIST 

336 NW Parkway 

817-444-3268

BRIAR CHURCH of CHRIST 

109 W.N. Woody Rd. 

(½ block west of FM 730 N. in Briar) 

817-444-7102

MIDWAY CHURCH of CHRIST 

6400 Midway Rd. 
817-221-2107 

NEWSOME MOUND ROAD 

CHURCH of CHRIST 

1460 Newsome Mound Rd. 
817-677-3290

NORTHWEST 

CHURCH of CHRIST 

6059 Azle Ave., Fort Worth 
817-237-1205

POOLVILLE CHURCH of CHRIST 

West of FM 920 in Poolville 
817-594-4182

SOUTHSIDE 

CHURCH of CHRIST 

130 W. Bradshaw Lane, Springtown 
817-221-2799

SPRINGTOWN 

CHURCH of CHRIST 

Just west of Hwy. 51 North 

817-523-4419

TRI-COUNTY 

CHURCH of CHRIST 

525 Hwy. 199 W., Springtown 
817-980-8156

CHURCH OF GOD 

ABUNDANT LIFE 

CHURCH of GOD 

4800 East Hwy. 199, Suite 7 
Springtown, 817-677-3208

LAKESIDE CHURCH OF GOD 

THE WORD@LAKESIDE 

9396 Confederate Park Rd. 
(FM 1886) 
817-237-5500

DISCIPLES OF CHRIST

AZLE CHRISTIAN 

117 Church St., Azle 
817-444-3527

CENTRAL CHRISTIAN 

1602 S. Main St., Weatherford 
817-594-3043

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 

4th & Main, Paradise

EPISCOPAL 

ST. ANNE’S 

ANGLICAN EPISCOPAL 

6055 Azle Ave., Fort Worth 
817-237-1888

PROVIDENCE REFORMED 

EPISCOPAL 

405 Bowie Dr., Weatherford  
817-596-7476

ST. ELISABETH EPISCOPAL  

5910 Black Oak Lane, River Oaks 
817-739-0504

GOSPEL 

CENTRAL FULL GOSPEL  

FELLOWSHIP 

3009 Delaware Tr., Lake Worth 
817-237-7919

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES 

KINGDOM HALL OF  

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES 

212 Pearson Lane, Azle 
817-221-2242

LUTHERAN 

THE EDGE CHURCH - AZLE 

1313 SE Parkway, Azle 
817-237-4822

HOPE LUTHERAN (ELCA) 

4795 Hwy. 199, Reno 
817-221-HOPE

METHODIST 

BOYD UNITED METHODIST 

FM 730 North in Boyd 
940-433-5334

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 

200 Church St., Azle 
817-444-3323

LIGHTHOUSE FELLOWSHIP 

7200 Robertson Rd., Fort Worth 
817-237-2758

SILVER CREEK  

UNITED METHODIST 

2200 Church Rd., Azle 
817-444-1382

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 

Hwy. 51 N & 3rd Street, Springtown 
817-523-7874

GARVIN UNITED METHODIST 

3 miles West of Boyd on C.R. 4699

POOLVILLE UNITED METHODIST 

1 block W. of FM 920 
(behind Poolville Post Office) 
817-599-3601

THE CHURCH OF JESUS
CHRIST OF LATTER-DAY SAINTS 

(THE MORMONS) 

THE CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST

OF LATTER-DAY SAINTS 

1010 Timberoaks, Azle 
817-237-5075

PENTECOSTAL
GRACE CHAPEL UNITED 

PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 

3508 Shawnee Trail, Lake Worth 
817- 237-4844

PRESBYTERIAN
GRACE FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 

606 Mockingbird Lane, Weatherford 
817-594-2744

ORTHODOX PRESBYTERIAN 

CHURCH OF FORT WORTH 

Meeting at Northwest YMCA  
5315 Boat Club Road, Fort Worth 
817-989-9800

ORTHODOX  
ARCHANGEL GABRIEL 

ORTHODOX CHRISTIAN CHURCH 

1157 S. E.  Parkway (Jacksboro 
Highway), Azle 
817-752-8255

OTHER 
ALIENTO DE DIOS 

2233 E. Hwy 199, Springtown 

817-521-4694 

BETTER LIFE COMMUNITY CHURCH 

3131 E. Hwy 199, Spt 

817-677-2300 

CORNERSTONE 

COMMUNITY CHURCH 

2233 Hwy 199 East, Springtown 

817-221-LIFE (5433)

FAMILY CHURCH 

9 miles S. of Springtown on Hwy. 51 

817-599-7655

GRACE FELLOWSHIP CHURCH 

2964 W. Hwy 114, Paradise 

940-969-2427

HILLTOP FAMILY CHURCH 

1227 Old Cottondale Road, 
Springtown, 817-220-7177

THE HOUSE OF PRAYER 

1356 Reno Rd., Springtown 

817-221-2551

POWERHOUSE 

OF PRAISE CHURCH 

1649 S.E. Parkway, Azle 

817-319-7364

BRANDED CROSS 

COWBOY CHURCH 

3282 FM 2048, Boyd 76023 

817-755-7021

SECRET PLACE MINISTRIES 

112 Optimist Rd., Springtown 

682-229-1433

GOSPEL GATHERING FELLOWSHIP 

7315 Silver Creek Rd 

at Flatrock Rd, Azle 

817-313-1793

LIGHTHOUSE CHURCH 

6409 FM 730 S., Azle 
817-444-4311

LIGHTHOUSE HARBOR CHURCH 

1960 Long Circle, Pelican Bay 

817-444-3547

NEW LIGHTED WAY 

624 Harbor Dr. Circle, Azle 

817-444-1577

NORTHWEST TEMPLE OF PRAISE 

6781 Jacksboro Hwy., Lake Worth

PRECIOUS FAITH 

TEMPLE CHURCH 

8601 Hwy. 199 @ Vance Godbey’s

THE HOUSE OF PRAYER 

1356 Reno Rd., Springtown 

817-221-2551

THE RANCH COWBOY 

COUNTRY CHURCH 

14600 FM 730 North, Azle (Briar) 

817-909-5627

REAL FAMILY FELLOWSHIP 

202 Pearson Lane, Azle 

817-677-5963

SOULS HARBOR 

11701 Jacksboro Hwy., Azle 

817-726-2065

WESTERN HARVEST 

FELLOWSHIP CENTER 

6577 Old Springtown Rd., 

Weatherford 

817-523-2855 or 817-995-9087

SHEPHERD’S HEART CHURCH 

14435 FM 730 N • Azle 
817-444-7777

WESTERN STAR COWBOY CHURCH 

790 CR 3696 • Paradise 76073 
817-688-6887

Your Ad

1825 W. Hwy. 199   Springtown, TX 76082

 817-220-4506

TACLA014745E RRC#11349

Call Johnna to reserve this space.Call Johnna to reserve this space.

  
                    noticed!noticed!  

youryour  businessbusiness

GetGet

817-270-3340817-270-3340

Place your ad here!

Call 
817-270-3340

Call Johnna for details TODAY 

817-270-3340

817-270-3340 or 817-220-7217

Advertise Your 

Business With Us
and maximise your visibility!

Contact us about advertising solutions.

817-270-3340
817-220-7217

WHAT’S HAPPENING  WHAT’S HAPPENING  

IN YOUR HOMETOWN?IN YOUR HOMETOWN?

Subscribe today to keep up-to-date. 

Azle News: 817-270-3340

Springtown Epigraph: 817-220-7217

This devotional and directory is made possible by these businesses who encourage all of us to attend worship services.

Want readers to Want readers to 

FIND
    YOU?

Place your ad 
here today! 
817-270-3340 

or 817-220-7217

817-270-3340

Call Johnna 
for details 
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$ 40 
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AZLE INSURANCE 

DIRECTORY

AUTHORIZED AGENT

Kaye Burtnett & Vanessa Roberson

905 E. Hwy. 199 Springtown, TX 76082

HOME • AUTO • FARM • LIFE

Protecting Texans, Prioritizing customer service

Thank you for voting us 
Best Insurance Agency 2021

Amy Kaplan, Agent

813 E. Hwy. 199

Springtown, TX

817-220-5222

Voted Best Agent of Parker County 2014, 2015 & 2016

Parker County

Voted Best Insurance Agency of Parker County 2015

www.amykaplaninsurance.com

Dale Mares, 
AAMS BIG SAVINGS
MARES INSURANCE GROUP INC
208 W. MAIN, AZLE • 817-444-1491 
dalemares@allstate.com

Insurance and coverages subject to terms, qualifications and availability. 

Allstate Vehicle and Property Insurance Co. Allstate Fire and Casualty 

Insurance Co. Northbrook, Ilinois 2010 Allstate Insurance Co.

HOGLE
INSURANCE 

GROUP

HOGLEINSURANCE.COM

“OUR BEST POLICY IS PERSONAL SERVICE”

817-444-6389SHAYE HOGLE HOGYE HOGLE

Health · Life · Disability · Dental · Final Expense

817-444-1129
682-209-2027

www.SorrowFamilyInsurance.com

Stephanie and Ed

Home · Auto · Boat · Motorcycle · Big Rig · Mobile Home

Our Family Helping Yours!

Paying Too 

Much For 

Insurance?

Call For 

Your Free 

Quote

Sorrow Family Insurance

  817-444-1100
408 Boyd Ct. • Azle

www.HaleyCarter.com

PEOPLE’S CHOICE AWARDS 5 YEARS IN A ROW!

VOTED #1 INSURANCE AGENCY IN AZLE

HALEY CARTER

Albracht Harwood
Insurance Agency Inc.

120 S. Main St #4, Springtown, TX 76082

albrachtharwoodinsurance.com

(817) 220-4700
2nd Location - Grapevine, TX

BY JEFF PRINCE
jeff@azlenews.net

The sound of a whistle blowing 
inside Hornet Stadium on an early 
summer morning was like “Reveil-
le” to a group of girls still wiping 
sleep from their eyes.

On July 7, the Emerald Dazzlers 
of Azle High School were prepar-
ing for the summer’s first volun-
tary practice session. More than a 
dozen girls had showed up at Hor-
net Stadium despite the early hour 
and warm temperatures pushing 
toward the century mark.

Azle Emerald Dazzlers honing 
skills for upcoming sports season 

Before practice began, the 
team’s new director, Crystal Mar-
tinez, and team captain Daisy Col-
lazo told the girls to line up on 
the artificial turf. One by one, the 
teammates took turns describing 
something fun they had done this 
summer. 

One girl had adopted a pet rab-
bit. Another girl had installed a 
bunk bed in her room. One had 
seen “Top Gun: Maverick.” An-
other had watched “Minions: The 
Rise of Gru.”

After the small talk was done, it 
was time to go to work.

The Emerald Dazzlers are known 
for their bright smiles and dazzling 
dance moves. Typically, the girls 
don glittery hats and clothes and 
wear flamboyant makeup while 
dancing and waving pompoms 
during halftimes at football games. 

On this summer day, however, 
the girls were focused on funda-
mentals, practicing their steps and 
arm motions. Sweat flowed down 
their faces and soaked their cloth-
ing. They were dressed casually in 
shorts and T-shirts with their hair 

SEE DAZZLERS, PAGE 17A.

Crystal Martinez is enjoying her first year as director of the Dazzlers.  

 Photo by Jeff Prince

FROM STAFF REPORTS
Season tickets for the 

upcoming football sea-
son at Azle High School 
will continue to be avail-
able through July 29.

Access the online tick-
et site at brushfire.com/
azleisd.

Season tickets are $45 
and subject to a conve-
nience fee.

The season’s home 
games include:

Season tickets remain on sale 

for Azle Hornet football games

The Azle Hornets are gearing up for a new football season, and tickets are avail-

able for the fun. Photo by Jeff Prince

Aug. 18: AHS vs Lake Dallas 7 p.m. (Preseason)

Aug. 26: AHS vs Frisco Reedy at 

7 p.m. (Youth Night)

Sept. 9: AHS vs Denton Ryan at 

7 p.m. (Junior High Night)

Sept. 23: AHS vs Brewer at 

7 p.m. (Homecoming)

Oct. 14: AHS vs Saginaw at 7 p.m.

Oct. 28: AHS vs South Hills at 

7 p.m. (Senior Night)
SEE SOCCER COACH, PAGE 17A.

Hannah Smith is the new head coach 

for girls soccer.  Courtesy photo

Azle’s new head 
coach for girls soccer 
is a familiar face
BY JEFF PRINCE
jeff@azlenews.net

Hannah Smith, the assistant 
coach on the Azle High School 
girls soccer team for the past two 
years, has been promoted to head 
coach.

She replaces former head coach 
Madeline Wood, who moved to 
Oklahoma over the summer.

“I’m happy to stay here with the 
kids and just transition to that spot 
and get going,” Smith said.

Azle was Smith’s first coaching 
job after leaving college in 2019, 
and she is in her third year at Hor-
net Nation.

Smith grew up and graduated 
from high school in Garland in 
2013 before playing Division II 
soccer at Fort Hays State in Hays, 
Kansas. 

In 2017, she graduated from 

Hays State and became a vol-
unteer assistant coach at Texas 
A&M University-Corpus Christi 
while working on a master’s de-
gree. In 2019, she earned a mas-
ter’s degree and began working at 
Azle High.

The Lady Hornets finished out 
of the playoffs last season with 
an overall record of 3-18-2 and a 
district record of 1-8-1. The team 
consisted of sophomores mostly, 
and their inexperience showed. 
Last year’s roster contained just 
one senior.

This season, the roster will be 
packed with five seniors and eight 
juniors with varsity experience.

“We’re gaining a lot more expe-
rience than we’ve had in the last 
two years,” Smith said. “We’ve 
had a very young team up until 
this point.”

Also, local girls are starting 

to play soccer earlier in middle 
school and coming to high school 
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pulled up in buns or pony-

tails to withstand the sum-

mer heat.

Taking the lead was Col-

lazo.

“You’re doing really 

good,” she told the Dazzlers 

midway through a drill to 

work on their steps. “I know 

it’s hot.”

During a water break, Col-

lazo explained the urgency 

in getting together during 

summer break. School be-

gins on Aug. 17, a little more 

than a month away.

“Our first football game 
is like, the next week after 
school starts,” she said. “We 

barely have any time, so we 

had to get things done now.”

The team is learning its 

routines under a new set of 
watchful eyes, as former di-
rector Erin Boyer has left the 

team and been replaced by 

first-year teacher and direc-

tor Martinez.

“We got a new director, so 

we’re trying to get back on 

track,” Collazo said.

MEET THE NEW BOSS

Martinez is no stranger to 

Hornet Nation. She attended 

Azle High School and par-

ticipated in the color guard 

for four years before gradu-

ating in 2014. Afterward, 
she continued to work as a 

volunteer technician with 

the color guard for several 
years and became an instruc-

tor in 2019.

After graduating from 
Texas Woman’s University 

in 2020, she entered a work-

force decimated by COV-

ID-19. 

“Graduating during the 

just doing a great job. They 

want to succeed, and I want 

the best for them, as well. 
We are all working together 

to get it going.”

Fitting in with her new 

charges hasn’t been dif-
ficult because they have 
been “very willing and very 

kind,” Martinez said.

A portion of the team was 
missing practice, but Marti-

nez wasn’t concerned. The 

session was voluntary, and 

yet more than a dozen girls 

had shown up.

“It’s vacation time, but 

these girls are willing to 

come out and work,” she 

said. “I told them if they’re 
out for vacation, I totally 
understand. It’s summer. 

People want to enjoy their 

vacations, and a lot of them 
already had things sched-

Dazzlers captain Daisy Collazo blows a whistle while leading the group through drills on July 7.

From right, Caitlin Sanders works with her teammates on a dance routine.

Team manager Lizzy Farley helps keep things in order during practices and games. Photos by Jeff Prince

DAZZLERS, CONTINUED FROM PAGE 16A.

pandemic was quite difficult 
as jobs in the arts were dif-
ficult to obtain since times 
were uncertain,” she said.

Martinez juggled a suc-

cession of jobs, including 
teaching dance at Transcend 

Motion Dance Company, 

working as a caretaker, 

DoorDashing and serving as 

a paraprofessional at Eagle 
Heights Elementary School.

Now, she has entered the 

teaching profession, serv-

ing as Dazzlers director at 

the high school and teaching 

dance at Azle’s junior high 

schools.

Martinez likes what she 

sees in this year’s Dazzlers.

“They’ve been doing a 

good job,” she said. “They 

had a week of camp already 
to learn routines. They’ve 

been working together and 

uled.”

Her goal for her first sea-

son as director is to be “in-

spiring to them and hopeful-
ly expand their knowledge 

of dance,” she said.

MANAGER FARLEY

When Lizzy Farley was 

a young girl, she attended 

football games at Hornet 
Stadium to watch her older 

siblings play in the marching 

band. Mostly, though, she 

liked watching the Emerald 

Dazzlers.

“I always sat right behind 

them when we went to the 

games,” she said. “I didn’t 

want to sit anywhere else.”

This year, Farley was ap-

pointed as manager, and 

she takes pride in helping 

at practices, keeping track 

of pompoms and boosting 

team spirit. She can be sen-

sitive to loud noises, so she 

prefers helping out from the 
sidelines rather than being 

on the field at halftime or 
during competitions.

“I go to a lot of the practices 
and practice with them and do 

what they do,” she said. “Dur-

ing the games, I sit over there 

on the bleachers.”

Her teammates appreciate 

her presence, including Cait-

lin Sanders, a junior begin-

ning her third year with the 

Dazzlers. 

“Dazzlers is a really fun 
way to just do what you 

love, do what a lot of people 
are passionate about and 

just dance together as a big 

group,” she said. “It’s a very 

loving and hardworking 

team. I’ve always wanted to 

be on a drill team.”

with more experience, she 

said. 

“We’ve just got to put it 

all together and hope for 
some results,” she said.

Making the playoffs is a 

SOCCER COACH, CONTINUED FROM PAGE 16A.

goal but not the only one.

“The biggest thing I want 

to do is sit down and make 

goals as a team to kind of 
know what we’re shooting 

for throughout our district 

and throughout the season,” 

Smith said. “The playoffs 
are always going to be our 

end goal. Whether we can 

get there this year, we have 

the players to do it. I guess 

we’ll just have to wait and 

see how it all comes togeth-

er.”

Jelling as a team will lead 

to more wins, she said.

“The biggest thing is 

team, the team atmosphere,” 

Smith said. “I don’t want to 

make goals that I’ve written 

out myself because that’s 
something we have to do as 

a group for them to buy into 

it. As long as we stay a team 

and continue to fight as a 
team, that’s the biggest thing. 

Being sure we’re playing for 
each other instead of someone 
just playing for themselves.”
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Doctors on the medical staffs practice independently and are not employees or agents of Texas Health hospitals or Texas Health Resources. © 2022

When accidents or emergencies happen, we’re prepared with the advanced care and compassion you need – right here in Azle. Our 

emergency department is open 24 hours a day and is located just down the road. As part of one of the largest health systems in North 

Texas, we’re here for you and your family to provide the care you need, close to home.

Texas Health is right there with you.

If you are experiencing an emergency, call 9-1-1.

108 Denver Trail | Azle, TX 76020

For more information, visit TexasHealth.org/Azle 
or call 817-444-8600

For those closest to you,

our emergency care is close by.

AZLE

Game 
Faces

Arasely Palomares, left, and Megan Brady, right

Lynnleigh WilliamsMicah Putt


