
FREE CONSULTATIONS

408 Central Dr., Azle 

817-444-8827
Next to the Drive-thru of PNC Bank

www.azlenwpt.com

Post Operation • Joint Replacement • Balance Training • Sports Rehab • Stroke Rehab
Return to Work • Back and Neck Rehab • Over 24 years of Experience
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BY DON MUNSCH

don@azlenews.net

Eagle Crest Villa offers 
many reasons for people 
to call home.

Celebrating 24 years in 
June of caring for those in 
the Azle community, the 
retirement and assisted 
living community has 
been embraced by resi-
dents and families alike. 
Eagle Crest features a 
small, intimate setting in 
which it can focus on the 
care of its residents.

Eagle Crest has 42 spa-
cious, well-appointed 
apartments in three dif-
ferent floor plans. The 

SPONSORED

Eagle Crest’s care 
sets itself apart

Eagle Crest director Heather Holman. PHOTO BY DON MUNSCH SEE EAGLE CREST, PG 6B.

community has indepen-
dent and assisted living 
care. The caring staff is 
available 24 hours a day, 
seven days a week, and 
residents are provided 
with individual pendants 
to contact personal care 
attendants for assistance. 

“What sets (Eagle Crest) 
apart from the competi-
tion is our care,” director 
Heather Holman said, 
noting there’s not a large 
corporate ladder to go 
through in order to get 
something done. She talks 
to the owners daily and 
if something needs to be 
done, she can get it han-
dled quickly. 

Eagle Crest is a smaller 
community. Therefore the 
staff become familiar with 
each resident and are able 
to better recognize medi-
cal needs with residents 
and can seek immediate 
assistance if needed, Hol-
man said.  They are also 
conveniently located di-
rectly across the street 
from Texas Health Re-
sources Azle hospital.

Eagle Crest has an 
aquarium, jigsaw puzzle 
alcove, a barbershop and 
salon and a small, en-
closed aviary for bird-
watching enthusiasts. 
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Call Kip Kruger for a personal tour

817-444-2536

Azle Manor offers quality 

post-acute and long-term care. 

Our focus is providing exceptional 

clinical services, by people who 

truly care, in an environment that 

promotes health and wellness.

721 Dunaway Lane ·· Azle, 76020

Locally Owned and Serving the Community for Over 47 Years

Welcome to Azle Manor - the cornerstone in 

Rehabilitation and Skilled Nursing care.

··  On-site Physical, 

Occupational and Speech Therapy

·· 24-Hour Skilled Nursing Care

·· Beauty and Barber Shop

·· Therapeutic Whirlpool
®
 Bath Tubs

·· Interfaith Religious Services

··  Family-Centered Wellness 

& Activity Program

·· All Electric Beds

·· WiFi Available

·· Televisions with DirectTV Provided

··  Courtyard and Gazebo

Kip Kruger
Administrator

Laci Gray
Marketing Director

Taylor Hamilton
Director of Nursing

We Care Like Family

Accepting Medicare, Medicaid, Private Pay and Insurance

HEALTH CARE & REHAB

237 W. Main St. • Azle • 817-444-2170

Flexion/Distraction 
technique stretches 
and loosens the 
spine. Adjustments 
can bring relief from 
headaches and 
backaches.

Dr. Matt 
Mishio and 
Dr. Jessica Brace

Dr. Matt Mishio is 
‘In Network’ with 
Cigna and United 
Health Care.

Madison Schoppenhorst 
(left), BJ Widder, Lisa 
Daniels, Irma Villarreal, 
Courtney Gann & 
Shelby Edwards are part 
of the team at Brace 
Chiropractic helping 
ensure you achieve the 
best care to meet your 
wellness needs.

Did you know 
that massage 
therapy may be 
covered by your 
insurance?

Massage Therapists 
L-R Shelly, Amanda, 
Lacy and Kessie. Not 
pictured: Mystie and 
Angie.

Accepting All Major Insurance & Medicare In Network with 
Blue Cross/Blue Shield, PHCS, Aetna, Cigna, Care-N-Care, and United Healthcare

Chiropractic Care Can Treat:
HEADACHES • PEDIATRICS • PERSONAL INJURY • ASTHMA • COMMON COLD • BACKACHES

Hours:  Mon. 9am-12pm & 2pm-6pm • Tues. 9am-12pm & 2pm - 5pm
Wed. 9am-12pm & 2pm-7pm • Thurs. 9am-12pm & 2pm-6pm • Fri. 8am-1pm

CHIROPRACTIC
& WELLNESS CENTER, L.L.C.

BRACE

Dr. Matt Mishio, 
D.C.

Dr. Jessica Brace, 
D.C., C.C.S.P.

www.bracechiropractic.com
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STATEPOINT 

Since the start of the 
pandemic, Americans 
have been postponing 
routine care. With more 
Americans vaccinated 
against COVID-19, medi-
cal experts are urging pa-
tients to return to routine 
health care and get caught 
up on delayed or foregone 
preventive health screen-
ings.

“While we know that 
prevention is the best 
medicine, the pandemic 
has caused many Ameri-
cans to delay important 
routine health services vi-
tal to keeping themselves 
and their families healthy, 
particularly critical im-
munizations and preven-
tive cancer screenings. 
We urge everyone to get 
up to date on their routine 
health care needs,” says 
Gerald E. Harmon, M.D., 
president of the Ameri-
can Medical Association 
(AMA).

According to the AMA, 
you and your family 
should take these six steps 
to get your health back on 
track:

1. Get screened: Esti-
mates based on statistical 
models show that since 
April 2020, 3.9 million 
breast cancer, 3.8 million 
colorectal cancer and 1.6 
million prostate cancer 
diagnoses may have been 
missed due to pandemic-
related care disruptions. 
Check in with your health 
care provider. If you’re 

PREVENTATIVE HEALTH: Many Americans may have postponed preventative health screenings. Schedule 
an appointment soon to get caught up. PHOTO SOURCE: (C) DRAZEN ZIGIC / ISTOCK VIA GETTY IMAGES PLUS

Six steps to get your health back on track
due for preventive care, 
tests or screenings, make 
an appointment. These 
measures are designed to 
keep you healthy and help 
your doctor spot certain 
conditions before they be-
come more serious.

2. Don’t wait: An es-
timated 41% of adults 
with one or more chronic 
health conditions report-
ed delaying or forgoing 
health care since the pan-
demic started. Addition-
ally, one in three of those 
adults reported that doing 
so worsened one or more 
of their health conditions 
or limited their abilities 
to work or perform other 
daily activities. Whether 
you have a chronic health 
condition or not, don’t 
wait until something is 
wrong before seeing a 
doctor. If something does 
feel off, schedule an ap-
pointment with your doc-
tor as soon as possible.

3. Consider telehealth: 
If you’re uncomfortable or 
unable to go in person to 
your physician’s practice, 
check on telehealth op-
tions, which have greatly 
increased over the past 
two years.

4. Visit your pediatri-
cian: During the pan-
demic, pediatric immu-
nizations decreased. As 
public health measures 
are rolled back, people 
gather in groups, and 
traveling resumes, non-
COVID-19 infections that 
decreased during the 

pandemic are likely to in-
crease again. Well-child 
visits and recommended 
vaccinations are essential 
to helping ensure children 
stay healthy and protect-
ed from serious diseases. 
If your child is due for a 
check-up, schedule one 
immediately.

5. Get vaccinated: Ado-
lescents and adult im-
munizations also sharply 
declined during the pan-
demic and an estimated 
26 million recommended 

vaccinations were missed 
in 2020 as compared to 
2019. Get up to date on 
vaccinations, including 
the COVID-19 vaccine. 
Everyone who’s eligible 
for the COVID-19 vaccine, 
including booster doses, 
should get vaccinated as 
soon as possible to pro-
tect themselves and their 
loved ones. If you have 
questions, speak with 
your physician and review 
trusted resources, includ-
ing getvaccineanswers.

org.
6. Don’t neglect men-

tal health: While men-
tal health screenings via 
digital health tools are up, 
routine care for mental 
health is down. Approxi-
mately 52% of adults with 
mental health conditions 
delayed or forewent care 
since the pandemic began. 
Given the adverse effects 
the events of the past two 
years have had on mental 
health, such as increasing 
anxiety, depression and 

loneliness, it’s especially 
important to prioritize 
this aspect of your health 
now.

“We encourage every-
one to contact their trust-
ed medical professional 
to schedule their annual 
physical and other vital 
care to help prevent seri-
ous health repercussions 
that could potentially last 
long past the pandemic,” 
says Dr. Harmon.

For more resources, vis-
it ama-assn.org.

Go from dreaming to doing 
with the right home loan.

pinnbanktx.com • 817.444.2504

ARLINGTON • AZLE • BENBROOK • BURLESON 

CLEBURNE • COLLEYVILLE • FORT WORTH 

GRANBURY • JOSHUA • KEENE • MANSFIELD  

RHOME • RIO VISTA • SPRINGTOWN
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COACHING

• Personal Training

• Team Training

•  Jumpstart 
Sessions

• Virtual Coaching

•  Anytime Fitness 
Member App

•  Virtual Studio 
Classes

STRENGTH 

& FREE 

WEIGHTS

• Free Weights

• Squat Racks

• Plate Loaded

• Dumbbells

• Barbells

•  Circuit/
Selectorized

CARDIO

• Treadmills

•  Elliptical 
Cross-Trainers

• Stair Climber

• Stair Master

•  Rowing 
Machines

• Exercise Cycles

LET’S MAKE HEALTHY HAPPEN.

24-HOUR ACCESS • 24-HOUR SECURITY

PRIVATE RESTROOMS • PRIVATE SHOWERS

WELLNESS PROGRAMS • WEIGHT ROOM

TRAINING AREA • MYZONE HEARTRATE MONITOR

Thanks Azle for voting us the Best Gym!

248 Park Place • Azle • 817-406-4776 
AnytimeFitness.com

JUMPSTART SESSION TEAM WORKOUTS PERSONAL TRAINING

STATEWIDE

There is a federal law 
called the Health Insur-
ance Portability and Ac-
countability Act of 1996 
(HIPAA) that sets rules 
for health care providers 
and health plans about 
who can look at and re-
ceive your health informa-
tion, including those clos-
est to you – your family 
members and friends. The 
HIPAA Privacy Rule en-
sures that you have rights 
over your health informa-
tion, including the right 
to get your information, 
make sure it’s correct and 
know who has seen it. 

HIPAA requires most 

What is HIPAA and the Privacy Rule?
doctors, nurses, hospitals, 
nursing homes and other 
health care providers to 
protect the privacy of your 
health information. How-
ever, if you don’t object, 
a health care provider or 
health plan may share 
relevant information 
with family members or 
friends involved in your 
health care or payment for 
your health care in certain 
circumstances. 

Under HIPAA, your 
health care provider may 
share your information 
face-to-face, over the 
phone or in writing. A 
health care provider or 
health plan may share rel-

evant information if: 
You give your provider 

or plan permission to 
share the information. 

You are present and do 
not object to sharing the 
information. 

You are not present, and 
the provider determines 
based on professional 
judgment that it’s in your 
best interest. 

Examples: 

An emergency room 
doctor may discuss your 
treatment in front of your 
friend when you ask your 
friend to come into the 
treatment room. 

Your hospital may dis-

cuss your bill with your 
daughter who is with you 
and has a question about 
the charges, if you do not 
object. 

Your doctor may discuss 
the drugs you need to take 
with your health aide who 
has come with you to your 
appointment. 

Your nurse may not dis-
cuss your condition with 
your brother if you tell her 
not to. 

HIPAA also allows 
health care providers to 
give prescription drugs, 
medical supplies, x-rays 
and other health care 
items to a family member, 
friend, or other person 

you send to pick them up. 
A health care provider 

or health plan may also 
share relevant informa-
tion if you are not around 
or cannot give permission 
when a health care provid-
er or plan representative 
believes, based on pro-
fessional judgment, that 
sharing the information is 
in your best interest. 

Examples: 

You had emergency sur-
gery and are still uncon-
scious. Your surgeon may 
tell your spouse about 
your condition, either in 
person or by phone, while 
you are unconscious. 

Your doctor may discuss 
your drugs with your care-
giver who calls your doc-
tor with a question about 
the right dosage. 

A doctor may not tell 
your friend about a past 
medical problem that is 
unrelated to your current 
condition.

For more information 
about sharing your health 
information with family 
members and friends, or 
more information about 
HIPAA, visit www.hhs.gov/
ocr/privacy/hipaa/under-
standing/index.html.

Source: Department of 
Health and Human Ser-
vices, hhs.gov.

BY JESSICA MCKINNEY

azlereporter@azlenews.net

 Jessica Brace of Brace 
Chiropractic and Wellness 
is preparing for her third 
trip to Japan in Septem-
ber to teach her adjust-
ment techniques to Japa-
nese chiropractors.

“So, in Japan, there is 
no formal education for 
chiropractic,” said Brace. 

“Chiropractic is an 
American medicine and 
so they are catching up to 
where we are in America.”

The seminar Brace is 
attending in Japan this 
fall will last for two weeks 
and different topics will 
be covered for thousands 
of attendees.

Brace is one of only sev-
en U.S.-based chiroprac-
tors selected to take part 
in this seminar, which is 
entering its 45th year. She 
is the only one from North 
Texas.

Because they don’t have 
formal education for chi-
ropractic care in Japan, 
Brace said they rely on 
American doctors to go 
there to teach students 
and chiropractors their 
techniques.

An interesting trend 
that Brace has noticed 
over the years of attending 
the seminar in Japan is 
the increasing number of 
female chiropractic prac-

SPONSORED

Brace Chiropractic takes 
techniques to Japan

titioners.
“When I was first there, 

about 30% of the attend-
ees were female,” she said.

“But that number has 
been growing closer to 60-
70% women.”

Brace has been practic-
ing chiropractic care since 
2003 and opened her Azle 
practice in 2004. 

At that time, the per-
centage of female chiro-
practors in the U.S. was 
around 18%. Today, the 
National Board of Chiro-
practic Examiners shows 
that number has grown to 
about 32%.

Brace says that it is a 
privilege to be invited 
back to Japan to share 
the knowledge and tech-
niques that have benefited 
her clients here at home 
with practitioners abroad.

“To be one of only a few 
chosen from the U.S., and 
the only one in North Tex-
as, it’s so great.”

Brace Chiropractic has 
been serving Azle for 19 
years and offers treatment 
plans to help ease pain 
from head to toe through 
chiropractic techniques 
and massage therapy.

For more information 
about how you can benefit 
from chiropractic care, 
call Brace Chiropractic 
and Wellness Center at 
817-440-2170. They are 
located at 237 W. Main St.

Matt Mishio and Jessica Brace at Brace Chiropractic and Wellness Center will help you get back to feeling 
like your best self and address your total health and wellness needs. Brace Chiropractic is located at 237 W. 
Main Street in Azle. Call 817-444-2170 for an appointment. PHOTO BY JESSICA MCKINNEY
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Care and Wellness Where You Need It.

You don’t have to go far for quality health care. You can get it right here in Azle. Texas Health Azle offers many services and 

advanced technologies, so you can get quality care closer to home. Plus, we are part of one of the largest health systems 

in North Texas, so you can feel confident trusting Texas Health Azle with all your health care needs.

Texas Health is right there with you.

Doctors on the medical staffs practice independently and are not employees or agents of Texas Health hospitals or Texas Health Resources. © 2022

1-877-THR-WELL  |  TexasHealth.org/Azle

3D Mammography ■  MRI ■  EKG ■  Bone Density Testing 

Emergency Services ■ Gastroenterology 

Physical, Occupational & Speech Therapy ■ Surgical Services ■ Orthopedic Surgery

right here in Azle.

The right care,
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LOCALLY OWNED AND OPERATED IN AZLE FOR OVER 20 YEARS

Let us do all the work so you 
can get back to 
what you enjoy…

TO SCHEDULE YOUR PRIVATE 

TOUR  AND COMPLIMENTARY 

LUNCH, CALL HEATHER 

HOLMAN AT 817-444-3249

113 Denver Trail • Azle 

817-444-3249
www.eaglecrestvilla.com

An Equal 

Opportunity 

Employer

Offering the most extensive 
local flooring options!

Natural Stone • Quartz 

Glass Tile • Granite

Free Estimates 

Financing Available

Luxury Vinyl Carpet

Tile Hardwood

500B N. Stewart Suite 1, Azle

817-752-2065
www.TexasDesignerFlooring.com

12 MONTHS 
ZERO INTEREST 

12 MONTHS 
ZERO PAYMENT

COUPON CODE:12NONO*

FREE
CARPET PADDING

With Any Carpet Purchase

(While Supplies Last)

COUPON CODE:FREEPAD2022**

Present a coupon to a sales associate at Texas Designer Flooring Azle, In-store only.  *W.A.C, Minimum 10% down, cannot be combined with other offers, see 
store for details **This coupon entitles you to receive free carpet padding with the purchase of any carpet, while supplies last. This coupon cannot be combined 

with any other offers or discounts. One coupon limit per peron, per order, at Texas Designer Flooring Azle.

The community also has a 
hummingbird and butter-
fly garden and a vegetable 
garden where residents 
can help harvest season-
al vegetables and herbs.  
Residents will find sev-
eral places indoors to visit 
with family members and 
they can even reserve the 
private dining room for a 
meal with a loved one.

Each apartment comes 
unfurnished.

“We want our residents 
to bring their own personal 
belongings – to make it 
their home, so it is warm 
and inviting,” Holman said.  

Each apartment fea-
tures a large, private 
bathroom with a walk-in 
shower, kitchenette, in-
dividually controlled AC 
and heating units, and 

plenty of closet and stor-
age space. All residents 
receive complimentary 
weekly housekeeping, lin-
en services and free Wi-Fi 
and DirecTv.

Residents at Eagle Crest 
also enjoy three home-
cooked meals a day plus 
snacks and a number of 
activities and weekly shop-
ping trips. Among some 
activities for residents are 
bingo, various games and 
movies, Yoga, and kara-
oke. One of the big hits is 
their Ride to Nowhere – it 
is just that. It is a ride that 
takes residents around to 
different parts of the city 
to get them out and to dis-
cover their surroundings.     

For those who receive 
assisted living care, they 
receive medication super-

vision and assistance with 
daily living activities, such 
as bathing, dressing and 
grooming. 

Residents can choose 
from a visiting Doctor 
or they can continue to 
see their current Primary 
Care Physician.  Terry-
lynn Tidwell, a licensed 
nurse, is on call 24-7 and 
she has 40 years of expe-
rience in caring for the 
elderly.  “She is a blessing 
to have on our team here. 
Terrylynn brings a lot of 
wisdom to our team,” Hol-
man said.

 Assisted Living resi-
dents can also receive 
transportation to and 
from doctor offices for 
medical appointments if 
needed.  There is also a 
weekly shopping trip for 

those who need to pick up 
a few key items.  

“The longevity of our 
staff, especially since CO-
VID, is what our families 
and residents like about 
Eagle Crest, that there’s 

longevity - especially with 
our management team,” 
Holman said.

Eagle Crest does not re-
quire community fees or 
long-term contracts. It is 
located at 113 Denver Trail 

in Azle. 
To schedule your pri-

vate tour and complimen-
tary lunch, give Heather 
Holman a call at 817-444-
3249 or visit eaglecrest-
villa.com.

EAGLE CREST, CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1B.

The Eagle Crest Villa facility in Azle, Texas.



2597 W. Hwy 199, Springtown

817-668-6363
Open Mon.-Fri. 8:30 AM - 5 PM Sat. 9 AM - 2 PM

www.springtownfloors.com 
SpringtownFloors@yahoo.com

Call for Free Estimates • 30+ Years Experience

Wood • Tile • Vinyl Plank • Carpet • Shower
12 Months No Interest Financing Available W.A.C.

SALES & INSTALLATION
Honesty & Quality Are Our Best Reference! Family Owned & 

Operated! Where Experience and Quality Count!

Find us on 

Facebook!

Physical therapist Shane Wall of Northwest Physical Therapy stands inside the 
facility at 408 Central Drive in Azle. The business can be accessed at www.azlen-
wpt.com. Call for information 817-444-8827.

NORTHWEST PHYSICAL THERAPY

Frontier Dentistry

129 East 1st St., North Side of Square Springtown

817-523-4648

Welcoming 
new patients!
•   Partnering with 

specialist to offer 

removal and 

replacement of teeth 

in one day.

•   Offering preventative, 

restorative and 

cosmetic dentistry 

including full mouth 

implants as well as 

multiple and single 

implants, so you 

never leave the office 

without permanently 

placed teeth.

FACILITY ID # 107301
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Dr. Jeffrey R. Crabtree

6921 Foster Dr. 

Lake Worth, TX 76135

www.lakewortheye.com

817-439-9455

Back to School Attention Seniors!

Did you know 

Medicare will 

help pay for 

your eye exam?

Call Today!

*

Eye Exam 
REG. $6900

$4900

Frame 
& Lenses

$100Off
Offer expires 8/31/22.

*Discounts can not be 

used with Vision Insurance. 

Offer expires 8/31/22.
*Discounts can not be 

used with Vision Insurance. 

for every room in your home! Quality, large selection, 
and great prices ... are still found at ...

WAREHOUSE FULL of WAREHOUSE FULL of 
ROLLS and REMNANTSROLLS and REMNANTS

“Since 1979”“Since 1979”www.LarrysCarpet.comwww.LarrysCarpet.com
8305 Jacksboro Hwy.  • 817-237-78718305 Jacksboro Hwy.  • 817-237-7871

SHOWROOM & WAREHOUSESHOWROOM & WAREHOUSE

CARPETCARPETLarry’sLarry’s

Wood Floors
Ceramic Tile

Administrator Kip Kruger (right and the dedicated 
staff at Azle Manor Health Care and Rehabilitation 
work hard to ensure that residents receive high-qual-
ity care while also taking part in fun activities. The 
facility offers spacious lounges and lobbies, private 
dining facilities, interfaith services, a beauty/barber 
shop, therapeutic whirlpool baths, and tastefully dec-
orated rooms that overlook the grounds, offering a 
view of the wildlife that roams the area. Azle Manor is 
located at 721 Dunaway Lane. For more information, 
call 817-444-2536.

AZLE MANOR

A n g e l s  C a r e  H o m e  H e a l t h

Here is what we can do for you!Here is what we can do for you!

WHAT WE DOWHAT WE DO

• Skilled Nursing • Wound Care • Falls Prevention  

• Disease Management and Education 

• Medication Management  • Blood Glucose Monitoring Education

• Restorative Therapy (Physical, Speech and Occupational) 

• Behavioral Health at Home 

• Alzheimer’s & Dementia

• Care Connections Pre-Palliative Care

• Take a Breath Respiratory Program  

• Anxiety & Depression Chronic Care

• Pain Management Program 

Call us today 
for more information  
about our services!

 Care Home Health

An AngMar Managed Company

100%

medicare 

coverage

SPECIALTY PROGRAMSSPECIALTY PROGRAMS

GENERAL SERVICESGENERAL SERVICES

Serving:

Azle 
and surrounding areas

817-200-0515angelscarehealth.com

$40 In-County
$36.50 

SENIOR CITIZEN
$25 

ONLINE ONLY 

Subscribe 
Today!

817-220-7217
springtown-epigraph.net

817-270-3340
www.azlenews.net
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Dr. Dustin Fields • 729 Boyd Road • Azle

817-444-3289

HOURS: M-F 8:00-5:30, Closed for Lunch 12:00-1:30 • Sat 8:00-12:00

TX-2385678

State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company 

State Farm Fire and Casualty Company 

Bloomington, IL 

Lindsay Bender Ellis
1216 S. Main St. 
Weatherford, TX 76056 
817-594-0252
CoveredByLindsay.com

A conversation about life 

insurance now can make 

a big impact on your 

family (and even your 

retirement) later. 

LET’S TALK TODAY.

You only live once. 
That’s worth 
protecting.

A/C & HEAT
by Russell

Authorized Dealer:

• Rheem • Comfortmaker • Amana

SERVICING ALL BRANDS

SALES • SERVICE • INSTALLATION
Residential & Commercial

Major credit cards accepted

817-270-8811 office

817-239-8710 cell

 Russell Reed
owner

TACLBO17933C

Quality At Reasonable Rates

BY JESSICA MCKINNEY

azlereporter@azlenews.net

Legacy Oaks of Azle be-
lieves the fun doesn’t stop 
just because you’re get-
ting older. The variety of 
activities and programs 
combined with the beau-
tiful amenities for seniors 
at Legacy Oaks help you 
to have an enriching and 
fulfilled life after 55.

There are three sepa-
rate living options at the 
Legacy Oaks community: 
Independent Living, As-
sisted Living and Memory 
Care.

Adults 55 and older who 
enjoy an active lifestyle 
are the perfect fit for Inde-
pendent Living at Legacy 
Oaks of Azle. Residents 
enjoy a continental break-
fast, and two full meals 

SPONSORED

Legacy Oaks keeps the good 
times coming for seniors

are served each day. All 
apartments are set up 
with utilities, cable, phone 
and internet. Housekeep-
ing is also included.

Seniors who need a little 
extra help may choose the 
Assisted Living commu-
nity at Legacy Oaks. They 
will enjoy three home-
cooked meals daily, an 
exercise room with sched-
uled activities, and trans-
portation services.

The Memory Care com-
munity is designed spe-
cifically for those with 
Alzheimer’s or dementia. 
Residents receive special-
ized care, including tai-
lored dementia care pro-
grams, so that they can 
live their best possible life.

The activities director 
and staff at Legacy Oaks 
are constantly planning 

fun things to do from one 
month to the next so that 
residents always have 
something to look forward 
to.

In June, Legacy Oaks of 
Azle hosted the first an-
nual Summerfest, which 
brought the community 
to the Legacy Oaks com-
munity to celebrate the 
start of summer. There 
were bounce houses and 
a dunk tank, kids’ games 
and activities, and ven-
dors set up both inside 
and outside. This was a 
great event that allowed 
residents to interact with 
friends and family and 
others from around Azle.

Coming up in July, there 
will be a Margarita and 
Taco Night. Later in the 
month is Wing and Trivia 
Happy Hour to celebrate 

National Chicken Wing 
Day on July 29.

Legacy Oaks is also 
hosting monthly Broad-
way events, with “Mamma 
Mia!” being shown as the 
movie of the month on 
July 29.

The Dog Days of Sum-
mer event will be Aug. 9 
featuring baked treats and 
pet portraits. Brews and 
Poker is happening Aug. 
25.

As summer comes to 

an end, residents get to 
celebrate with an End of 
Summer Pool Party on 
Sept. 14.

Every fourth Tuesday 
at Legacy Oaks is the 
Walking with You sup-
port group for family and 
caregivers of Memory 
Care residents. This sup-
port group is open to the 
public.

The staff at Legacy Oaks 
will assist future residents 
in making the transition 

from their current home, 
including packing and hir-
ing movers and working 
with realtors.

Legacy Oaks is located 
at 1364 Southeast Park-
way in Azle. For more in-
formation about ameni-
ties and the community, 
visit www.legacyoaksazle.
com. 

To find out about times 
and tours at the Legacy 
Oaks of Azle community, 
call 817-406-3259.

The staff at Legacy Oaks of Azle is pictured above with Independent Resident, 
and long-term resident of Azle, Betty Haas. For more information about ser-
vices, call 817-406-3259 or visit www.legacyoaksazle.com.

AzleNews.net

817-270-3340



10B Wednesday, June 29, 2022

If you have ever seen the Life Alert 
commercials then you have a picture 
in your mind of an elderly lady laying 
on the floor desperately trying to get 
up only to discover she is not able to. 
Whether she is just weak, has broken 
a hip or caused some other serious in-
jury this is a major concern for our el-
derly patients. 

CDC Reports: Falls Are The Leading Cause of Injuries In Seniors

When I came to Moss, I had trouble walking 

due to no balance. I was not able to get in and 

out of a car, I was not able to do my activities. 

After my therapy I am able to walk and continue 

with my shopping and light house work. I can 

do this all un-assisted thanks to my therapy. 

 - Evelyn Tinney

Do you feel guilty that your spouse is forced to be with you all the time because 
of your dizziness/loss of balance? Do you feel that your dizziness/loss of balance 
is always there no matter what you do? Do you feel that you are handicapped by 
your dizziness/loss of balance? Does your spouse stay with you in the shower so 
that you do not fall?

If you answer yes to any of these questions, this may just be the piece of advice 
you’ve been looking for!

Attention Men and Women Who Want To Remain Independent...

MUST-READ Advice For Seniors Who 

Want to Stay Out of the Nursing Home

By Balance Expert Dr. Robert Moss

Working with seniors over many years it has become apparent that the greatest 
common fear is the fear of falling and not being able to get back up. This is not 
unreasonable as 1/3 of all adults over 65 will fall this year and each fall is poten-
tially life changing.

Don’t Let A Fall Ruin The Life You’ve Worked So Hard For...

Falls often lead to hospitalizations, serious injury or the need for assisted living of 
some sort. In the most severe cases a fall can lead to death. If the fall, injury, and 
hospitalization isn’t bad enough, frequent falls lead to loss of independence, limits 
in your daily activities, and increase your reliance on friends and family members 
to complete basic everyday tasks.

With the right information and the right guidance many falls can be prevent-

ed, keeping you out of the hospital and Nursing Homes. Here is what one of 

my patients had to say: 

If you are embarrassed or reluctant to use a cane or walker because it makes 
you “look old” or  if you feel like a burden to those around you because you need 
to hold on to someone when you walk or ask them to run your errands… MOSS 
Rehabilitation Center has prepared a FREE Report for you “The Top 8 Secrets To 
Improve Your Balance And Prevent Falls”. 

To get the guide Simply call this special number 817-220-MOSS (6677) to 
request the FREE Report OR if you want the report right now, please visit

www.springtownphysicaltherapy.com/balance-report

Dr. Joseph McCreary, III 
FAMILY & COSMETIC DENTISTRY

Family dentistry for all ages. Serving the Azle, Texas area

209 Roe Street, Azle TX 76020 • 817-444-3209

Go ahead 
& smile!

PREVENTATIVE • RESTORATIVE • COSMETIC

BLEACHING SPECIAL $99

Crowns & Bridges • Whitening • Dentures • Dental Veneers 

Implant Restoration • Cosmetic Dentistry • Pediatric Dentistry & More...

Open Mon-Fri 8:30 am - 6 pm, Sat 9 am - 1 pm • Closed Sun.

232 W. Main St. · ·  Azle
www.lauraspharmacy.com www.lauraspharmacy.com • Fax 817-406-4550

Pharmacy 817-406-4546

More than just 
a pharmacy.

Because we care...

•  Essential Oils

•  Homeopathic 
and herbal products

Accepting Most Insurance • Convenient Drive-Thru
FREE Deliveries In Azle City Limits

Most Prescriptions filled within 15 minutes.

Are Multiple Medications 
Driving You Mad?
We can pack your prescriptions 
in packets according to the way 
you take your medications.

Call us to find out how! 
817-406-4546

STATEPOINT

A new survey reveals 
that the mental health of 
American moms is going 
largely unattended, with 
many living under a near-
constant state of stress 
and few seeking support 
to ease the burden.

The research, commis-
sioned by MDLIVE, an 
Evernorth company and 
leading provider of virtual 
care services in the United 
States, finds that 33% of 
mothers feel stressed or 
overwhelmed by their re-
sponsibilities as a mom 
at least five days a week. 
Drivers of their stress 
and anxiety may include 
financial concerns, ripple 
effects of the pandemic, 
including the mental 
health crisis among teens, 
work responsibilities and 
being a caregiver simulta-
neously to both children 
and aging parents.

Yet, for many moms, 
the prospect of managing 
their mental health has 

IF MOMMA AIN’T HAPPY: A majority of moms feel the burden of managing busy 
families but few seek support to alleviate the stress.

PHOTO SOURCE: (C) WESTEND61 / GETTY IMAGES

Moms’ health crisis: what you need to know
become a source of stress 
in and of itself. For 37% 
of moms, concerns about 
their own mental health 
are among their biggest 
stressors, second only to 
finances (40%).

Possibly even more 
concerning is that 70% of 
moms admit to holding 
back their feelings and 
not telling their partner 
or family when they’re 
stressed, and 61% feel that 
they have no one to turn 
to or confide in for help.

“Our research shows 
that many moms are suf-
fering in silence and not 
getting the support they 
need,” says Dr. Shakira 
Espada-Campos, who 
brings more than two de-
cades of direct practice 
experience to her role as 
behavioral health medi-
cal director at MDLIVE. “I 
cannot stress enough how 
important it is for them to 
prioritize their own well-
being.”

To help moms man-

age their mental health, 
MDLIVE offers the fol-
lowing tips:

PRIORITIZE 
SELF-CARE

Recognize that practic-
ing self-care is not selfish. 
In addition to things like 
eating well, exercising, 
practicing good hygiene, 
getting enough sleep, and 
seeing a health care pro-
fessional routinely for 
preventive screenings and 
other care, self-care also 
means taking time to pur-
sue hobbies or personal 
interests that bring you 
pleasure or fulfillment or 
offer you a way to relax 
and unwind – activities 
you may have abandoned 
after having kids because 
it would mean time away 
from family responsibili-
ties. 

Practicing self-care puts 
one in a better position to 
help care for others be-
cause your own well-being 
is in check.

MAKE TIME 
TO CULTIVATE 
RELATIONSHIPS

Connecting with peo-
ple who are important to 
you is essential to mental 
health. Make it a priority 
to spend time with part-
ners, family, friends, col-
leagues, or anyone else 
who may be important to 
you, away from the house 
and kids, even if it’s just 
for a short period of time.

MANAGE STRESS 
AND ANXIETY

Seek help when strug-
gling to manage stress and 
anxiety: If your emotional 
state is interfering with 
your daily life – if you’re 
having difficulty control-
ling your mood, with-
drawing from loved ones, 

feeling fatigued, having 
trouble sleeping, lacking 
motivation, or frequently 
“zoning out” – it’s defi-
nitely time to seek profes-
sional help.

Acknowledging the im-
portance of mental health 
care, many health plans 
and employers have ex-
panded the resources 
available to their mem-
bers and employers in re-
cent years. New options 
include digital tools that 
can help with tracking 
mood, support medita-
tion, help build life skills, 
and provide self-care ad-
vice. 

Additionally, telehealth 
visits with behavioral 
health professionals offer 
private, convenient, qual-
ity care quickly. For exam-
ple, MDLIVE’s platform 

makes it easy to search 
for providers and sched-
ule appointments with 
one of their psychiatrists 
or licensed therapists. 
MDLIVE is a covered ben-
efit for more than 60 mil-
lion Americans through 
health insurers such as 
Cigna, Aetna, certain Blue 
Cross Blue Shield plans, 
and many regional and lo-
cal plans. 

“Although it’s natural 
to feel like you need to 
be a superhero, it takes a 
toll. You should never feel 
like you’re alone in your 
mental health journey or 
that you need to suffer in 
silence,” said Dr. Espada-
Campos.

To learn more or to regis-
ter, visit www.mdlive.com.
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Board Certified in 
Family Practice & 
specializes in 
Pediatrics, Women’s 
Health & Adult Medicine 

Gene 

McDaniel, D.O.
Nurse 
Practitioner, 
specializes in 
Adult Chronic 
Care

Aimee 

Simington, NP-C

Debbie 

McDougall, NP-C
Nurse Practitioner, 
specializing in 
Women’s Health and 
Family Practice.

Medical Care For 
The Entire Family 

Providing quality healthcare for Springtown & surrounding communities

You will be a patient, not a number.

Accepting Most Health Plans • Call For Information 

308 W. Hwy. 199 • Springtown

817-523-5402
Open Mon - Thurs 8 AM – 5 PM • Fri 8 AM – Noon

ACCEPTING NEW PATIENTS

VOTED BEST MEDICAL CLINIC & DOCTOR

FROM STAFF REPORTS 

Springtown Park Reha-
bilitation and Care Cen-
ter’s slogan is “Are you 
ready to feel better?” As 
the slogan suggests, staff 
at Springtown Park are 
dedicated to caring for pa-
tients and helping them 
live healthy lives. 

Springtown Park Reha-
bilitation and Care Cen-
ter opened on March 16, 
2021, and currently, the 
center has about 100 resi-
dents. Springtown Park 
is part of the Optimum 
Healthcare Management 
family, which has loca-

SPONSORED

Springtown Park Rehabilitation 
and Care Center staff aim to help 
patients feel better 

tions in North Texas and 
in Lubbock. 

“Our centers of excel-
lence deliver comprehen-
sive skilled nursing and 
rehabilitation services 
but what makes us special 
is our team,” according 
to Optimum Healthcare 
Management’s website. 
“Our team understands 
what it means to have a 
servant heart and we treat 
every resident with the 
highest level of dignity 
and respect.”

The Optimum family vi-
sion is to “seek to become 
the most sought after 

skilled nursing company 
in the state of Texas, for 
both residents and em-
ployees alike. We will do 
this because of the repu-
tation for excellence we 
will practice together. We 
will build a family atmo-
sphere that carries this re-
sponsibility together with 
great pride.”

Springtown Park Reha-
bilitation and Care Center 
provides short-term rehab 
to home programs, long-
term care, 24/7 skilled 
nursing care, state of the 
art therapy gym, IV an-
tibiotic therapy, wound 
care, orthopedic consult-

ing doctor, social services 
and discharge planning 
and physical, occupation-
al and speech therapy.

The center accepts 
Medicare and most insur-
ance plans. Private pay 
rates are private rooms for 
$200 per day and semi-
private rooms for $140 
per day. 

Springtown Park Reha-
bilitation and Care Center 
is located at 201 Williams-
Ward Road in Spring-
town. For more informa-
tion, call Springtown Park 
at 817-755-5116 or visit the 
website at https://spring-
townparkrehab.com/. 
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*Annual Percentage Yield (APY) effective 5/31/2022. CDs offered by Edward Jones are bank-issued and 
FDIC-insured up to $250,000 (principal and interest accrued but not yet paid) per depositor, per insured 
depository institution, for each account ownership category. Please visit www.fdic.gov or contact your 
financial advisor for additional information. Subject to availability and price change. CD values are 
subjectc to interest rate risk such that when interest rates rise, the prices of CDs can decrease. If CDs 
are sold prior to maturity, the investory can lose principal value. FDIC insuance does not cover losses 
in market value. Early withdrawal may not be permitted. Yields quoted are net of all commissions. CDs 
require the distribution of interest and do not allow interest to compound. CDs offered through Edward 
Jones are issued by banks and thrifts nationwide. All CDs sold by Edward Jones are registered with the 
Depository Trust Corp. (DTC.)

Call or visit your local financial advisor today.

Compare our CD Rates
Bank-issued, FDIC-insured

FDI-1867K-A © EDWARD D. JONES & CO., L.P., ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.

Carolyn Rocha, CFP®, AAMS®

Financial Advisor

825 E. Hwy. 199, Suite 101 Springtown 

817-523-3196

> edwardjones.com | Member SIPC

APY* APY* APY*

1-year

2.20%

Minimum deposit 
$1,000.00

2-year

2.80%

Minimum deposit 
$1,000.00

5-year

3.15%

Minimum deposit 
$1,000.00

State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company

Bloomington, IL
1101399TX.1

Plan for the 
unexpected 
when you’re 
healthy.

Haley Carter, Agent
408 Boyd Ct., 

Azle, TX 76020
Bus: 817-444-1100

haley@haleycarter.com

Ask me how these State Farm 
Mutual Automobile Insurance 
Company health products can 
protect you if you become ill, 
or get injured and are 
unable to work:

• Disability Insurance

•  Hospital Income Insurance

• Supplemental Insurance

Like a good neighbor, 
State Farm is there.
CALL ME TODAY.

We  offer Nationwide farm and ranch 
insurance and would welcome the 
chance to discuss it with you.

Albracht Harwood Insurance Inc 
817-220-4700 
info@albrachtharwoodinsurance.com 

It’s great to be part of 
a farm community.

*A.M. Best Market Share Report 2017
Products underwritten by Nationwide Mutual Insurance Company and 
affiliated  companies, Columbus, OH. Products, coverages, terms and 
discounts may vary by state. Nationwide and the Nationwide N and 
Eagle are service marks of Nationwide Mutual Insurance 
Company. © 2022 Nationwide GPO-0292AO.3 16459813 (06/22)

We have the #1 farm insurer* 
with over 100 years of 
experience in agriculture 
behind us. They help us 
offer you top of the line 
protection for your farm 
or ranch operation, with 
flexible coverages and exceptional claims, 
underwriting and risk management services.

FROM STAFF REPORTS

Dr. Brooke Porter, 
owner of Azle Dental Care 
understands that a lot of 
people have stayed away 
from the dentist because 
of fear. But her team has 
gone above and beyond to 
ensure they can give you a 
comfortable experience.

The staff at Azle Dental 
Care wants you to know 
you’re in capable hands 
and have nothing to worry 
about when visiting their 
office.

There are three dentists 
at the office: Dr. Porter, 
Dr. Marr and Dr. Myers. 
Each doctor has their own 
specialty, and they are 
ready to address any den-
tal issues you have.

At Azle Dental Care, the 
staff understands that you 
are not just a number, and 
each patient is different, 
with individual needs and 
they take pride in tailor-
ing treatment specifically 
for you.

Dr. Porter, as well as 
her staff, is dedicated to 
supporting our commu-
nity. They work with the 
Community Caring Cen-
ter, Servolution and the 

Azle Dental Care is located at 912 Boyd Road. Call (817) 444-173 or visit www.SmileGreat.com to schedule an 
appointment. Pictured above is Dr. Brooke Porter with one of her state-of-the-art 3D imagining machines.  

Azle Dental Care gives you local 
top-quality treatment

SPONSORED

Azle Independent School 
District regularly, going 
above and beyond to make 
a difference.

The office also offers 
“Free Dental Day” once 
a year. This event caters 
to those patients who are 
otherwise unable to af-
ford treatment, and they 
serve an average of 20-40 
Azleites in that single day. 
Services include extrac-
tions, fillings and cleanings. 
The goal is to keep teeth 
healthy and keep you out of 
pain. It is just another way 
they are committed to serv-
ing the community.

Azle Dental Care is open 
every weekday for your 
convenience. Monday- 
Wednesday from 7 a.m. 
to 5 p.m., Thursday from 
7 a.m. to 3 p.m. and Fri-
day from 8:30 a.m. to 1:30 
p.m. They are located at 
912 Boyd Rd in Azle, right 
across from Subway. Call 
the office and schedule an 
appointment today at 817-
444-1763 or visit www.
smilegreat.com.

A great smile awaits 
you.

STATEWIDE

Organic is a labeling 
term that indicates that 
the food or other agricul-
tural product has been 
produced through ap-
proved methods. These 
methods integrate cultur-
al, biological and mechan-
ical practices that foster 
cycling of resources, pro-
mote ecological balance, 
and conserve biodiversity. 
Synthetic fertilizers, sew-
age sludge, irradiation, 
and genetic engineering 
may not be used. 

HOW ARE ORGANIC 
PRODUCTS 
OVERSEEN? 

The National Organic 
Program regulates all or-
ganic crops, livestock, 
and agricultural products 
certified to the United 
States Department of Ag-
riculture (USDA) organic 
standards. USDA also 
conducts oversight of or-
ganic certification, com-
pliance and enforcement 
activities, and product 
labeling. In order to sell, 
label or represent their 
products as organic, op-

Straight talk about ‘organic’ foods
erations must follow all 
of the specifications set 
out by the USDA organic 
regulations. 

HOW DO I KNOW 
IF MY FOOD IS 
ORGANIC? 

Look at the label. If you 
see the USDA organic seal 
( ), the product is certified 
organic and has 95 per-
cent or more organic con-
tent. For multi-ingredient 
products such as bread or 
soup, if the label claims 
that it is made with speci-
fied organic ingredients, 
you can be confident that 
those specific ingredients 
have been certified or-
ganic. 

WHAT ABOUT 
OTHER LABELS? 

Other voluntary labels 
for livestock products, e.g. 
meat and eggs, include: 
Free-range

This label indicates that 
the flock was provided 
shelter in a building, room 
or area with unlimited ac-
cess to food, fresh water 
and continuous access to 
the outdoors during their 

production cycle. The out-
door area may or may not 
be fenced and/or covered 
with netting-like material. 
This label is regulated by 
the USDA. 
Cage-free

This label indicates that 
the flock was able to freely 
roam a building, room or 
enclosed area with un-
limited access to food and 
fresh water during their 
production cycle. 

Natural

As required by USDA, 
meat, poultry and egg 
products labeled as “natu-
ral” must be minimally 
processed and contain 
no artificial ingredients. 
However, the natural la-
bel does not include any 
standards regarding farm 
practices and only applies 
to processing of meat and 
egg products. There are no 
standards or regulations 
for the labeling of natural 
food products if they do 
not contain meat or eggs. 

Grass-fed

Grass-fed animals re-
ceive a majority of their 

nutrients from grass 
throughout their life, 
while organic animals’ 
pasture diet may be sup-
plemented with grain. 
Also USDA regulated, the 
grass-fed label does not 
limit the use of antibiotics, 
hormones or pesticides. 
Meat products may be la-
beled as grass-fed organic.

Pasture-raised

Due to the number of 
variables involved in pas-
ture-raised agricultural 
systems, the USDA has 
not developed a labeling 
policy for pasture-raised 
products. 

Humane

Multiple labeling pro-
grams make claims that 
animals were treated hu-
manely during the pro-
duction cycle, but the ver-
ification of these claims 
varies widely. These la-
beling programs are not 
regulated.

Source: USDA.gov

Free range eggs means that the flock was provided shelter in a building, room, 
or area with unlimited access to food, fresh water, and continuous access to the 
outdoors during their production cycle. 
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Feel Better. Live Well.

1715 Martin Drive •  Weatherford, TX 76086 •  P 817-458-3100  •  F 817-599-3101  •  CollegeParkRehab.com

PRIVATE PAY RATES 140 Semi-Private  |   200 Private

Private Suites Available  |  Newest Building in Weatherford  |  Rehab-to-Home Programs  |  Orthopedic Consulting Doctor

Advanced Wound Care/ IV Antibiotics  |  Physical, Occupational & Speech Therapy

 Long-Term Medicaid Beds Available  |  Accepting Medicare & Most Insurance Plans

Feel Better. Live Well.

201 Williams Ward Rd  •  Springtown, TX 76082  •  P 817-755-5116  •  F 817-394-5820  •  SpringtownParkRehab.com

PRIVATE PAY RATES 140 Semi-Private  |   200 Private

Long-Term Care  |  24/7 Skilled Nursing Care  |  State of the Art Therapy Gym  |  Short-Term Rehab to Home Programs

Physical, Occupational, & Speech Therapy   |  Wound Care  |  IV Antibiotic Therapy  |  Orthopedic Consulting Doctor

Social Services & Discharge Planning  |  Accepting Medicare & Most Insurance Plans
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PROUDLY HELPING AZLE SAFELY SMILE FOR OVER TWENTY YEARS

912 Boyd Rd  • SmileGreat.com
Call Us Today 817-444-1763

The American Dental Association estimates that about 20% of the population does not see a dentist because of fear and anxiety. 
A dentist has two paths to address these concerns: anxiety addressing medication or sedation.

What is “Anxiety-free” dentistry? 
Every dentist at Azle Dental Care can provide oral medications to take the “edge off” a patient’s anxiety. As an extra option, 
each of our dentists are certified to provide patients inhalation agents in-office like nitrous oxide (laughing gas.)

What about Sedation Dentistry? 
Sedation dentistry is when intravenous sedation or general anesthesia is used to sedate a patient. Only a doctor with anesthesia 
training can perform intravenous sedation. We have a general anesthesiologist who works in conjunction with our dentists twice 
a month for all sedation cases.

When using either oral medication or sedation, will I feel any discomfort after the procedure? 
In both cases, there will be some tenderness in the proceeding hours. Our doctors provide a 24-hour emergency number to help 
patients manage discomfort after any dental visit. 

“Anxiety-free” & Sedation Dentistry

Implants are the closest replacement for your natural teeth available. Over the last few years, implants have become a more 
economical choice for patients who want to keep their teeth.

What are dental implants?

Using the same principle and material used in joint replacement surgery, our lead dentist, Dr. Porter is certified to securely anchor dental 
implants into bone. The implant post is then attached to either a single or multiple replacement teeth. Dr. Porter is finding high success in 
anchoring patients full-mouth dentures as well.

What would dental implants feel like in my mouth?

Implants feel more comfortable, secure, and more natural than removable tooth replacements such as a partial or a denture.

Will implants slip out of my mouth like my dentures?

No, implants give you the confidence to laugh and smile with ease.

Dental Implants

Are your front teeth poorly spaced, stained, chipped, or crooked? Let’s talk about veneers.

What are they?

Veneers are strong, thin shells of acrylic or porcelain, which are bonded to the front of your teeth.

How much time and money is involved?

Veneers are economical and can usually be applied in two office visits.

How long will they last?

Veneers last for years and are very resistant to stains and chipping.

Veneers

Would you like a whiter, brighter smile? Achieve it with Whitening!

How is it done?

Dr. Porter or one of her associate doctors will apply either a whitening gel during an office visit or give you a custom-fitted tray 
to wear in the comfort of your own home.

Will it last?

Whitened teeth can re-stain with exposure to staining agents or darken over time. If so, touch-ups can help maintain your 
smile at its brightest!

How long does it take?

It depends on the severity of the discoloration. You may notice a difference after only a few applications.

Whitening

AZLE DENTAL CARE
BROOKE PORTER, D.D.S. & ASSOCIATES

Call us to get your own great smile started!


