
         Volume 123, Number 41     Gainesboro, Tennessee, Tuesday, October 13, 2020   1 Section, 8 Pages

SCHOOL LIFESTYLES

JCHS celebrates homecoming.

       See page  5

Granville fall celebration held 

       See page  8
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OFFICE HOURS 

Monday 8 a.m. - 5 p.m.

Tuesday Closed

Wednesday Closed

Thursday 1:15 p.m. to 5 p.m.

Friday 1:15 p.m. to 5 p.m.

Contact 268-9725 or 

Email jcsentineloffice@twlakes.net

Early Voting To Start Oct. 14

Early voting in the 
Nov. 3 election starts to-
morrow.

Jackson County Ad-
ministrator of Elections 
Clay Thaxton says early 
voting is open to all vot-
ers beginning tomorrow 
and will run through Oct. 
29.

Thaxton is expecting 
the election cycle to be 
busier than usual.

He expressed that 
there has been an increase 
of registered voters in the 
county, and he has seen a 
large increase in the num-
ber of absentee ballots re-
quested.

“We have seen the 
number of absentee bal-
lot requests nearly dou-
ble,” Thaxton said. “We 
normally see around 150 
absentee ballots, but this 
election we have had 285 
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so far.”
According to Thax-

ton, nearly 700 new vot-
ers have registered in the 
county, bringing the num-
ber of eligible voters up to 
8,233.

“This is a huge in-
crease for us,” he said. 
“Everyone is out to vote, 
and that is a good thing. 
We are hoping to see 
many more people take 
advantage of early vot-
ing.”

He explained that the 
best thing about early vot-
ing is its convenience.

“We strongly encour-
age people to early vote,” 
Thaxton said. “It’s a real 
easy way of doing it. You 
get to (vote) at your con-
venience and don’t have 
to worry about what the 
weather is going to be like 
or the lines are going to be 
like on Election Day, and 
with what’s going on with 
COVID-19, it’s a really 

easy way to aid in social 
distancing.”

Early voting hours will 
be 8 a.m. until 4 p.m. on 
Monday, Tuesday, Thurs-
day and Friday at the 
Courthouse. On Wednes-
day and Saturday, voting 
hours will be 8 a.m. un-
til noon. This will be the 
only location available 
for early voting.

In this election cycle, 
residents will be voting 
in the federal election as 
well as state.

For the U.S. House Of 
Representatives race, vot-
ers can vote for Republi-
can candidate John Rose 
or Democratic Candidate 
Christopher Finley. Vot-
ers will also be voting for 
candidates vying for a seat 
in the U.S. Senate, Demo-
cratic Candidate Marquita 
Bradshaw and Republican 
Candidate Bill Hagerty.

In addition to the 
federal race, voters can 

expect to vote for an un-
opposed candidate run-
ning as Tennessee State 
Representative in District 
41, Democrat John Mark 
Windle.

Thaxton asked that 
during early voting and 
on Election Day vot-
ers refrain from wearing 
clothing that could be 
perceived as campaign 
material. What you wear 
to the polls on Election 
Day could prevent you 
from voting.

A sample ballot of all 
of the elections and can-
didates vying for seats in 
federal, state and local of-
fice can be found at jack-
soncotn.com or refer back 
to last week’s edition of 
the Sentinel. Thaxton also 
informed that on election 
night, updates will be giv-
en live on that website.

For more information, 
you can call the election 
office at (931) 268-9284. 

The Tennessee De-
partment of Education 
announced seven Educa-
tor Preparation Programs 
will be awarded Grow 
Your Own Competitive 
Grants to form or expand 
state-recognized Grow 
Your Own Partnerships 
to increase access and 
remove barriers to the 
teaching profession. 

The Grow Your Own 
Competitive Grant funds 
partnerships between 
Educator Preparation 
Providers (EPPs) and Lo-
cal Education Agencies 
(LEAs) to provide inno-
vative, no-cost pathways 
to the teaching profession 

J.C. Schools Partner With Tech
by increasing EPP enroll-
ment and growing the 
supply of qualified teach-
ers. 

“We are thrilled with 
the response from our 
educator preparation pro-
grams,” said Commis-
sioner Penny Schwinn. 
“Thanks to their inno-
vative plans, the Grow 
Your Own initiative will 
expand across the state 
and support hundreds of 
individuals to become 
teachers for free—while 
employed in our Tennes-
see school districts. Right 
now, it could not be more 
important to remove bar-
riers to the teaching pro-

fession, and I am proud of 
the way our state is com-
ing together to continue 
preparing great teachers 
in innovative ways.” 

The department’s 
Grow Your Own initia-
tive seeks to increase 
access to and success in 
the teaching profession 
as part of the Best for All 
strategic plan, which sets 
a vision for Tennessee to 
be the top state to become 
and remain a teacher and 
leader. 

The following seven 
EPPs will be awarded 
Grow Your Own Compet-
itive Grants of $100,000 
each, totaling $2 million 

dollars: Austin Peay State 
University, four grants; 
Lincoln Memorial Uni-
versity, three grants; Lip-
scomb University, two 
grants; Tennessee State 
University, four grants; 
Tennessee Tech Univer-
sity, five grants; Univer-
sity of Tennessee Chat-
tanooga, one grant; and 
University of Tennessee 
Knoxville, one grant. 

These competitive 
grant awards build upon 
ongoing Grow Your Own 
partnerships at the Uni-

JCHS Celebrates Homecoming 
Jackson County 

Commission Meeting 
September 21, 2020
The Honorable Legis-

lative Body of the Jack-
son County Commission 
met in Regular Session 
on Monday, Sept. 21, at 
7 p.m. in the large court-
room of the Jackson 
County Courthouse. The 
Honorable Marty Hinson, 
Sheriff, opened the court 
promptly at 7 p.m. The 
Honorable Paul Ballard 
offered the invocation. 
All in attendance led the 
Pledge of Allegiance.

The Chief Deputy 
Clerk Brandon C. Stafford 
calls the roll: 16 commis-
sioners were present, with 
Commissioners Chris 
Carter and Josh Locke be-
ing absent. A quorum was 
established and the meet-
ing began.

Approval of Minutes 
of Previous Meeting: A 
motion was made by Com-
missioner Glenda Mayber-
ry and seconded by Com-
missioner Troy York to 
approve the minutes from 
the previous meeting. All 
16 commissioners present 
voted “Aye” and the mo-
tion carried.

Election of Chairman: 
The Commission appoints 
a chairman for the next 
year. Commissioner Joey 
Denson opened the floor 
to nominations. Commis-
sioner Tim Agee nominat-
ed Mayor Randy Heady 
and this was seconded by 
Commissioner Don Chi-
noy. There was no other 
nominations and Commis-
sioner Shelby Fox enter-
tained a motion that nomi-
nations cease and Mayor 
Randy be elected Chair-
man by acclamation, this 
was seconded by Com-
missioner Doug Stafford. 
All 16 Commissioners 

Washer Funding 
Resolution  Passed

present voted “Aye” and 
the motion carried.

Election of Chair Pro 
Temp: Mayor Randy 
Heady opened the floor 
for nominations. Commis-
sioner Brian Lee nomi-
nated Commissioner Joey 
Denson as chair pro temp. 
Mayor Heady entertained 
a motion that all nomi-
nations cease, and Joey 
Denson be elected chair 
pro temp by acclamation. 
Commissioner Glenda 
Mayberry made the mo-
tion and was seconded by 
Commissioner Thomas 
Wilmoth. All 16 com-
missioners present voted 
“Aye” and the motion car-
ried.

Budget Amendment 
for Highway Insurance 
Reimbursement: When 
Insurance began in 2015, 
it was decided to offer all 
county employees who 
did not have insurance, to 
offer them insurance and 
this included the highway 
department. Since then, 
the highway department 
pays the employees’ in-
surance out of their bud-
get and this is reimbursed 
by the county. This occurs 
twice per year. During the 
audit, this was determined 
to be improper procedure. 
The audit advised a trans-
fer out method and this 
will accomplish this. This 
will be in the amount of 
$25,000 to other funds. 
This will correct an au-
dit finding for next year. 
Commissioner Troy York 
made a motion to approve 
and this was seconded by 
Commissioner Don Chi-
noy. All 16 commissioners 
present voted “Aye” and 
the motion carried.

Please See
Resolution Passed Pg. 3

Homecoming – Pictured is the JCHS football team in the homecoming parade. SENTINEL Photo / Darlene Dean

A Hilham woman was 
captured in California on 
Friday night in relation to 
a double ho-
micide that 
took place in 
Tompkins-
ville, Ky.

As pre-
viously re-
ported in 
the Jackson 
County Sentinel, Kayla 
Spivey, 28 of the Hilham 
community, had an active 
arrest warrant for two 
counts of complicity to 
commit murder.

Edward Whiteledge, 
29 of Bakersfield, Calif., 
had an active arrest war-
rant for two counts of 
murder.

Local Woman Caught
According to Ken-

tucky State Police reports, 
officers responded to a 
residence on White Oak 
Ridge Road 
in the Foun-
tain Run 
Community 
in refer-
ence to two 
d e c e a s e d 
males be-
ing located 
inside the residence with 
apparent gunshot wounds 
to the head.

The victims are Trev-
or Cleary, 20 of Tomp-
kinsville, Ky., and Austin 
Copas, 19 of Fountain 
Run, Ky.

The motive is still 
unclear at this time, how-
ever Kentucky authorities 
report that the killing was 
“execution-style.”

Edward 
Whiteledge

Kayla 
Spivey  
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Brown’s Recycling
1500 Shepardsville Hwy., 

Granville, TN 38564
Monday-Friday 7:00-4:00

Saturday	7:00-4:00	•	Sunday	1:00-4:00

We buy all scrap 

aluminum & metal
Roll	off	container	bins	available	for	landfill

 & scrap metal

Office (931) 653-4355 • Cell (931) 510-4138

From Gainesboro, take Hwy. 56 South, turn right on Shepardsville 
Hwy./290,	go	8	miles	and	turn	left	at	1500	Shepardsville	Hwy.

3 Rooms Carpet and Pad

$69900
Installed

based on 468
sq. ft. plus
tax, see store
for details

Bowman’s Carpet Outlet
275 S. Willow Ave.

931-528-5728

FINANCING

AVAILABLE

Editor’s Note: Court 
results are taken from 
court records. Persons in 
the community may have 
similar names. Every ef-
fort is taken to ensure 
accuracy and complete-
ness.

Jackson County 
General Sessions 

Court Docket
Oct. 8, 2020

Judge Tiffany Gentry 
Gipson Presiding
Jermaine K. McFail – 

DUI first offense, person 
under 21 having beer in 
possession and transport-
ing beer, open container 
and driving on roadways 
laned for traffic.

Aaron J. Moore – 
Driving while license 
suspended and speeding.

Darrell Stewart – As-
sault/threat of bodily in-
jury and probation viola-
tion.

Bradley S. Spivey – 
Possession of a handgun/
convicted felon.

Delia E. Stewart – 
Aggravated assault and 

assault/threat of bodily 
injury.

Lindsey D. Woodard-
Stewart – Aggravated 
assault and assault/threat 
of bodily injury.

Ruben E. Blanco Jr. 
– DUI first offense and 
simple possession/casual 
exchange/marijuana less 
than 1/2 oz.

Cody L. Curtis 
– Meth/manufac-
ture/deliver/sale/
possession with 
intent, DUI first 
offense, implied 
consent, simple 
possession/ca-
sual exchange/
marijuana less 
than 1/2 oz., 
possession 
u n l a w f u l 
drug para-
phernalia 
uses and 
a c t i v i -
ties, drivers 
license to be carried and 
exhibited, display of reg-
istration plates, financial 
responsibility law, driv-

ing on roadways laned 
for traffic and driving 
unregistered vehicle on 
highway.

Jacob S. Flatt – Dis-
play of registration 
plates.

Jacob Stephen Flatt 
– Driving without li-
cense.

Joshua C. Jones - 
Meth/manufacture/de-

liver/sale/possession 
with intent, simple 

possession/casual 
exchange/mari-

juana less than 
1/2 oz., driving 
while license 
suspended/
non resident 
and light 
law/motor 
vehicle.

D a v i d 
A. Mar-
tinez – 
Dr iv ing 

while license suspend-
ed.

Dylan Scott Thomp-
son – Allowing dog to 
run at large.

Choya-Kane E. 
Wilder – Reckless en-
dangerment/no weapon 
involved, resist stop/ar-
rest/search/no weapon 
and public intoxication.

Angela F. Anders – 

Aggravated assault.
Jonathan Dillion – 

Aggravated kidnapping, 
aggravated robbery and 
probation violation.

Loren A. Dyer – 
Meth/manufacture/de-
liver/sale/possession 
with intent, evading ar-
rest and driving while 
license suspended.

Darrell Stewart – 
Driving while license 
suspended and simple 
possession/casual ex-
change.

Shawn Strahn – Do-
mestic assault.

Editor’s Note: The 
Jackson County Sheriff’s 
report is obtained from 
the Jackson County Sher-
iff’s Department and is a 
matter of public record. 
The Sentinel appreciates 
the cooperation from the 
Jackson County Sheriff’s 
Department in provid-
ing the report and we 
hope the printing of this 
report helps as a deter-
rent in criminal activity. 
All subjects are innocent 
until proven guilty in a 
court of law.

Sheriff’s Report
On Oct. 2, Loren Ash-

ley Dyer was arrested on 
warrants for evading ar-

rest, manufacture/deliv-
er/sale or possession of 
methamphetamine and 
driving while license 
canceled, suspended or 
revoked.

On Oct. 3, Darrell 
Gean Thomas Stewart 
was arrested on warrants 
for driving on suspended 
and assault.

On Oct. 3, Delia Elise 
Stewart was arrested on 
warrants for aggravated 
assault and assault.

On Oct. 3, Lindsey 
Dawn Woodard-Stewart 
was arrested on warrants 
for assault and aggravat-
ed assault.

On Oct. 4, Jermaine 
Kamron McFail was ar-
rested on warrants for 
driving under the influ-
ence, alcohol/violation 
of open container laws 
and violation alcoholic 
beverage laws.

On Oct. 6, Sonia 
Nicole Boyington was 
arrested on warrants 
for possession of drug 
paraphernalia, violation 
of probation, failure to 
appear and violation of 
probation.

On Oct. 7, Bradley 
Shane Spivey was ar-
rested on a warrant for 
failure to appear.

Jerry Wayne Phillips 
and Sharon Kay Phillips 
to Ralph Clark, Sandra 
Clark, Jonathan M. Wil-
son, Sarah Wilson, Floyd 
M. Gregory Jr. and Betty 
Gregory, 3rd District.

Andrea Hawkins 
Stone, Shalane Hawk-
ins Ragsdale, Cameron 
Hawkins and Linda 
Hawkins, Deceased to 
Jessie D. Hodge and Wen-
dell Dewayne Hodge, 1st 
District.

Sherri Kemp Wil-
lis, Betsy Kemp Wil-
lis, Cindy Kemp Parker, 
Estate of Lanita Kemp, 
Kenneth Kemp, Louise 
Kemp, Peggy Kemp Dy-
cus Pharris, Karen Kemp 
Holladay, Patricia Agee 
and Mark Dycus to Ni-
colas Jones and Samuel 
Jones, 4th District.

Knute S. Spivey to 
Bobby W. Lee and Ellen 
Michelle Lee, 10th Dis-
trict.

Tennessee Tech alum-
nus and Board of Trustees 
member Barry Wilmore 
is returning to space. 
The NASA astronaut will 
command NASA’s Boe-
ing Crew Flight Test, the 
inaugural crewed flight 
of the CST-100 Starliner 
launching to the Interna-
tional Space Station in 
2021.

“This is a test flight. 
The first flight of this 
space craft. These don’t 
come around very often,” 
said Wilmore. “To have 
the opportunity to step in 
and be the commander of 
the first flight is a great 
opportunity.”

A native of Mt. Ju-
liet, Wilmore earned 
bachelor’s and master’s 
degrees in electrical en-
gineering from Tech, and 
has served on the Tech 
Board of Trustees since 
2017. His commitment 
to the university was 
recently recognized by 
Gov. Bill Lee, who reap-
pointed Wilmore to the 
board through 2026. 

Wilmore is a retired 
captain in the U.S. Navy, 
with more than 7,800 
flight hours and 663 car-
rier landings in tactical 
jet aircraft. He was se-
lected as an astronaut in 
2000.

He has spent a total 
of 178 days in space over 
the course of two mis-
sions. In 2009, he served 
as the pilot of space shut-
tle Atlantis on STS-129, 
helping to deliver 14 
tons of spare parts for the 

Wilmore To Command Crew Flight Test
space station. In 2014, he 
returned to the space sta-
tion via a Russian Soyuz 
spacecraft for a 167-day 
mission, during which 
he performed four space-
walks.

“I enjoyed the other 
missions and I was an 
important part of them,” 
said Wilmore. “But, to 
command a launch vehi-
cle is really why I came to 
NASA from the Navy.”

Wilmore has been 
training side-by-side 
with the crew since being 
named the sole backup 
for all flight positions in 
July 2018. On Wednes-
day it was announced 
that Wilmore would re-
place Boeing astronaut 
Chris Ferguson, who has 
decided not to fly for per-
sonal reasons. Wilmore 
will now shift his focus 
specifically to the space-
craft commander’s du-
ties in preparation for the 

flight to the space station. 
The flight is designed to 
test the end-to-end capa-
bilities of the new Star-
liner system.

“It’s all about the 
mission,” said Wilmore. 
“The first time I flew was 
the space shuttle, taking a 
lot of cargo to the space 
station. The second time 
I launched on a Russian 
Soyuz and was the com-
mander of the space sta-
tion. Two very different 
missions. The first one 
was just under two weeks 
and the second one was 
six months. This one we 
don’t know how long it 
will be, but we are train-
ing for a long flight.”

Wilmore was a letter-
man and team captain of 
the Tennessee Tech foot-
ball team and was induct-
ed into the university’s 
Sports Hall of Fame in 
2003. He currently holds 
the number two spot in 

Boeing Starliner – NASA astronaut Barry “Butch” Wilmore, left, and Chris 
Ferguson, director of Mission Integration and Operations at Boeing, train for 
the	first	flight	of	Boeing’s	CST-100	Starliner	spacecraft,	which	will	carry	astro-
nauts	to	the	International	Space	Station	as	part	of	NASA’s	Commercial	Crew	
Program.

Tech’s record books for 
most tackles in a game, 
and number three on 
tackles per season.

As a member of 
Tech’s Board of Trustees, 
Wilmore attended the 
quarterly meeting held 
on campus last week, 
serving on the Academ-
ic and Student Affairs 
Committee. He says now 
that he is the commander 
of this upcoming flight, 
his schedule will change 
somewhat.

“Right now we are 
scheduled to launch no 
earlier than  June 25, 2021. 
There is an uncrewed test 
launch in December or 
January,” Wilmore said. 
“As a backup, I was not 
required to be at certain 
places at certain times. 
As the commander, I 
will have to be there. My 
whole year will be differ-
ent but I’m excited about 
it.”
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118 East First St. • Cookeville, TN
931-528-6403 • 800-339-2899

Mon-Thurs: 8 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Fri: 8 a.m. to noon

Please call to schedule a free 
consultation. There is no fee 
unless you win your case.

Social Security

Disability
Need help with your claim?

Melaney G.
Madewell

118 East First St. • Cookeville, TN
931-528-6403 • 800-339-2899

Mon-Thurs: 8 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Fri: 8 a.m. to noon

Attorney-at-Law
Please call to schedule a free 
consultation. There is no fee 
unless you win your case.

Resolution Passed 
Continued From Page 1

Budget Amendment 
for EMIF (Electronic 
Monitoring Image Fund): 
This was not included 
in the current budget as 
agreed upon. If the county 
supplies $1,500, the state 
will match that amount. 
Judge Gipson has been us-
ing this as an alternative to 
incarceration to those who 
qualify. Commissioner 
Thomas Wilmoth made a 
motion to approve and this 
was seconded by Com-
missioner Josh Denson. 
15 commissioners present 
voted “Aye” and Commis-
sioner Shelby Fox voted 
no. The motion carried.

Budget Amendment for 
the County Clerk’s office: 
The insurance reimburse-
ment was received for 
$40,514.33 from missing 
funds and another $10,000 
in restitution. These mon-
ies were paid to the may-
or’s office and needs to be 
transferred to the county 
clerk’s budget to be paid 
to the appropriate entities. 
All of the money owed to 
the state for various fees is 
now paid. Commissioner 
Tim Agee made a motion 
to approve and this was 
seconded by Commis-
sioner Joey Denson. All 
16 commissioners present 
voted “Aye” and the mo-
tion carried. 

New Washer Fund-
ing Resolution: The jail’s 
washing machine needs 
replacing. This was not in-
cluded in the budget. The 
funds are available due to 
excess in buying police 
cars and ambulance out 
of the 171 Capital Proj-
ects Budget. The budget 
committee has already in 
the possession of the jail. 
Commissioner Thomas 
Wilmoth approved this 
motion and it was sec-
onded by Commissioner 
Anthony Buck. All 16 
Commissioners present 
voted “Aye” and the mo-
tion carried.

New Library Board 
Members: Mr. George 
Cassetty and Ray Han-
sen are due to rotate off 
the board leaving two 
open seats. The Library 
Board voted and nomi-
nated Matthew Scoggins 
and Brandon Korgan to 
the Board. Commissioner 
Doug Stafford approved 

J.C. Schools
Continued From Page 1

versity of Tennessee, 
Knoxville, Austin Peay 
State University, and 
Lipscomb University. 

“We are so excited 
to be a Grow Your Own 
partner and are grateful 
to the department for se-
lecting Tennessee Tech 
for this work,” said Lisa 
Zagumny, dean, College 
of Education at Ten-
nessee Tech University. 
“We know this invest-
ment will have such an 
impact across Middle 
Tennessee and help build 
a strong pipeline of great 
teachers right in our own 
communities.” 

“UTC is thrilled to 
be selected as one of 
the Grow Your Own 
awardees and thankful 
to the Tennessee De-
partment of Education 
for the award,” said 
Renee Murley, director, 
School of Education at 
the University of Ten-
nessee, Chattanooga. 
“Our partnerships with 
Hamilton and Marion 
Counties, through this 
initiative, allows us to 
further strengthen our 
collaborative efforts to 
increase diversity and 
prepare highly effective 
teachers.” 

EPPs applied for 
the competitive grant 
by submitting plans for 
partnerships with at least 
one district, although 
many applications in-
volved more than one. 
EPPs could also submit 
more than one applica-
tion. Based on these 
awards, there will be 
Grow Your Own part-
nerships with the follow-
ing 35 districts, enabling 
262 individuals to be-
come a teacher for free 
and get paid to do so: 
Alcoa City Schools; An-
derson County Schools; 
Bedford County De-
partment of Education; 
Blount County Schools; 
Cheatham County; 
Clarksville-Montgom-
ery County; Dickson 
County; Fayetteville 
City Schools; Grundy 
County Schools; Ham-
ilton County Schools; 
Hawkins County 
Schools; Haywood 
County Schools; Hick-
man County; Jackson 
County Schools; Knox 
County Schools; Lenoir 
City Schools; Loudon 
County Schools; Mar-
ion County Schools; 
Maryville City Schools; 
Metro Nashville Public 
Schools; Moore County 
Schools; Oak Ridge City 
Schools; Overton County 
Schools; Putnam Coun-
ty Schools; Robertson 
County; Sevier County 
Schools; Shelby County 
Schools; Tipton County 
Schools; Tullahoma City 
Schools; Union County 
Public Schools; Warren 
County Schools; Wayne 
County Board of Edu-
cation; White County 
Schools; Williamson 
County Schools; and 
Wilson County Schools. 

“We are thankful 
for the State in provid-
ing these funds,” said 
Danny Weeks, director 
of Schools for Dickson 
County. “We are proud 
to partner with Aus-
tin Peay State Univer-
sity and Nashville State 
Community College to 
serve our community.” 

“Jackson County 
Schools is excited to be 
working with Tennessee 
Tech as part of the Grow 
Your Own initiative,” 
said Kristy Brown, di-
rector of Schools. “This 

Ernest “Pappy” 
Fields, Jr.

Ernest “Pappy” 
Fields, Jr., 71, of Buffalo 
Valley, passed away Oct. 
6 at Cookeville Regional 
Medical Center. Funeral 
services were held Oct. 9 
from the chapel of Pres-
ley Funeral Home with 
Bro. Chris Ramsey of-
ficiating. Interment fol-
lowed in the Flatt and 
Woolbright Cemetery in 
Gainesboro.

He was the owner of 
E & S Market in Bax-
ter for many years. He 
enjoyed life as a farmer 
and always liked to go 
riding, looking at deer. 
He loved hunting and 
fishing and was a mem-
ber of the Buffalo Valley 
Church of Christ.

He was preceded in 
death by: wife, Shir-
ley Williams; paternal 
grandparents, Benton 
and Maddie Fields; ma-
ternal grandparents, Ed 
and Sina Flatt Stout and 
Carrie Grogan Stout; 
parents, Houston and 
Pirley Fields; brother, 
Harold Fields; and sister, 
Roise Jean Smith.

Surviving relatives 
include: sister, Sue May-
berry of Buffalo Valley; 
brothers, Bro. Bennie 
(Vicki) Fields, Charles 
(Deborah) Fields and 
Lewis (Reba) Fields, all 
of Chestnut Mound; and 
a host of aunts, uncles, 
nieces and nephews.

Crest Lawn Funeral 

Home was in charge of 
arrangements.

is an incredible opportu-
nity for our district and 
state to develop great 
teachers and fulfill criti-
cal needs in our class-
rooms.” 

This $2 million grant 
opportunity removes 
barriers to the teaching 
profession by providing 
funds to entirely cover 
tuition, textbooks and 
fees for all selected par-
ticipants. In addition, 
GYO partnerships will 
increase the number of 
qualified teachers with 
high-demand licensures 
by providing participants 
with a no-cost education 
resulting in dual licen-
sure or initial licensure 
with additional endorse-
ment to include grade 
or subject certification 
and special education 
or English Language 
Learners (ELL) certifi-
cation. 

this motion and was sec-
onded by Don Chinoy. All 
16 commissioners present 
voted “Aye” and the mo-
tion carried.

Short Term Rental Oc-
cupancy Tax Info Only: 
County Clerk Brandon 
Stafford asked the com-
missioners for their help 
in informing the com-
munity that a business li-
cense and payment of oc-
cupancy tax is required by 
law in order to lease short 
term rentals, such as ho-
tels, motels and AirBnB’s. 
Currently, the county has 
received $14,423 from the 
tax this year. County Clerk 
Stafford informed the 
commissioner that a busi-
ness license is $15 for the 
first year. Mayor Heady 
asked the commissioners 
to encourage those in the 
community to pay this tax 
if warranted. The AirBnB 
website is somewhat mis-
leading as it seems that 
the company is paying the 
occupancy tax, however, 
they only pay those in 
Davidson, Hamilton and 
Knox Counties.

Wildwood Marina 
Dumpster: Commissioner 
Shelby Fox asked if the 
county had provided a 
dumpster to Wildwood 
Marina. Mayor Heady re-
ported that Wildwood Ma-
rina does have a cardboard 
dumpster, but not a trash 
dumpster as the county 
does not collect any com-
mercial trash.

Notary Renewals: Me-
gan Renea Jackson, Mary 
E. Strong, Shannon John-
son and Steven Cassetty 
were approved as notaries. 
Commissioner Shelby Fox 
made a motion to approve 
these and was seconded by 
Commissioner Joey Den-
son. All 16 commissioners 
present voted “Aye” and 
the motion carried.

Next meeting is set for 
Oct. 26, at 7 p.m. There 
will be an audit update on 
this date. Health insurance 
will be addressed during 
this meeting.

Adjournment: Com-
missioner Glenda May-
berry made the motion 
to adjourn until the next 
meeting and Commis-
sioner Thomas Wilmoth 
seconded the motion. All 
16 Honorable Legislative 
Body Members present 
voted “Aye” and the meet-
ing adjourned at 7:25 p.m.

EXTRA! EXTRA! 
READ ALL ABOUT IT!

The Jackson County Sentinel 
is available 

at these convenient locations:
• Sammy’s One Stop
• Fast Track-Marathon
• Country Cabin Market
• Helen’s Restaurant
• Sta-Lo Market
• Anderson & Haile Drugs
• Gainesboro Drugs
• Dodson’s Branch Community Center

• Giovanni’s
• Faye’s Cafe
• Save-A-Lot
• Dairy Queen
• Allen’s Market
• City Hall

207A S. Main St., Gainesboro

931-268-9725

People 
Of The 
Past

How lucky have you 
been so far on guessing 
the person or people of 
the past? This one may 
stump you.

All the people in-
volved are highly es-
teemed people of the 
past. They were trained 
while in Gainesboro and 
learned to love southern 
food.

County Meeting - The next meeting will be held on 
Monday, Oct. 26, at 7 p.m.
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Breakfast Is

Served!
185 S. Grundy Quarles Hwy • Gainesboro, TN 

931-268-2286

Giovanni’s Pizza 
& Italian Restaurant

452 N. Grundy 

quarles hwy.

931-268-3404

Jackson County

Farm Bureau
268-0305

P.O. Box 129 • 203 South Church Street
931-823-1274

LIVINGSTON

ENTERPRISE

GLADDICE
MISSIONARY BAPTIST

NEW HOPE
BAPTIST CHURCH

NEW ZION MISSIONARY
BAPTIST CHURCH

SPRING CREEK
THE BAPTIST CHURCH

DODSON BRANCH 
SOUTHERN BAPTIST 

CHURCH

GAINESBORO FIRST 
BAPTIST CHURCH

CUMMINS MILL
BAPTIST CHURCH

ST. THOMAS AQUINAS

BEECH GROVE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

BAGDAD
CHURCH OF CHRIST

 
BURRISTOWN

CHURCH OF CHRIST

CENTER GROVE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

CHURCH OF CHRIST

DUDNEY’S HILL
CHURCH OF CHRIST

FREEWILL COMMUNITY
CHURCH OF CHRIST

FLYNN’S CREEK
CHURCH OF CHRIST

GIBSON AVENUE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

HAYDENBURG
CHURCH OF CHRIST

HURRICANE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

FREESTATE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

LAKEVIEW

CHURCH OF  CHRIST

LIBERTY

CHURCH OF  CHRIST

MCCOINSVILLE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

MORRISON CREEK

CHURCH OF CHRIST

NEW SALEM 

CHURCH OF CHRIST

NORTH  SPRINGS

CHURCH  OF CHRIST

PLEASANT HILL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

 

RICHMOND CHAPEL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

SHILOH

CHURCH OF CHRIST

STONE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

SUGAR CREEK

CHURCH OF CHRIST

WHITE’S BEND

CHURCH OF CHRIST

 

UNION HILL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

WHITLEYVILLE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

ZION CHURCH OF CHRIST

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES

CURRY CHAPEL UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

FAIRVIEW FREE
METHODIST CHURCH

GAINESBORO FIRST
UNITED METHODIST

GRANVILLE UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

MOUNT UNION UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

WARTRACE COMMUNITY
CHURCH

MOUNTAIN CHAPEL 
MINISTRY

SONLIGHT CHURCH  

POSTON’S COMMUNITY
CHAPEL CHURCH

 
MT. PLEASANT 

COUNTRY
CHURCH OF GOD

OLD ANTIOCH
COMMUNITY CHURCH

NEW HOPE  COMMUNITY

WORLD OUTREACH 
 

PLEASANT GROVE
PRESBYTERIAN 

CHURCH
 

BURRISTOWN
ASSEMBLY OF GOD

DILLARD’S CREEK
COMMUNITY CHURCH

THE LIFE HOUSE CHURCH

JC CHRISTIAN 
FELLOWSHIP

BAPTIST CHURCH OF CHRIST

METHODIST

OTHER

JEHOVAH’S WITNESS

CATHOLIC

CHURCH OF CHRIST

H & H 
Hardware

and 
Lumber

312 Birch St.
931-268-9444

Upper Cumberland

Real Estate, LLC
101 E. Gore Ave. 

(Historic Public Square)

Gainesboro, TN 38562

(Office) 
931-268-6767

(Fax) 

931-268-1313

(Toll Free) 

1-800-268-8002

R.L. Meadows
Insurance Agency

205 S. Main Street • GaineSboro
931-268-0434

All lines of 

insurAnce

OwNER - 
Gary C. Gill

SwallowsInsurance.com

We Concentrate on SERVICE.

We Concentrate on YOU.

• Auto • Home  • Health 
• Business • Liability • Life

Cookeville
Radiator Shop
435 W. Broad street, cookeville

931-526-2013

open: Mon.-fri. 7 am-5 pm; 

sat. 8 am-12 pm

 • New & Rebuilt 
radiators in stock

• Gas Tanks Cleaned & 
Repaired & Coated

Anderson-Upper Cumberland 
Funeral Home

2131 S. Grundy Quarles
931-268-1550  
931-858-7474  
931-268-0266
Obituary Line:  
931-268-1551

Gaw Family Dentistry
GENERAL • COSMETIC

931-268-2869   WWW.GAWDENTISTRY.COM 
New patients welcome!

Halloween marks the 
first stop on the holiday 
season highway. it is a 
time of great excitement 
and fun for young and 
old, with costumes, tricks 
and treats brightening up 
an autumn day. Hard core 
Halloween enthusiasts 
may spend hundreds of 
dollars each year on de-
cor, costumes and other 
accessories. but what if 
there were a way to save 
on favorite Halloween 
items?

you don’t have to 
break the bank to enjoy 
Halloween hijinks. With 
some innovative and 
cost-saving ideas, it’s 
possible to save money, 
which is always helpful 
with Thanksgiving and 
December festivities on 
the horizon.
Use Online Resources

There’s a good chance 
you can find do-it-your-

Host Halloween For Less This Year 
self project ideas for any 
number of tasks on your 
Halloween to-do list. 
Want to craft an authentic-
looking witch’s broom? 
need a free pumpkin-
carving template? Want 
to create a haunted house 
tableau with items you 
already have in your shed 
or garage? Do a quick on-
line search to find ways to 
achieve all of these ideas 
and more.
Borrow What You Need

each year many par-
ents purchase new cos-
tumes for their children 
that are easily outgrown 
by the time the next Hal-
loween rolls around. That 
leads to a surplus of Hal-
loween costumes with 
little wear and tear. Par-
ents can set up a costume 
swap with other parents 
to find high-quality cos-
tumes for their children 
and often themselves. 

if a friend is doing a 
“Grease”-inspired 1950s 
party and you’re in pos-
session of a “Pink lady” 
jacket, offer to lend it out 
for the party.

Rely On E-Vites
Spread the word about 

your Halloween party or 
trunk-or-treat event via 
digital invitations. Many 
services offer free invita-
tions that don’t require a 
subscription to their ser-
vices. another no-cost 
idea is to download an 
image from a copyright-
free clip-art service and 
modify it using available 
phone applications to in-
clude party details. then 
simply text out your invi-
tation to friends.

Buy In Bulk
Pool your spending 

resources with other peo-
ple and utilize wholesale 
or bulk-buying services 
to meet your Hallow-

een needs. Consumers 
can save on the per-item 
cost when items are pur-
chased in bulk. This can 
be applied to decorations, 
food, candy and more.

Shop Candy Sales

you already know 
when Halloween will ar-
rive, so use the months 
prior to stock up on 
candy as it goes on sale. 
This way you need not 
pay a premium for favor-

ite sweets to give out to 
trick-or-treaters.

These are just a few 
ways to save on Hal-
loween supplies and still 
make the day a spooktac-
ular success.

Halloween – These are just a few ways to save on Halloween supplies and 
still make the day a spooktacular success.
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choolS
JCHS Celebrates Homecoming 2020

Jackson County Band in Blue Jackson County High School Volleyball Team

Jackson County High School Basketball Team
Sophomore Beauty and Beau – Emma Chaffin 
and Sam Scott.

JCMS 8th Grade Homecoming Court – Karly An-
derson, winner for Homecoming Court at JCMS.

2019 Football Homecoming Queen – Abigail Pos-
ton and escort Dylan Thompson.

Football Attendant – Eli Burris and Holly Hawk-
ins.

JCHS Football – Chris Pigg and escort Riley 
Goolsby.

JCHS Football - Casen Collier and escort Nikki 
Ragland.

Football Homecoming Attendant – Lily Chaffin 
and escort Jacob Calvin.

JCHS Football – Dallas Johnson and escorts Olivia 
Scott. JCHS Football – Wid and escort Ericka.

Football Attendant – Eve Allen and escort Justin 
Davis.

Football Attendant – Kylie Porter and escort Ethan 
Cummins. 

Football Attendant - Haley Mayberry and Eli 
Smith.

Homecoming Attendant – Riley Thomas and her 
escort.

Junior Homecoming Court – Rachel Buck and 
Miguel Hernadez.

Senior Homecoming Attendant And Escort – 
Kara Petty and Anthony Aguilar.

Blue Devil – Jackson County Homecoming 2020 
kicks off with the Blue Devil mascot pictured with 
SRO Nick Carter.Jackson County High School Cheerleaders

Freshman Homecoming Attendant – Kara Stacy 
and escort Brady Buck.

Editors Note: All information was provided by the 
school.

 Homecoming 2020

Danger – Beware of the Blue Devils.
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HELP WANTED

HELP WANTED HELP WANTED

505 North Main St. • Carthage, TN
735-2244    Firm # 2547

Website:  www.poindexterrealty.com

Email: poindexterrealty@comcast.net

C. D. “DIGGER”

You can also view our listings at www.realtor.com

or www.realtracs.com.

Just enter the MLS number on the ad.

Just a few hun
dred feet to Cordell Hull Lake. We 
have 2.64 acres being mostly open 
and offering a great lake view. This 
property is septic approved and 
has city water available. Selling for 

 With a beautiful 
lake view we are offering this large 
brick split level home. This home of
fers an eat-in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, basement, den, ga
rage, paved and gravel drives. This 
home has 3 full baths and has been 
used for 4 bedrooms. You can walk 
across the road to the lake to fish. 
This home is priced at only 
$1,000 selling agent bonus with full 
price offer. 

 Unobstructed year 
round view of Cordell Hull Lake is 
just what this cute three bedroom, 
two bath vinyl sided home has to of
fer.  This home is ideal for a starter 
home or a lake house to get away 
to. Priced to sell at 

Offering a nice view 
of adjoining countryside we are of
fering 1.92 acres of pasture.  This 
tract is septic approved and has 
city water available. This nice tract 
is priced at only 
great possibilities.

Lakeview doesn’t describe the 
great view of the Cordell Hull Lake 
just across the road from this 2.68 
acres of level to gently sloping pas
ture land. This property is septic 
approved and has city water avail
able. This view can be yours for 

 REDUCED! Joining 
the Camp Discovery we have this 
28.12 acres with long road and 
Corps of Engineers frontage. This 
open and wooded acres offers five 
home sites septic approved and has 
beautiful views of Cordell Hull Lake. 

Overlooking Cordell Hull Lake we 
have this large corner lot being 
mostly wooded and slightly sloping 
to level. Public water and electric 
is available. This property is within 
walking distance of Salt Lick Camp
ground. Priced to sell at 

Within walking distance of Cordell 
Hull Lake we have this beautiful 126 
acres of mostly wooded land with 
marketable timber & the balance in 
pasture. This farm is on a dead end 
lane and offers great hunting. There 
is an old farm house and 3 barns 
on this property. A great retreat and 
hunting tract for 

CDP29 - RODDY 
HOLLOW ROAD

CDP171 - CUMBERLAND 
VALLEY DRIVE

CDP155 - CARL 
DIXON LANE

CDP164 - HERMAN 
SMITH LANE

CD967 - HIGHWAY 56

In a great location, we have 

1.16 acres improved with a 

large concrete slab and a 

paved driveway and parking 

area. This property was used 

as a market and garage in the 

past. There is a small por-

table bank building on site, 

along with a septic system 

and water tap. Natural gas 

is available. This would be 

a great place for a business. 

Priced at only $50,000.00. 

MLS # 1817603

Approximately one mile to 

the boat launch on Roaring 

River we are selling 6.46 

acres being mostly wooded 

with some large trees. This 

property would be great for a 

getaway or to deer hunt on. 

This property can be bought 

for $17.500.00. Plus owner 

terms are available. Call Dig-

ger for details. REDUCED! to 

$15,000.00. MLS # 1897494

Offering a nice lake view, 

we have a .74 acre sloping 

lot. This lot has light restric-

tions and would be great for 

your full-time home or get-

away cabin. The lot is septic 

approved for two bedroom 

system, and has city water 

available. Priced to sell at 

$39,900.00. Owner terms 

available.

Offering a seasonal lake view 

and the lake just across the 

road we have this nice three 

bedroom, two bath brick 

home with a new metal roof 

and really nice kitchen with 

granite counter tops and 

stainless steel appliances. 

Other amenities are a two-

car garage, 28x48 barn, and 

a large front deck overlook-

ing the Corp property that 

you can sit and watch the 

various wildlife. This home is 

priced at $274,900.00. 

Overlooking the city of 

Gainesboro, we have 3.2 

acres on both sides of the 

street. This property is in 

the city limits and city wa-

ter and sewer available. This 

property is a great buy at 

$18,900.00.
505 North Main St. • Carthage, TN

Just a few hun
dred feet to Cordell Hull Lake. We 
have 2.64 acres being mostly open 
and offering a great lake view. This 
property is septic approved and 
has city water available. Selling for 

 With a beautiful 
lake view we are offering this large 
brick split level home. This home of
fers an eat-in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, basement, den, ga
rage, paved and gravel drives. This 
home has 3 full baths and has been 
used for 4 bedrooms. You can walk 
across the road to the lake to fish. 
This home is priced at only 
$1,000 selling agent bonus with full 
price offer. 

 Unobstructed year 
round view of Cordell Hull Lake is 
just what this cute three bedroom, 
two bath vinyl sided home has to of
fer.  This home is ideal for a starter 
home or a lake house to get away 
to. Priced to sell at 

Offering a nice view 
of adjoining countryside we are of
fering 1.92 acres of pasture.  This 
tract is septic approved and has 
city water available. This nice tract 
is priced at only 
great possibilities.

Lakeview doesn’t describe the 
great view of the Cordell Hull Lake 
just across the road from this 2.68 
acres of level to gently sloping pas
ture land. This property is septic 
approved and has city water avail
able. This view can be yours for 

 REDUCED! Joining 
the Camp Discovery we have this 
28.12 acres with long road and 
Corps of Engineers frontage. This 
open and wooded acres offers five 
home sites septic approved and has 
beautiful views of Cordell Hull Lake. 

Overlooking Cordell Hull Lake we 
have this large corner lot being 
mostly wooded and slightly sloping 
to level. Public water and electric 
is available. This property is within 
walking distance of Salt Lick Camp
ground. Priced to sell at 

Within walking distance of Cordell 
Hull Lake we have this beautiful 126 
acres of mostly wooded land with 
marketable timber & the balance in 
pasture. This farm is on a dead end 
lane and offers great hunting. There 
is an old farm house and 3 barns 
on this property. A great retreat and 
hunting tract for 

Overlooking Cordell Hull, we 

have 4.89 ac. +/- being most-

ly wooded. This property is 

septic approved and has city 

water and electric available. 

This property has long road 

frontage and lots of wildlife. 

Price is $16,000.00. MLS # 

1813155

CD926 - CAMP 
DISCOVERY

LANE

L
D
!

CDP149 - 293 
ENIGMA ROAD

Within walking distance of 

Cordell Hull Lake and Indian 

Creek Campground we have 

a two bedroom country home 

on a nice lot. This property 

also offers three outbuild-

ings, one being concrete 

block, and long road front-

age. This home is a buy at 

$79,900.00. Owner/Agent

CDP153 - YOUNG 
ROAD

We are offering approx 39 

acres +/- convenient to Cord-

ell Hull Lake and Indian Creek 

Campground. Years ago this 

property offered a lot of pas-

ture and cropland. Today 

it has some pasture but is 

mostly wooded with some 

marketable timber. There 

is a spring on this property 

and city water is just a few 

hundred feet away. Wildlife is 

plentiful. Priced to sell quick 

$79,900.00.

CDP152 - WEBSTER 
ROAD

Convenient to Cordell Hull 

Lake and Indian Creek Camp-

ground, we have approx. 84 

acres +/- with long road front-

age. This property is mostly 

wooded and offers bench and 

ridge fields that are grown up 
currently but can be cleared 

back out. City water and 

electric is available and wild-

life is plentiful. Priced to sell 

at $141,000.00.
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615-735-2244

STATE OF 

TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT 

OF JACKSON 

COUNTY AT 

GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Imre 
Vilaghy

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 5th day of 

October, 2020, Letter of 
Testamentary, in respect 
to the estate of Imre 
Vilaghy, deceased, who 
died June 19, 2020 were 
issued to the undersigned 
by the Probate Court of 
Jackson County, Tennes-
see.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 

unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 5th day of 
October, 2020.

Lisa Braun, Executor
Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 

Clerk and Master
Whitney Mullinax, 
Attorney for Estate
 10-13, 10-20 2TP

STATE OF 

TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT 

OF JACKSON 

COUNTY AT 

GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: James 
E. Bailey

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 9th day of 
October, 2020, Letter of 
Testamentary, in respect 
to the estate of James E. 
Bailey, deceased, who 
died August 25, 2020 
were issued to the un-
dersigned by the Probate 
Court of Jackson County, 
Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 

claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 9th day of 
October, 2020.

Anita G. Bailey, 
Executor

Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 
Clerk and Master

Charlene Robin 
Vance, Attorney for 

Estate
 10-13, 10-20 2TP

HELP WANTED: Ansei 
America is accepting ap-
plications for the follow-
ing position: 1st shift As-
sembly position, starting 
$9.50 an hour, 2nd shift 
Assembly position, start-
ing $9.65 an hour. Hour-
ly pay rate will increase 
after 90 day probation. 
Health Insurance, paid 
holiday’s, sick, vacation 
after a 90 day proba-
tion. All applicants must 
provide a High School 
Diploma or GED upon 
submitting your applica-
tion. Please submit ap-
plications Monday thru 
Friday 8 a.m. – 2 p.m. 
at 1659 North Grundy 
Quarles Hwy, Gaines-

boro, TN 8-13, TFC

BEHAVIORAL SPE-

CIALIST – The L.B.J. 
& C. Development Cor-
poration is advertising 
the following job va-
cancy: Central Office 

PUBLIC NOTICE
The Jackson County Board of 

Education will be having a Surplus 
Sale on Saturday, October 24, 
2020 at 9 a.m., located at 711 
School Drive. 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
There will be a Beer Board 

meeting October 26, 2020 at 
6:00 p.m. at the courthouse.

FORMALLY KNOWN AS: 
Granville Market

 NEW BUSINESS NAME:
Lakeside General Store

6789 Granville Hwy.

Granville, TN 38564

If you have any questions, 

please contact the Jackson 
County Mayor’s office at 931-
268-9888.

PUBLIC NOTICE
NOTICE OF MEETING OF THE 

LEGISLATIVE BODY OF JACKSON 
COUNTY, TENNESSEE

Notice is hereby given that the Legislative Body of Jackson 

County, Tennessee will meet in regular public session 

Monday, October 26, 2020 at 7:00 p.m. for the purpose of 

considering and transacting all business which may come 

before such body. 

 

 Additional information concerning the above may be 

obtained from the County Mayor’s Office, (931) 268-
9888.

Behavioral Specialist. 
Cookeville, TN $17.80 
per hour, 8 hours per day. 
Fringe Benefits: Health, 
Dental, Vision, and Life 
Insurance, Retirement 
Program, Paid Holidays, 
Sick and Annual Leave. 
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Serving all your real estate needs

Clint Conner

Broker/Auctioneer

Samantha Conner

Realtor®

208 S. Jefferson Avenue Cookeville, TN 38501

(931) 644-7149
connerproperty@gmail.com

(931) 510-0746
connerexitrealty@gmail.com

“School News Hotline”
For up to date

information about

Jackson County 

Schools, call

268-4050

931.445.5554 call or text

BASIC 
DEER
PROCESSING

$80 3255 Jennings Creek Hwy.

Whitleyville, TN 38588

Now Open in 

Jackson County

Kyle Peterson, owner

401 N. Spring St., Livingston • Of�ice: 931.823.3340 • Cell: 931.445.5305

We Service All Brands 
FREE Estimates

24 Hour Service 

Electric & Plumbing Available

Used 

Appliances 

with a 30-day 

Warranty. 

Call for details.

TN CMC Licensed 

Contractor & 

Insured

Contractors 

License

INSU�NCE
Savage Insurance 

Livingston

Home • Auto • Life • Business 
SR-22

(931)823-2885 • 107 E Broad St. Livingston
call for your best rate

Bray Family Health & 
Wellness

Shalena Bray FNP-C

35 Spivey Street, Red Boiling Springs • 615-699-7425
Monday-Thursday 8 a.m.- 4:30 p.m. Friday 8 a.m. - 2 p.m. 

ACCEPTING MOST INSURANCES 

& NEW PATIENTS 

FAMILY MEDICAL & WEIGHT LOSS

931.265.3575
Septic Tanks • Field Line

Septic Pumping 
Excavating •Skid Steer Work

 Tyler Smith     Monroe, TN

Smith’s Septics

WARDEN’S BACKHOE & LOADER SERVICE

127 Big Branch Rd. • Granville, TN 38564

Ted Warden, Owner Phone: (931) 268-0075

 Cell: (931) 267-9763

WARDEN’S BACKHOE & LOADER SERVICE

127 Big Branch Rd. • Granville, TN 38564
Water Lines Septic Tanks Field Lines

Dirt Hauling (Field Dirt & Top Soil) Basements Bush Hog & Spraying

Pond Cleaning & Digging Free Estimates Land Clearing

The Town of Gainesboro, Tennessee hereby 
provides certain financial information for the 
2020-2021 fiscal year budget in accordance with 
provisions of Chapter 484, Public Acts of 1991, 
as amended.

PUBLIC NOTICE

General Fund
 Estimated Revenues
 Local Taxes
 Intergovernmental
 Other Sources
  Total

 Estimated Expenditures
 Personnel Costs
 Other Costs
  Total

 Estimated Fund Balance
 Beginning
 Ending

Water and Sewer Fund
 Estimated Revenues
 Charges
 Grant Income
  Total

 Estimated Expenditures
 Salaries
 Other Costs
  Total

 Estimated Fund Balance
 Beginning
 Ending

2018-2019

( 12 mos )

Actual

$462,579
231,406

48,202
742,187

401,370
464,375
865,745

3,378,912
3,255,354

2018-2019

( 12 mos )

Actual

927,448
214,163

1,141,611

249,445
531,173
780,618

4,460,102
4,821,095

2019-2020

( 12 mos )

Estimated

$525,000
450,000

32,000
1,007,000

425,000
832,000

1,257,000

3,255,354
3,005,354

2019-2020

( 12 mos )

Estimated

950,000
500,000

1,450,000

280,000
530,000
810,000

4,821,095
5,461,095

2020-2021

( 12 mos )
Proposed

Budget

$530,700
497,450
35,300

1,063,450

421,400
1,183,305
1,604,705

3,005,354
2,464,099

2020-2021

( 12 mos )
Proposed

Budget

951,760
720,000

1,671,760

292,400
1,212,650
1,505,050

5,461,095
5,627,805

HELP WANTED HELP WANTED HELP WANTED HELP WANTED HELP WANTED YARD SALE 

NOTICE OF POSITION OPENING

The Upper Cumberland Electric Membership Corporation 
(UCEMC) has an opening for one Assistant Right-of-Way 
Equipment Operator. The successful applicant for the 
position will be assigned to UCEMC’s Western Right-of-
Way Maintenance District. 

Applicants must be presently legally authorized to work in 
the United States. UCEMC will exercise its right to select 
an applicant for hire. Persons interested in applying for 
the position may read the Notice of Position Open and the 
position’s description at www.ucemc.com; www.JOBS4TN.
GOV; the local Tennessee Department of Labor & Workforce 
Development Office; UCEMC’s Corporate Office at 907 Main 
Street N, Carthage, TN, or any of UCEMC’s District Office 
locations. 

All application forms must be obtained from UCEMC’s 
website www.ucemc.com. No application will be 
accepted after 4:00 p.m. Friday, October 30, 2020. 

For more information on this position contact UCEMC’s 
Human Resources Department at 800-261-2940 ext. 122.

EEO Employer/Vet/Disability

PUBLIC NOTICE

NOTICE OF MEETING 

OF GRAND JURY

It is the duty of your Grand Jurors to investigate any 
public offense which they know or have reason to believe 
has been committed and which is triable or indictable 
in this county. Any person having knowledge or proof 
that an offense has been committed may apply to testify 
before the Grand Jury. 

The Grand Jury will next meet on Monday, the 2nd day 

of November, 2020, at 9:00 a.m. at the Courthouse 

in Gainesboro, Tennessee. You may be prosecuted 
for perjury for any oral or written statement which you 
make under oath to the grand jury, when you know the 
statement to be false, and when the statement touches 
on a matter material to the point in question.

Jeff Hardy – Circuit Court Clerk

Donn Clark – Grand Jury Foreman

Employment Application 
must be in the L.B.J.& 
C. Central Office by Oct. 
19 or postmarked by 
Oct. 19. An Employment 

Application is available 
at the L.B.J.& C. Cen-
tral Office, Head Start 
Center, Career Centers, 
Indeed.com, or www.

lbjc.org. For informa-
tion contact Gale Stone 
at (931) 528-3361, ext. 
228. 10-13 1TC

BEHAVIORAL ASSIS-
TANT – The L.B.J. & 
C. Development Corpo-
ration is advertising the 
following job vacancy: 
Central Office Behav-
ioral Assistant Cookev-
ille, TN $13.74 per hour, 
8 hours per day. Fringe 
Benefits: Health, Dental, 
Vision, and Life Insur-
ance, Retirement Pro-

gram, Paid Holidays, 
Sick and Annual Leave. 
Employment Application 
must be in the L.B.J.& 
C. Central Office by Oct. 
19 or postmarked by 
Oct. 19. An Employment 
Application is available 

at the L.B.J.& C. Cen-
tral Office, Head Start 
Center, Career Centers, 
Indeed.com, or www.
lbjc.org. For informa-
tion contact Gale Stone 
at (931) 528-3361, ext. 
228. 10-13 1TC

LARGE MULTI-FAMI-
LY YARD SALE: Oct. 16 
and Oct. 17. 3464 S. Grun-
dy Quarles Hwy. Clothes; 
boys, men and women’s. 
Household items, to many 
items to mention. Cancel 
if rain. 10-13 1TP
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Granville’s Annual Fall Celebration Held 

Turn your daily commute into your great escape 

with articles and features focused on the topics 

you love - now in print, online and mobile!

931-268-9725
www.JacksonCountySentinel.net

Up to 30% savings assumes senior rate. Others save up to 23%.

We’ll Take 
You There

School 

NewsFarm 

Reports

The Best 

Local Sports

Subscribe Now & Save!

Subscribers save up to 

30% off 
newsstand price.

Chili Weather – Larry and Brenda Edmondson 
know the perfect food for the perfect weather dur-
ing the Scarecrow, Quilt and Craftsmen Festival in 
Granville.

Enjoying The Day – A great day for a mule ride. 
This young man let the mule know that he appreci-
ated the ride.

Ernest T. Bass – You never know who you will see 
when you visit Granville.

Mayberry Court House – During your visit to the 
festival in Granville, stop and visit the Mayberry 
Court House. You may even get to meet Sheriff 
Andy, Deputy Fife and even their local resident, 
Otis.

Pottery Craftsman – During the Granville Fall 
Celebration, this gentleman shows how pottery is 
made.

Quilts, Quilts And More Quilts – During the Scarecrow, Quilt and Craftsmen 
Festival, which continues through Oct. 31, you are able to stop in and see all 
the homemade quilts.

Sweetn’3 – What would a festival be without en-
tertainment? Sweetn’3 entertained for the crowd in 
Granville.

Engagements, Weddings 

& Birth Announcements

are NO CHARGE 

Deadline: 4 p.m. Friday prior to following week’s edition.

Email jcsentineloffice@twlakes.net or bring them by the 
office at South Main Street, Gainesboro.

Share your life events with Sentinel Readers!

First comes LOVE...

Then comes marriage...

T hen comes baby in the 

baby carriage

SENTINEL Photo / Submitted


