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Lady Blue Devils Swat The Yel-

low Jackets.

       See page  7

Walk Across Tennessee 2021.

       See page  6
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Winter Wallop

Ice Storm – Residents of Jackson County started last week with an Ice storm. Pictured is Highway 53 
after heavy freezing ran mixed with sleet caused power outages across the Upper Cumberland and 
caused travel to be dangerous.

Snow Storm – To add insult to injury residents of Jackson County woke up Thursday morning to a 
snow storm that left three to four inches of snow across the county. To make matter worse thousands 
of residents still did not have power and the heavy snow on ice covered limbs took many whose power 
had been restored back offline.

SENTINEL Photos / Matthew Stafford

Although the ice and 
snow are beautiful in 
sight, it has proven to be 
dangerous and trouble-
some after last week’s 
back-to-back winter 
storms—leaving thou-
sands powerless in the 
frigid temperatures.

After the start of the 
storm early last Monday 
morning, ice began to 
accumulate up to nearly 
two inches in some areas 
in the Upper Cumber-
land and it began weigh-
ing down powerlines and 
trees—causing many to 
snap.

Overton and Jack-
son Counties had out-
ages summing up to 
nearly 4,300 combined 
on Tuesday evening and 
outages continued off 
and on throughout both 
counties, many continu-
ing through the week-
end.

UCEMC officials 
reported ice is far more 
dreaded than snow be-
cause of its weight. Ice 
doesn’t “shed” itself off 
the equipment like snow 
does until it eventually 
thaws. 

“This unusual ice 
storm had a disastrous 
effect on our system 
because the ice accu-
mulations we received 
exceeded our design 
standard set by the Ru-
ral Utilities Services and 
the National Electrical 
Safety Code,” a press re-
lease stated.

Good news came on 
Sunday evening as tem-
peratures throughout the 
day increased, allowing 
for a regional thaw.

“Unfortunately, we 
can probably expect a 
few more days of tree 
limbs breaking and fall-
ing. The thaw will also 
produce wet soil, further 
weakening some trees’ 
roots, causing them to 
fall. But now, the news 
we’ve all been waiting 
for:  more often than 
not, repairs made to the 
main lines will stick, and 
we will be able to restore 
other members served by 
feeder lines from there,” 
the release stated.

On Sunday evening, 
Overton County was still 
leading in the number of 
outages—a total of 800 

Ice Storm 

Wreaks Havoc 
MEGAN REAGAN

Editor 

still needing repair.
Jackson County had 

made a significant prog-
ress over the weekend 
leaving only a total of 49 
powerless.

Although the storm 
was unusual, as usual 
community members 
stepped up and extended 
helping hands for their 
neighbors. Many going 
out of their way to vol-
unteer to cut trees and 
limbs out of driveways, 
offering their homes for 
warmth, food and show-
ers, and selfless people 
cooking meals for the 
hardworking and cold 
linemen who had been 
working non-stop since 
the start of the storm.

Several area churches 
also offered their facili-
ties as shelters for those 
needing a warm night’s 
rest.

Jackson County of-
ficials and individuals 
secured generators for 
those who are bed ridden 
and in need of medical 
assistance and attached 
to medical devices.

Jackson County May-
or Randy Heady also 
provided updates daily, 
sometimes multiple 
times a day to keep his 
constituents informed 
on the situation as issues 
arose and were resolved.

Clay County opened 
some of their Fire and 
Rescues buildings as 
shelter to house the cold 
and without power as 
well.

As stated earlier in 
the article, the ice and 
snow can be quite beau-
tiful, but to some it has 
been tragic—with one 
Overton County man 
passing away while try-
ing to seek warmth.

A 70-year-old Ten-
nessee man died amid 
power outages trying 
to get to his neighbor’s 
house.

County leaders used 
this time as an oppor-
tunity to remind people 
to check on neighbors 
around, especially dur-
ing critical times such as 
these.

In addition to one 
known death, in Overton 
County numerous house 
fires had started as a re-
sult of the use of alter-
native heating sources, 
down powerlines and 
blown transformers.

COVID-19 UPDATE

This snapshot was made available on: Feb.21.
As of Feb. 14 Jackson County is in the Red Zone. 

Total Active: 43
Total Recovered: 1,202

Hospitalizations: 35
Deaths: 33

Positivity Rate: 19 %

Bitter Cold - In the early 
morning hours of  Feb. 
20, Jackson County 
Central Fire Department 
Crews responded to re-
ports of a structure fire 
in the area of Liberty 
Church Rd. Upon arrival 
crews found a fully in-
volved structure fire that 
had collapsed into the 
basement. Crews battled 
the structure fire in the 
snow and below freezing 
temps of 16 degrees. 

Crews made a quick 
knock down on the fire 
and all personnel cleared 
the scene safely with no 
reported injuries. Depart-
ments responding were 
JCCFD, Dodson Branch 
FD, JCEMS, JCSO, and 
Upper Cumberland Elec-
tric. 

Structure Fire A Total Loss
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Congress shall make no law respecting 

an establishment of religion, or prohibit-

ing the free exercise thereof; or abridg-

ing the freedom of speech, or of the 

press; or the right of the people peace-

ably to assemble, and to petition the 

government for a redress of grievances.

The First Amendment to the Constitution

I slid through the back-
door of the coffee shop 
and found Sarge discuss-
ing the lease with four 
new guys -- homeless vet-
erans moving into the up-
stairs dormitory.

“And now we come to 
the most serious clause of 
this lease agreement,” he 
was saying. “Theft. I’m a 
real hard case about theft, 
and I have my own defini-
tion of it.”

He looked around the 
room and the guys were 
watching him warily.

“If you take a maga-
zine off another guy’s 
dresser, read it and put it 
back, you’ve committed 
theft, in my eyes. Theft of 
trust. You do not touch an-
other man’s stuff, ever.”

Half an hour later, we 
all piled out the back door 
to a rental truck full of 
furniture and hauled bed 
frames, mattresses, dress-
ers, lamps, nightstands 
and large cartons up the 
narrow staircase.

Sarge stood at the top 
of the stairs like a drill 
instructor interior deco-

Sarge’s Attic 
Dormitory

rator, ordering the furni-
ture placed in exact spots 
he’d marked out on the 
floor with blue duct tape. 
I popped open the boxes 
and the men took sheets, 
blankets, pillows and 
towel sets. In short order, 
the room was...beautiful. 
Three of them flopped 
onto their beds, groaning 
with comfort. One guy 
refused: “I won’t touch 
it until I have a shower.” 
Sarge cocked his thumb at 
the bath at other end of the 
finished attic and the guy 
took off, cradling his arm-
load of towels like they 
were gold.

Later, Sarge and I stood 
in the cold outside the 
back door, the first snow-
flakes of the next storm 
swirling around us. “I 
hope I selected right,” he 
said. “I originally thought 
I’d bring in six guys, but 
I wasn’t sure about two 
of them. These four seem 
like the best combination 
for success. I hope they 
get along.”

We heard thundering 
on the stairs as his former-
ly homeless renters came 
down to the kitchen to fix 
themselves some dinner. 
There was a lot of loud 
chattering -- and laughter.

Sarge smiled.
(c) 2021 King Features Synd., Inc.
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Marsha Blackburn (R-
Tenn.) along with U.S. 
Senators Jerry Moran (R-
Kan.), Dan Sullivan (R-
Alaska), and Thom Tillis 
(R-N.C.) urged Secre-
tary Denis McDonough 
to work with Congress, 
the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention 
(CDC) and the Depart-
ment of Defense (DoD) 
to find solutions for vet-
erans who were exposed 
to toxic substances dur-
ing their service.

During the 116th 
Congress, key provisions 
from Sen. Blackburn’s 
K2 Veterans Toxic Expo-
sure Accountability Act 
included in the National 
Defense Authorization 
Act for Fiscal Year 2021 
and Sen. Sullivan’s leg-
islation, the K2 Veter-
ans Advocacy Act, were 
signed into law to collect 
more research regard-
ing the long-term health 
of servicemembers who 
were stationed at Camp 
Stronghold Freedom at 
Karshi-Khanabad Air-
base (K2) in Uzbekistan. 
This research will help 
better determine how to 
provide proper care for 
these veterans, who are 
suffering from cancer 
and other health conse-
quences related to toxic 
exposure.

“Each agency’s role 
in this research is crucial; 
plans to initiate studies 
and coordination across 
federal agencies need to 
start immediately,” the 
senators wrote. “Because 
these efforts all seek to 
address different aspects 
of the same problem, the 
VA, DOD, and CDC must 
work together to make 
certain that their work is 

Senator Blackburn Calls On VA Secretary
complementary to one 
another and adds value 
to the overall effort. As 
the foremost senior gov-
ernment official tasked 
with caring for veterans, 
we will rely on you to be 
responsible for this coor-
dination.”

The full letter can be 
found below.

Dear Mr. Secretary:
We write to request 

your cooperation in find-
ing answers and ensuring 
proper care for veterans 
who were exposed to 
toxic substances at Camp 
Stronghold Freedom at 
Karshi-Khanabad Air-
base (K2) in Uzbekistan 
at the start of Opera-
tion Enduring Freedom. 
K2 was a former Soviet 
military base used by the 
U.S. military to launch 
operations into Afghani-
stan during the critical 
early years of the Global 
War on Terrorism. In the 
years since their deploy-
ments, veterans who 
served at K2 have en-
countered disturbingly 
high rates of rare cancers 
and other negative health 
consequences. Because 
of recent legislative en-
actments, this issue re-
quires the attention of the 
Departments of Veterans 
Affairs (VA) and De-
fense (DOD), as well as 
the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention 
(CDC). Your leadership 
is crucial to ensure ef-
fective coordination and 
implementation of laws 
designed to help these 
veterans in need.

During the 116th Con-
gress, the Senate Commit-
tee on Veterans’ Affairs 
(SVAC) worked hard to 
address the needs of K2 

veterans who are expe-
riencing negative health 
outcomes due to toxic 
exposure. Specifically, in 
the Johnny Isakson and 
David P. Roe, M.D. Vet-
erans Health Care and 
Benefits Improvement 
Act, now Public Law 116-
315, Congress mandated 
that the Secretary of Vet-
erans Affairs enter into 
an agreement with the 
CDC’s Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease 
Registry (ATSDR) to 
complete a study that will 
analyze the incidence 
of cancer within the K2 
cohort, all the toxic sub-
stances and hazards they 
may have encountered at 
K2, and any associated 
health consequences. 
Furthermore, this legisla-
tion directs the inclusion 
of Uzbekistan in the list 
of deployment locations 
eligible for the VA’s Air-
borne Hazards and Open 
Burn Pit Registry and 
ensures that all K2 vet-
erans are covered by the 
Joint DOD/VA Depleted 
Uranium Follow-up Pro-

gram.
In addition, the fis-

cal year 2021 National 
Defense Authorization 
Act (Public Law 116-
283) contains provisions 
relating to veterans who 
served at K2. Specifical-
ly, section 751 directs the 
Secretary of Defense to 
conduct a study on expo-
sure to toxic substances 
by those deployed to K2, 
including identification 
of all substances present, 
an epidemiological study 
of the health outcomes of 
the K2 cohort, and any 
association between iden-
tified exposures and ob-
served health outcomes.

These laws, coupled 
with Executive Order No. 
13892 signed on January 
19, 2021, which mandates 
a detailed assessment by 
the Secretary of Veterans 
Affairs, in consultation 
with the Secretary of De-
fense, of the conditions at 
K2 between October 1, 

Please See
VA Secretary Pg. 3
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Brown’s Recycling
1500 Shepardsville Hwy., 

Granville, TN 38564
Monday-Friday 7:00-4:00

Saturday 7:00-4:00 • Sunday 1:00-4:00

We buy all scrap 

aluminum & metal
Roll off container bins available for landfill

 & scrap metal

Office (931) 653-4355 • Cell (931) 510-4138

From Gainesboro, take Hwy. 56 South, turn right on Shepardsville 

Hwy./290, go 8 miles and turn left at 1500 Shepardsville Hwy.

Louis Ward 
Fuqua

Louis Ward Fuqua, 
90, of South Pittsburg, 
Tenn., passed away Feb. 

14, at his residence. 
Funeral arrangements 
are not complete at this 
time.

After graduating from 
Jackson County High 
School in Gainesboro, 
he joined the US Navy 
for four years aboard the 
USS Gainard (DD-706) 
during the Korean War.

He was an active 
member for many years 
with The Masonic 
Lodge, The American 
Legion, Scottish Rites, 
VFW (Post 6362) and  

Sequatchie Valley Honor 
Guard.

He was proceeded in 
death by: parents,  John 
William Fuqua and 
Blanche Ellen Dudney of 
Gainesboro; wife, Bebe 
Kirkpatrick Fuqua.

Surviving relatives 
include: sons, Kirk 
Fuqua and Kevin (Amy) 
Fuqua; grandson, Mason 
Fuqua; granddaughter, 
McKenna Fuqua; Patty 
(Kirby) Walker; broth-
er-in-law, Neil (Janie) 
Kirkpatrick; sister-in- 

law, Shelby Kirkpatrick, 
several cousins, nieces, 
nephews, a host of life-
long friends and Navy 
buddies.

Rogers Funeral 
Home is in charge of ar-
rangements.

Judy K. Hammock
Judy K. Hammock, 75, 

of the Old Antioch com-
munity, passed away Feb. 
12, at Overton County 
Health and Rehab. Funer-
al services were held Feb. 
23 at Anderson Upper 
Cumberland Funeral 
Home. Internment fol-
lowed in the Stacy Cem-
etery.

She was born March 4, 
1945, in Noblesville, Ind. 
She was a factory work-
er, and a member of the 
New Hope Community 
Church.

She was proceeded in 
death by: husband, James 
Milton Hammock; moth-
er, Edith Small DeVol; 
and son, James Ray Ham-
mock.

Surviving relatives in-
clude: daughters: Melissa 
McAnally of Hilham and 
Carol Dailey of Gaines-
boro; Grandchildren, Lo-
gan Cox, Britney Cox, 
Noah McAnally, Billy 
Stacy, and Amber Stacy; 
and great-grandchildren: 
Destiny McCormick, 
Karina Alonzo, Addison 
Stacy, and Amerika Stacy.

Myrtle Cook
Myrtle Cook, 73, of 

Gainesboro, passed away 
on Feb.14, at NHC Health 
Care in Cookeville. The 
family has chosen crema-
tion, with no services at 
this time.

She was born Aug.7, 

1947  in Pleasant Shade. 
She was a housewife.

She was proceeded in 
death by: parents, Cur-
tis Kemp and Dorothy 
Hackett Kemp; brothers, 
Bobby Kemp and Paul 
Kemp; and sisters, Jean 
Waters and Gail Smith.

Surviving relatives in-
clude: sons, Charles Old-
ham of Cookeville and 
Curtis Cook of Gaines-
boro; daughter, Julie 
Montgomery of Louis-
ville, Ky.; brothers, Bill 
Kemp and Roy Kemp; 
sisters, Sandra Bowman, 

Donna Holder, and Mary 
Proctor; and grandchil-
dren, Kaylie Montgom-
ery, Carson Montgomery, 
and Cassie Montgomery.

Anderson Upper 
Cumberland Funeral 
Home was in charge of 
arrangements.

Jimmy Dale 
Martin

Jimmy Dale Martin, 
64, of Cookeville, passed 
away Feb.13 at Cookev-
ille Regional Medical 
Center.  Funeral services 
were held Feb. 18, at 
Anderson Upper Cum-
berland Funeral Home 
with Bro. Jimmy Ander-
son officiating. Interment 
followed in the Sam Flatt 
Cemetery.

He was born June 14, 
1956, in Cookeville. He 
worked in the tool and die 
industry.

He was proceeded in 
death by: parents, Arvil 
C. Martin and Clennie 
Kiula Pippin West; broth-
ers, Frank and Billy Clyde 
West; and sister, Annette 
Anderson.

Surviving relatives 
include: brothers, Alton 
Edward West of Michi-
gan, Marvin Martin of 
Cookeville and Rellon 
Martin of Cookeville; and 
sisters, Juanita Martin of 
Bloomington Springs, 
Lois Bilyeu of Baxter and 
Peggy Lewis of Cookev-
ille.

Harry Smith 
Harry Smith, 74 of 

Crossville, passed away 
Feb. 8, at Saint Thom-
as River Park Hospital. 
Graveside services and in-
ternment were conducted 

on Feb. 16, at Crossville 
City Cemetery with Bro. 
Alan Judd officiating.

Anderson Upper 
Cumberland Funeral 
Home was in charge of ar-
rangements.

Consumer interest 
in purchasing local is 
at an all-time high, and 
the long-standing Pick 
Tennessee Products pro-
gram today announced a 
refreshed logo for Ten-
nessee food businesses, 
farmers markets, and 
agritourism.

“As we move into 
a new year filled with 
hope and new possi-
bilities, we are excited 
to share a new look for 
our state marketing pro-
gram,” Commissioner 
Charlie Hatcher, D.V.M. 
said. “Through an online 
directory and a mobile 
app, we help consum-
ers make their direct-to-
farm connection. We are 
confident that this strong 
visual representation 
matches the strong prod-
ucts from the Volunteer 
State.”

For more than 30 
years, Pick Tennessee 
Products has connected 
people everywhere to the 
great things that come 
from Tennessee’s farms 
and food businesses. The 
program now lists more 
than 2,700 Tennessee 
farmers and farm-direct 
businesses.

“This program pro-
vides critical exposure 
and marketing opportu-
nities to our farmers and 
food manufacturers,” 
Assistant Commissioner 
Keith Harrison said. “As 
you get groceries for 
your family, plants for 
your yard, or gifts for 
loved ones, continue to 
look for the refreshed 

Pick Tennessee Products 
Celebrates Refreshed Look

Pick Tennessee Products 
logo so you can be sure 
you are purchasing fresh 
and local products.”

The University of 
Tennessee Institute of 
Agriculture conducted 
market research on the 
Pick Tennessee Products 
logo to provide informa-
tion on the best ways to 
connect with consumers. 
“We’re proud to contin-
ue the tradition of using 
the red barn that Tennes-
seans recognize and see 
on the Ag Tag license 

plates while also incor-
porating new elements 
like the tri-star in this re-
freshed logo,” Commis-
sioner Hatcher added.

Tennessee producers 
of agricultural products 
can apply online to be-
come a Pick Tennessee 
Products member. To be 
included, farmers and 
food producers must 
comply with all permits, 
licenses, and inspections 
administered by the Ten-
nessee Department of 
Agriculture. The depart-

ment’s Business De-
velopment Division is 
available to assist with 
eligibility and directory 
questions at pick.tn@
tn.gov.

Visit www.PickT-
NProducts.org or use 
the free Pick Tennessee 
mobile app to find farms 
and food businesses near 
you. Follow @PickT-
NProducts on Facebook, 
Twitter, and Instagram 
to learn more about sea-
sonal activities, prod-
ucts, and recipes.

2001, and December 31, 
2005, including identifi-
cation of any toxic sub-
stances contaminating K2 
during such period, shows 
the commitment across 
our government to take 
care of the veterans who 
served at K2. Each agen-
cy’s role in this research 
is crucial; plans to initiate 
studies and coordination 
across federal agencies 
need to start immediately. 
Because these efforts all 
seek to address different 
aspects of the same prob-
lem, the VA, DOD, and 
CDC must work together 
to make certain that their 
work is complementary 
to one another and adds 
value to the overall ef-
fort. As the foremost se-
nior government official 
tasked with caring for 
veterans we will rely on 
you to be responsible for 
this coordination.

With regard to the ad-
ministration of these laws, 

form. We look forward 
to working together with 
you and the Department 
to make certain that all 
who served at K2, as 
well as their families and 
survivors, have the care 
and answers that they de-
serve.

we urge you to provide pe-
riodic public updates and 
conduct regular outreach 
directly to K2 veterans 
who have filed claims. 
Keeping K2 veterans, 
their families, and their 
survivors fully informed 
is imperative throughout 
this process and going 
forward as we learn more 
about K2 veterans’ health 
challenges and associ-
ated care needs. We also 
request that you, or your 
designee, coordinate and 
provide briefings to Com-
mittee staff, on a monthly 
basis, that will include 
representatives from VA, 
DOD, and ATSDR to out-
line the progress of the 
implementation of laws 
relating to K2 veterans. 
This collaboration will 
ensure that both branches 
remain aligned and in-
formed while creating 
and executing crucial 
public policy efforts.

There is no group 
of people that we hold 
in higher regard than 
those who served in uni-

118 East First St. • Cookeville, TN
931-528-6403 • 800-339-2899

Mon-Thurs: 8 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Fri: 8 a.m. to noon

Please call to schedule a free 
consultation. There is no fee 
unless you win your case.

Social Security

Disability
Need help with your claim?

Melaney G.
Madewell

118 East First St. • Cookeville, TN
931-528-6403 • 800-339-2899

Mon-Thurs: 8 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Fri: 8 a.m. to noon

Attorney-at-Law
Please call to schedule a free 
consultation. There is no fee 
unless you win your case.

Subscribe Today & Save!

(931) 268 - 9725
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Breakfast Is

Served!
185 S. Grundy Quarles Hwy • Gainesboro, TN 

931-268-2286

Giovanni’s Pizza 
& Italian Restaurant

452 N. Grundy 

quarles hwy.

931-268-3404

Jackson County

Farm Bureau
268-0305

P.O. Box 129 • 203 South Church Street
931-823-1274

LIVINGSTON

ENTERPRISE

GLADDICE
MISSIONARY BAPTIST

NEW HOPE
BAPTIST CHURCH

NEW ZION MISSIONARY
BAPTIST CHURCH

SPRING CREEK
THE BAPTIST CHURCH

DODSON BRANCH 
SOUTHERN BAPTIST 

CHURCH

GAINESBORO FIRST 
BAPTIST CHURCH

CUMMINS MILL
BAPTIST CHURCH

ST. THOMAS AQUINAS

BEECH GROVE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

BAGDAD
CHURCH OF CHRIST

 
BURRISTOWN

CHURCH OF CHRIST

CENTER GROVE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

CHURCH OF CHRIST

DUDNEY’S HILL
CHURCH OF CHRIST

FREEWILL COMMUNITY
CHURCH OF CHRIST

FLYNN’S CREEK
CHURCH OF CHRIST

GIBSON AVENUE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

HAYDENBURG
CHURCH OF CHRIST

HURRICANE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

FREESTATE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

LAKEVIEW

CHURCH OF  CHRIST

LIBERTY

CHURCH OF  CHRIST

MCCOINSVILLE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

MORRISON CREEK

CHURCH OF CHRIST

NEW SALEM 

CHURCH OF CHRIST

NORTH  SPRINGS

CHURCH  OF CHRIST

PLEASANT HILL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

 

RICHMOND CHAPEL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

SHILOH

CHURCH OF CHRIST

STONE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

SUGAR CREEK

CHURCH OF CHRIST

WHITE’S BEND

CHURCH OF CHRIST

 

UNION HILL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

WHITLEYVILLE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

ZION CHURCH OF CHRIST

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES

CURRY CHAPEL UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

FAIRVIEW FREE
METHODIST CHURCH

GAINESBORO FIRST
UNITED METHODIST

GRANVILLE UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

MOUNT UNION UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

WARTRACE COMMUNITY
CHURCH

MOUNTAIN CHAPEL 
MINISTRY

SONLIGHT CHURCH  

POSTON’S COMMUNITY
CHAPEL CHURCH

 
MT. PLEASANT 

COUNTRY
CHURCH OF GOD

OLD ANTIOCH
COMMUNITY CHURCH

NEW HOPE  COMMUNITY

WORLD OUTREACH 
 

PLEASANT GROVE
PRESBYTERIAN 

CHURCH
 

BURRISTOWN
ASSEMBLY OF GOD

DILLARD’S CREEK
COMMUNITY CHURCH

THE LIFE HOUSE CHURCH

JC CHRISTIAN 
FELLOWSHIP

BAPTIST CHURCH OF CHRIST

METHODIST

OTHER

JEHOVAH’S WITNESS

CATHOLIC

CHURCH OF CHRIST

H & H 
Hardware

and 
Lumber

312 Birch St.
931-268-9444

P.O. Box 37, 207A Main Street

Gainesboro, TN 38562

R.L. Meadows
Insurance Agency

205 S. Main Street • GaineSboro
931-268-0434

All lines of 

insurAnce

OwNER - 
Gary C. Gill

Cookeville
Radiator Shop
435 W. Broad street, cookeville

931-526-2013

open: Mon.-fri. 7 am-5 pm; 

sat. 8 am-12 pm

 • New & Rebuilt 
radiators in stock

• Gas Tanks Cleaned & 
Repaired & Coated

Anderson-Upper Cumberland 
Funeral Home

2131 S. Grundy Quarles
931-268-1550  
931-858-7474  
931-268-0266
Obituary Line:  
931-268-1551

LoCationS in COOKEVILLE, TN (931) 526-4025, LIVINGSTON, TN (931) 823-5641

& SMITHVILLE, TN (615) 215-4455  | onLine at: SwALLOwSINSURANCE.COM

Visits to the dentist 
for periodic cleanings 
and checkups are an im-
portant component of 
oral hygiene. Dentists 
also may be the first 
people to identify poten-
tial issues that can affect 
health elsewhere in the 
body.

Many people are 
unaware that children 
should visit the dentist 
early in their lives. The 
american academy of 
Pediatric Dentistry rec-
ommends that a child 
should visit the dentist 
by age one or within six 
months of the eruption 
of his or her first tooth. 
However, many parents 
wait until much later - 
age two or three - to take 
kids to the dentist, offers 
Delta Dental Plans. Hes-
itance to visit the dentist 
may stem from personal 
fears or perceived reac-

Make The Dentist A Fun Experience For Kids
tions by children.

Primary teeth may 
eventually fall out, but 
they shouldn’t be ig-
nored. They save space 
for permanent teeth 
and serve other func-
tions. Therefore, par-
ents should begin to ac-
climate children to the 
dentist at a young age to 
make the experience fun 
and even enjoyable.

Lead By Example
Children who wit-

ness their parents putting 
off going to the dentist 
or being apprehensive 
about visiting the dentist 
may develop their own 
fears. always paint the 
dentist in a positive light 
and keep appointments.

Focus On The Good 
Aspects

Talk up all the ben-
efits of going to the den-
tist, such as having a 
squeaky clean and fresh 

mouth. Many hygienists 
will hand out small toys 
after a successful visit, 
or at the least a great new 
toothbrush and other fun 
products to try.

Get A Tour Of The 
Office

ask the staff if your 
child can get a special 
tour of the office with 
explanations of all the 
tools and equipment. 
Understanding what 
to expect the next time 
around in a no-pressure 
situation can make the 
process much easier for 
everyone involved. The 
dentist may be able to 
also give a test ride on 
the exam chair, moving 
it up and down, as well 
as showing off the water 
fountain and oral irriga-
tor.

Avoid Giving False 
Hope

Do not tell a child that 

“everything will be oK” 
at the dentist’s office. if 
a child needs treatment 
that may be uncomfort-
able, he or she may not 
trust you the next time 
a dental visit is sched-
uled, according to Joel 
H. berg, D.D.S., M.S., 

Director of the Depart-
ment of Dentistry at 
Seattle Children’s Hos-
pital. avoid words like 
“shots,” “pain,” “hurt,” 
or even “cavities.” Den-
tists, particularly pedi-
atric dentists, may have 
their own vocabulary 

that can assuage fears 
and seem less alarming 
to kids.

over time, dental 
visits can become an 
easy routine with chil-
dren, setting them up 
for a lifetime of healthy 
mouths and teeth. 

A Fun Experience – Over time, dental visits can become an easy routine with 
children, setting them up for a lifetime of healthy mouths and teeth. 



23 Marble type
25 Asta’s feeder
26	 Tart	flavor
27	 As	soon	as
28	 “Shoo!”
29	 Bruins’	sch.
30 Little lies
31	 Mountain	ht.
35	 Most	loved
38	 Painter’s	motion
40	 Genetic	letters
42 Thee
45	 Telly	watcher
47	 Cranny
48	 Batman’s	hood
49	 Actress	Celeste
50 Early bird?
51	 PBS	funder
52	 Cartoon	frame
53	 Yucatan	year
54 Wildebeest

See this week’s 
answers in next 
week’s edition of 

the Sentinel 

CROSSWORD

ARIES 
Mar 21/Apr 20

Aries,	 you	 may	 be	
falling	behind	on	keeping	
resolutions,	but	that	is	al-
right.	It’s	easy	to	get	back	
on	track	once	you	set	your	
mind	to	it.	Ask	a	friend	to	
keep	you	accountable.

TAURUS 
Apr 21/May 21

Taurus,	right	now	your	
mind	 is	 focused	 on	 “the	
more	the	merrier”	but	you	
have	to	find	ways	to	safe-
ly	 connect	 with	 others.	
Keep	everyone’s	health	in	
mind.

GEMINI 
May 22/Jun 21

It	 may	 have	 seemed	
like	 the	 last	 few	 months	
of	2020	flew	by,	Gemini.	
A	 new	 year	 provides	 a	
chance	 to	 restart,	 slow	
down	 and	 smell	 the	 pro-
verbial	roses.

CANCER 
Jun 22/Jul 22

This	 week	 can	 prove	
to	 be	 epic	 if	 you	 just	 go	
with	 the	 flow	 a	 little	 bit,	
Cancer.	 Let	 others	 take	
the	 lead	 and	 simply	 fol-
low	 along.	 You	 never	
know	 where	 things	 will	

lead.
LEO 

Jul 23/Aug 23
Leo,	figure	out	how	to	

align	your	priorities	with	
what	you	do	for	a	 living.	
It	 could	 mean	 chang-
ing	 careers.	Even	 though	
it	 may	 seem	 risky	 right	
now,	 start	 exploring	 the	
waters.

VIRGO 
Aug 24/Sept 22

Virgo,	some	down	time	
and	R&	R	can	do	a	body	
good.	Ask	your	partner	to	
cover	for	you	and	then	re-
ciprocate	so	you	can	both	
unplug	and	refresh.

LIBRA 
Sept 23/Oct 23

Libra,	a	midweek	busi-
ness	proposition	or	a	real	
estate	endeavor	may	pres-
ent	itself.	This	could	lead	
to	some	exciting	changes	
for	your	family.

SCORPIO 
Oct 24/Nov 22

You	 don’t	 mind	 de-
fending	 your	 opinions	
or	 your	 ideals,	 Scorpio.	
In	 fact,	 you	 are	 highly	
skilled	 at	 constructive	
conversation.	Your	 nego-
tiation	tactics	may	be	put	

to	the	test.
SAGITTARIUS 
Nov 23/Dec 21

The	 early	 part	 of	 the	
week	 may	 be	 pretty	 un-
eventful,	 but	 things	 heat	
up	as	 the	week	progress-
es,	 Sagittarius.	 You	 may	
not	have	time	to	do	every-
thing	you	desire.

CAPRICORN 
Dec 22/Jan 20

Boredom	 isn’t	 a	 bad	
thing	 when	 you	 desire	 a	
respite,	Capricorn.	While	
others	may	be	looking	for	
ways	to	chase	away	cabin	
fever,	you	may	be	perfect-
ly	content	snuggling	in.

AQUARIUS 
Jan 21/Feb 18

Unexpected	 partner-
ships	 can	 yield	 some	
amazing	 results,	 Aquar-
ius.	This	may	 be	 the	 op-
portunity	you	are	looking	
for	at	this	juncture	in	your	
life.	 Push	 ahead	 for	 the	
time	being.

PISCES 
Feb 19/Mar 20

Pisces,	 momentum	
swings	 in	your	favor	and	
you	can	sail	through	all	of	
your	tasks	and	goals	in	re-
cord	time.	Enjoy	the	ride.

ACROSS
1	 June	honoree
4	 Say	it’s	so
8	 Pretzel	topper
12 Past
13	 Travel	permit
14	 Done	with
15	 Brock	of	baseball
16	 Alaskan	city
18	 Heron’s	kin
20	 Army	address
21 Dalai --
24	 Slow,	in	music
28	 Right	to	vote
32	 Cash	advance
33	 201,	in	old	Rome
34	 Heat	to	near	boiling
36	 GOP	org.
37	 Priestly	vestments
39	 Cheap	ride	section
41	 “Yum!”
43	 Novelist	Hunter
44	 Steal	from
46	 Cowboy’s	workplace
50	 Spur	on

55	 Tic-tac-toe	win
56	 Nerd’s	kin
57	 Hostels
58	 Hooting	bird
59	 Big	wind
60	 Track	tipster
61	 Carrier	to	
	 Amsterdam

DOWN
1 Valley
2	 Awestruck
3	 Gloomy
4	 Online	images
5	 Sportscaster	Scully
6	 Computer	key
7	 Stadium	cheers
8	 Reddish-brown		 	
	 horse
9	 “Selma”	director	
	 DuVernay
10	 Table	support
11	 Three,	in	Rome
17	 Texas	tea
19 Sprite
22	 PC	alternatives
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Readers	spend	more	time	on	this	page	
than	any	other.

Advertise Here,
Be Noticed

Call or stop by the 

Jackson County Sentinel Office
(931) 268-9725

211 South Main Street, Gainesboro
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We Have You Covered 

Whether over 

morning coffee, on 

your work break, 

or in your leisure 

time, we have you 

covered.

City and County News• 
State News• 

Special Features • 
Business Features• 

211 S. Main St.,

Gainesboro, TN

(931) 268-9725

Subscribe Today

Blast From The Past 
Editors Note: From the 

May 8, 1975 Edition of the 
Jackson County Sentinel

Saturday, May 10, 
1975 will mark the grand 
opening of the Roaring 
River Boat Dock and Ma-
rina and Campgrounds.

Twenty covered boat 

slips, a floating restaurant, 
fuel, boat rentals, a pump 
house, restrooms and 
more planned in the future 
comprise the new Roar-
ing River Boat Dock and 
restaurant located just off 
State Highway 56 on Riv-
er Road in Gainesboro.

A total of 75 camp-
sites make up the Roar-
ing River campgrounds 
but additional features of 
the almost 40 acre camp-
grounds, which fronts 
on the Roaring River, 
northeast of Gainesboro, 
include restrooms, bath-

houses, 75 picnic tables, 
outdoor grills, basketball 
and volleyball courts, and 
a boat ramp. Planned for 
the near future is an am-
phitheater and a nature 
trail. Both of these are ex-
pected to be ready by the 
summer of 1975. 

Roaring River – The Roaring River Boat Dock and Marina in Gainesboro will officially open May 10, 
1975. It is the first water recreational facility of its kind to come to Jackson County. 

Sentinel 

RECIPES of the WEEK

Spinach Salad
3 tablespoons wine 

vinegar
6 tablespoons salad 

oil
1/2 teaspoon salt
1/8 teaspoon pepper
1/4 teaspoon dry 

mustard
2 tablespoons 

chopped parsley
1 clove garlic, cut in 

half
1/2 pound (5 to 6 

cups) fresh spinach 
leaves

1/2 cauliflower, cut 
into flowerets

Corn Meal 
Johnnycakes

1 1/4 cups of milk, 
scalded

1/2 teaspoon salt
1 cup enriched corn 

meal
Combine milk, salt 

and corn meal; mix until 
smooth. For each cake, 

pour about 1 tablespoon 
batter onto hot, well-
greased griddle (375 de-
grees). Fry 2 minutes; 
turn’ fry an additional 6 
minutes or until cooked. 
Serve hot with butter and 
maple-blended syrup.

Makes 18 johnny-
cakes

1 avocado, peeled 
and sliced.

1/2 red onion, sliced 
and separated into rings.

Mix together wine 
vinegar, oil, salt, pepper, 
dry mustard, parsley and 
garlic; let stand for 30 
minutes. Remove garlic. 
While dressing is stand-
ing, wash the spinach 
and remove stems. Dry 
well and combine with 
cauliflowerets, avocado 
and red onion in salad 
bowl. Add dressing and 
toss lightly to mix well. 
Makes 6 servings.

Walk Across Ten-
nessee, a University of 
Tennessee Extension 
program, will begin in 
Jackson County March 
22 to May 16. This 
program is a free team-
based walking chal-
lenge. It’s an eight-week 
program that encour-
ages teams of four to 
be active by walking or 
choosing your favorite 
physical activity. Team 
members do not have 
to walk together, and all 
forms of exercise count. 
The teams will have a 
friendly competition to 
see who can log the most 
miles. The team who 
walks the farthest will 
win, but everyone who 
participates will take 
home a healthy habit. 
Top three teams that log 

Walk Across Tennessee 2021
the most miles will win 
prizes and every team 
that walks 500 miles 
or more will be entered 
into a drawing, and three 
teams will be randomly 
selected to win!

How do you partici-
pate? 

Form a team of four 
members. Then choose 
a team captain and cre-
ate a unique team name; 
The team captain will 
register the team at 
https://tiny.utk.edu/jack-
soncountyteam; Each 
team member will also 
need to complete the 
individual registration 
form at https://tiny.utk.
edu/jacksoncountyindivi 
or if you prefer a paper 
packet those can picked 
up at the UT Extension 
office - 757 S. Grundy 

Quarles Hwy. Suite D. 
Gainesboro. 

Once registered you 
will receive a welcome 
email and your team cap-
tain will receive a link to 
report team mileage each 
week if you choose the 
online portion, pedom-
eters are available at the 
UT Extension office for 
anyone that wants one. 

To convert your phys-
ical activity to mileage, 
go to: http://walkacross-
tn.org/mileage-calcula-
tor/.

For questions, con-
tact Rebekah Melton, 
FCS Extension Agent at 
931-268-9437 or email 
tmelton9@utk.edu

Check out our web-
site at - https://jackson.
tennessee.edu/walk-
across-tennessee/ 

Walk Across Tennessee – Walk Across Tennessee, a University of Tennessee 
Extension program, will begin in Jackson County March 22 to May 16.
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3 Rooms Carpet and Pad

$69900
Installed

based on 468
sq. ft. plus
tax, see store
for details

Bowman’s Carpet Outlet
275 S. Willow Ave.

931-528-5728

FINANCING

AVAILABLE

Weddings

B
ir

th
d

a
ys

Baby Announcements

Share Your Life Events With 

Sentinel Readers

Engagements, Weddings, 

Birthdays, and Baby 

Announcements are no charge.

Deadline: 4 p.m. Friday prior to following week’s 

edition. Email jcsentinel@twlakes.net or bring by the 

office at 211 S. Main St., Gainesboro. 

The Lady Blue Devils 
played host to the Lady 
Yellow Jackets in the first 
round of the TSSAA Girl’s 
District 6A Tournament on 
Saturday, Feb. 20.

The Lady Blue Dev-
ils came out on fire ready 
to go toe-to-toe with the 
Lady Yellow Jackets. The 
Lady Yellow Jackets out-
scored the Lady Blue Dev-
ils 11-10. 

In the second quar-
ter the Lady Blue Devils 
would figure out a defen-
sive plan that worked and 
would outscored the Lady 
Yellow Jackets 11-6, being 
led by Jacklyn Agee with 
six points. 

The score at halftime 
was 21-17 Lady Blue 
Devils.

The Lady Blue Devils 
came out of halftime ready 
to put the Lady Yellow 
Jackets away. 

In the third quarter the 
Lady Blue Devils played 
great on both sides of the 
ball, outscoring the Lady 
Yellow Jackets 20-10, be-
ing led by Riley Thomas 
with six points. At the end 
of the third quarter the 
score was 41-27. 

In the fourth quarter the 
Lady Yellow Jackets tried 
to mount a comeback, but 
the Lady Blue Devils kept 
the pedal to the metal and 

Lady Blue Devils Swat The Yellow Jackets  
MATTHEW STAFFORD

staff writer 

held them off.
The Lady Blue Dev-

ils beat the Lady Yellow 
Jackets 60-44. Leading in 
score for the Lady Blue 
Devils was Ericka David-
son with 15 points.

Scoring for the girls 
against Trousdale County 
was: Riley Thomas 14, 
Jacklyn Agee with 12, 
Emma Chaffin with 10, 
Lilly Chaffin with four, 
Nikki Ragland with three 
and Carlee Bean with two.

“We were off the court 
for a week due to the icy 
weather so I was con-
cerned how sloppy we 
might be after the long 
layoff. But, I thought we 
played pretty well for the 
most part. Nikki Ragland 
did a good job defensively 
on Trousdale’s best player. 
Lilly Chaffin was big on 
the boards. We got a bal-
anced outside scoring at-
tack from Riley Thomas 
and Ericka Davidson and 
inside from Jacklyn Agee 
and Emma Chaffin. It was 
a good all-around team 
win,” Coach Jim Brown 
said.

The Lady Blue Dev-
ils took to the court again 
last night, traveling to Red 
Boiling Springs to face 
them in the second round 
of the TSSAA Girls’ Dis-
trict 6A Tournment. See 
next week’s edition for 
the outcome of last night’s 
game.

A Little Help – Nikki Ragland looking for a teammate to pass the ball to against the Lady Yellow Jack-
ets.

Look Out – Ericka Davidson looks for a lane to the basket.

Coming Through  – Lilly Chaffin drives to the basket.

SENTINEL Photos / Matthew Stafford
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HELP WANTED

HELP WANTED

STATEWIDE

STATEWIDE STATEWIDE STATEWIDE

NOW HIRING
38-year-old LOCALLY OWNED & 

OPERATED manufacturing company is 

seeking full-time employment candidates 

for the following positions:

Cabinet making• 
 ° Building

 ° Laminating

 ° Installing hardware

 ° CNC / saws / edge banders

Frame building• 
Upholstery• 
Assembly• 
Packaging• 
Janitorial & Recycling• 
Shipping & Receiving• 

**Willing to train for all positions**

**Experience preferred for the Shipping 

& Receiving position**

Competitive pay• 
Health, Vision, Dental, Life• 
Paid holidays• 
Paid vacation• 
401K with up to a 4% company • 
match

Weekly bonus for perfect attendance • 
Overtime is very likely• 

Apply in person @ 2000 Bowser Rd., 
Cookeville, TN 38506 or by email – 

jobs@collinsmfgco.com or call 

931-528-5151 with questions.

Submit Applications ASAP!

2000 Bowser Rd

Cookeville, TN 38506

p/ 800.292.6450

f/ 9315285472

w/ collins.co

505 North Main St. • Carthage, TN
735-2244    Firm # 2547

Website:  www.poindexterrealty.com

Email: poindexterrealty@comcast.net

C. D. “DIGGER”

You can also view our listings at www.realtor.com

or www.realtracs.com.

Just enter the MLS number on the ad.

Just a few hun
dred feet to Cordell Hull Lake. We 
have 2.64 acres being mostly open 
and offering a great lake view. This 
property is septic approved and 
has city water available. Selling for 

 With a beautiful 
lake view we are offering this large 
brick split level home. This home of
fers an eat-in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, basement, den, ga
rage, paved and gravel drives. This 
home has 3 full baths and has been 
used for 4 bedrooms. You can walk 
across the road to the lake to fish. 
This home is priced at only 
$1,000 selling agent bonus with full 
price offer. 

 Unobstructed year 
round view of Cordell Hull Lake is 
just what this cute three bedroom, 
two bath vinyl sided home has to of
fer.  This home is ideal for a starter 
home or a lake house to get away 
to. Priced to sell at 

Offering a nice view 
of adjoining countryside we are of
fering 1.92 acres of pasture.  This 
tract is septic approved and has 
city water available. This nice tract 
is priced at only 
great possibilities.

Lakeview doesn’t describe the 
great view of the Cordell Hull Lake 
just across the road from this 2.68 
acres of level to gently sloping pas
ture land. This property is septic 
approved and has city water avail
able. This view can be yours for 

 REDUCED! Joining 
the Camp Discovery we have this 
28.12 acres with long road and 
Corps of Engineers frontage. This 
open and wooded acres offers five 
home sites septic approved and has 
beautiful views of Cordell Hull Lake. 

Overlooking Cordell Hull Lake we 
have this large corner lot being 
mostly wooded and slightly sloping 
to level. Public water and electric 
is available. This property is within 
walking distance of Salt Lick Camp
ground. Priced to sell at 

Within walking distance of Cordell 
Hull Lake we have this beautiful 126 
acres of mostly wooded land with 
marketable timber & the balance in 
pasture. This farm is on a dead end 
lane and offers great hunting. There 
is an old farm house and 3 barns 
on this property. A great retreat and 
hunting tract for 

CDP171 - CUMBERLAND 
VALLEY DRIVE

CDP155 - CARL 
DIXON LANE

CDP164 - HERMAN 
SMITH LANE

CD967 - HIGHWAY 56

In a great location, we have 

1.16 acres improved with a 

large concrete slab and a 

paved driveway and parking 

area. This property was used 

as a market and garage in the 

past. There is a small por-

table bank building on site, 

along with a septic system 

and water tap. Natural gas 

is available. This would be 

a great place for a business. 

Priced at only $50,000.00. 

MLS # 1817603

Offering a nice lake view, 

we have a .74 acre sloping 

lot. This lot has light restric-

tions and would be great for 

your full-time home or get-

away cabin. The lot is septic 

approved for two bedroom 

system, and has city water 

available. Priced to sell at 

$39,900.00. Owner terms 

available.

Offering a seasonal lake view 

and the lake just across the 

road we have this nice three 

bedroom, two bath brick 

home with a new metal roof 

and really nice kitchen with 

granite counter tops and 

stainless steel appliances. 

Other amenities are a two-

car garage, 28x48 barn, and 

a large front deck overlook-

ing the Corp property that 

you can sit and watch the 

various wildlife. This home is 

priced at $274,900.00. 

Overlooking the city of 

Gainesboro, we have 3.2 

acres on both sides of the 

street. This property is in 

the city limits and city wa-

ter and sewer available. This 

property is a great buy at 

$18,900.00.

505 North Main St. • Carthage, TN

Just a few hun
dred feet to Cordell Hull Lake. We 
have 2.64 acres being mostly open 
and offering a great lake view. This 
property is septic approved and 
has city water available. Selling for 

 With a beautiful 
lake view we are offering this large 
brick split level home. This home of
fers an eat-in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, basement, den, ga
rage, paved and gravel drives. This 
home has 3 full baths and has been 
used for 4 bedrooms. You can walk 
across the road to the lake to fish. 
This home is priced at only 
$1,000 selling agent bonus with full 
price offer. 

 Unobstructed year 
round view of Cordell Hull Lake is 
just what this cute three bedroom, 
two bath vinyl sided home has to of
fer.  This home is ideal for a starter 
home or a lake house to get away 
to. Priced to sell at 

Offering a nice view 
of adjoining countryside we are of
fering 1.92 acres of pasture.  This 
tract is septic approved and has 
city water available. This nice tract 
is priced at only 
great possibilities.

Lakeview doesn’t describe the 
great view of the Cordell Hull Lake 
just across the road from this 2.68 
acres of level to gently sloping pas
ture land. This property is septic 
approved and has city water avail
able. This view can be yours for 

 REDUCED! Joining 
the Camp Discovery we have this 
28.12 acres with long road and 
Corps of Engineers frontage. This 
open and wooded acres offers five 
home sites septic approved and has 
beautiful views of Cordell Hull Lake. 

Overlooking Cordell Hull Lake we 
have this large corner lot being 
mostly wooded and slightly sloping 
to level. Public water and electric 
is available. This property is within 
walking distance of Salt Lick Camp
ground. Priced to sell at 

Within walking distance of Cordell 
Hull Lake we have this beautiful 126 
acres of mostly wooded land with 
marketable timber & the balance in 
pasture. This farm is on a dead end 
lane and offers great hunting. There 
is an old farm house and 3 barns 
on this property. A great retreat and 
hunting tract for 

Overlooking Cordell Hull, we 

have 4.89 ac. +/- being most-

ly wooded. This property is 

septic approved and has city 

water and electric available. 

This property has long road 

frontage and lots of wildlife. 

Price is $16,000.00. MLS # 

1813155

CD926 - CAMP 
DISCOVERY

LANE

CDP152 - WEBSTER 
ROAD

Convenient to Cordell Hull 

Lake and Indian Creek Camp-

ground, we have approx. 84 

acres +/- with long road front-

age. This property is mostly 

wooded and offers bench and 

ridge fields that are grown up 
currently but can be cleared 

back out. City water and 

electric is available and wild-

life is plentiful. Priced to sell 

at $141,000.00.

615-735-2244

IN THE GENERAL 

SESSIONS COURT 

FOR JACKSON 

COUNTY, 

TENNESSEE

TONY DEWAYNE 

BURTON,

Petitioner,
VERSUS NO. 2020-

DV-4

JAMIE NICOLE 

BURTON

Respondent
ORDER OF 

PUBLICATION

It appearing from the 
petition in this case, which 
is shown to, that JAMIE 
NICOLE BURTON, re-
side out of state and her 
residence is unknown and 
that service of process by 
direct mail, return receipt 
requested or by personal 
service by the Sheriff’s 
Office was not an option. 
It is ordered that publica-
tion be made for four (4) 
consecutive weeks in the 
Jackson County Sentinel, 
a newspaper published 
at Gainesboro, TN, in 
Jackson County, Tennes-
see, requiring the said 
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 HELP WANTED: Ansei 
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plications for the follow-
ing position: 1st shift As-
sembly position, starting 
$9.50 an hour, 2nd shift 
Assembly position, start-
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Restrictions apply. Call 

IVS - 1-844-230-4803 
(TnScan)

DENTAL INSURANCE 
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scription necessary. Call 
Today 1-844-677-8780 
(TnScan)
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across the state - One 
Call/Email for All! Con-
tact our classified dept.
or email bmoats@tnpress.
com (TnScan)

NEW STARTING 

BASE PAY - .50 cpm w/ 
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ELIMINATE GUTTER 

CLEANING FOREV-

ER! LeafFilter, the most 
advanced debris-blocking 
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Serving all your real estate needs

Clint Conner

Broker/Auctioneer

Samantha Conner

Realtor®

208 S. Jefferson Avenue Cookeville, TN 38501

(931) 644-7149
connerproperty@gmail.com

(931) 510-0746
connerexitrealty@gmail.com

HELP WANTED

seeking Housekeepers

Housekeeping positions available full-time and part-time. 

Cookeville Regional is looking for exceptional individuals 

to join our Healthcare Heroes in the Environmental Services 

Department. Our goal is to provide a superior level of cleaning 

quality for our patients. 

Exceptional benefits available day thirty-one for full-time staff.  

High School Diploma/GED and previous experience preferred. 

For more information and to apply go to

www.crmchealth.org

E.O.E.

COOKEVILLE REGIONAL
M E D I C A L C E N T E R

“School News Hotline”
For up to date

information about

Jackson County 

Schools, call

268-4050

401 N. Spring St., Livingston • Of�ice: 931.823.3340 • Cell: 931.445.5305

We Service All Brands 
FREE Estimates

24 Hour Service 

Electric & Plumbing Available

Used 

Appliances 

with a 30-day 

Warranty. 

Call for details.

TN CMC Licensed 

Contractor & 

Insured

Contractors 

License

931.265.3575
Septic Tanks • Field Line

Septic Pumping 
Excavating •Skid Steer Work

 Tyler Smith     Monroe, TN

Smith’s Septics
WARDEN’S BACKHOE & LOADER SERVICE

127 Big Branch Rd. • Granville, TN 38564

Ted Warden, Owner Phone: (931) 268-0075

 Cell: (931) 267-9763

WARDEN’S BACKHOE & LOADER SERVICE

127 Big Branch Rd. • Granville, TN 38564
Water Lines Septic Tanks Field Lines

Dirt Hauling (Field Dirt & Top Soil) Basements Bush Hog & Spraying

Pond Cleaning & Digging Free Estimates Land Clearing
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Discover Something New 
Together

Build Vocabulary• 

Improve Reading • 
& Critical Thinking 

Skills

Promote Social • 
Consciousness

When You Read The 

Newspaper Together, 

You Learn Together
211 S. Main St., 

Gainesboro, TN

(931) 268-9725

Fun In A Winter Wonderland 

(Pictured Above) Snow 
Family – The Spiveys 
had fun in the snow last 
week creating their own 
snow family. Pictured 
with their snow family are 
Billy and Selina Spivey 
and their three children 
Banx, Baylah, and Brys-
tal. The photo was taken 
by Billy’s mother, Delisa 
Spivey. 

(Pictured Left) Snow 
Dog – Bam Bam had fun 
playing and running in 
the recent snowfall.

SENTINEL Photo / Matthew Stafford

SENTINEL Photo / Submitted

The final weeks of 
winter, and even the first 
few weeks of spring, are 
still chilly in many parts 
of the world. Despite 
those last vestiges of 
winter chills, late winter 
is a great time to begin 
preparing gardens for the 
coming planting season.

Gardens may have 
to withstand months of 
harsh weather each win-

ter, and such conditions 
can take a toll. Garden-

ers can consider the fol-
lowing tips as they try to 
restore their gardens and 
get them ready for spring 
planting.

Disinfect Your Tools 
It’s common to clean 

tools in late fall or when-

ever they’re typically 
placed in storage for 
the winter. But clean-

ing and disinfecting are 
not necessarily the same 
thing. If tools were not 
disinfected at the end of 
the previous gardening 
season, disinfect them 
before doing any work 
on the garden. Doing so 
can ensure any lingering 
bacteria or fungi on tool 
surfaces are killed prior 
to the beginning of gar-
dening season. Accord-

ing to the University of 
Minnesota Extension, 
plant pathogens, includ-

ing bacteria and viruses, 
can be transferred to and 
infect plants through bits 
of soil and plant debris 
left on shovels and prun-

er blades. Thoroughly 
disinfecting such tools 
prior to using them in the 
spring is a great way to 
reduce the risk of disease 
in your garden.

Clear Debris From 
Garden Beds

How To Prepare A 
Garden For Spring 

 Leaves, twigs, sticks, 
and other debris may 
have gathered in the 
garden over the winter. 
Such debris can inhibit 
the growth of plants and 
vegetables, so make sure 
all of it is removed prior 
to planting. Weeds might 
even begin to sprout up 
in late winter and early 
spring, so remove them 
before they go to seed.

Test The Soil
Testing the soil prior 

to planting can help gar-
deners determine what 
their gardens will need 
to thrive in the coming 
months. Garden centers 
and home improvement 
stores sell home testing 
kits that are effective and 
easy to use. Once the re-

sults are in, speak with a 
professional at your local 
garden center about the 
best time to amend the 
soil.
Loosen Compacted Soil

Soil can become 
compacted over winter. 
If compacted soil is not 
loosened prior to plant-
ing, plants will have a 
hard time getting the 
water and nutrients they 
need to thrive. Loosen-

ing the soil also provides 
another opportunity to 
inspect the garden for 
any underlying issues, 
such as fungi or weed 
growth, that you may 
have missed when clear-
ing debris or testing the 
soil.

Late winter is a good 
time to assess a garden 
and address any issues 
that developed over the 
winter so plants and veg-

etables can thrive come 
the spring planting sea-

son. 


