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SPORTS COVID-19 UPDATELIFESTYLES

JCHS plays Watertown and Mt. 

Pleasant 

       See page  8

Blast from the past.

       See page  2

50
cents

Residential Fire Total Loss 

Structure Fire – The house continued to smoke   

after fire broke out early Tuesday, Nov. 24.
Assesses The Fire – Assistant Chief Isaac Davis 
is assessing the fire scene on Maple Street. 

In the early morning 
hours of Tuesday, Nov. 
24, the fire departments 
were called to 401 Ma-
ple Street with reports of 
a structure fire. 

Upon arriving on 
scene the crews found 
a single story structure 

with heavy fire coming 
from the eaves of the 
roof. All occupants had 
exited the home safely. 
The fire continued to 
rekindle throughout the 
day and into the next 
morning. 

At approximately 

1:15 a.m. on Wednesday 
morning, Nov. 25 the 
fire had rekindled and 
was fully involved. The 
crews worked through 
the morning to extin-
guish the blaze. 

Departments respond-
ing were: Gainesboro 

City Fire Department, 
Central Fire Depart-
ment, Flynn’s Lick Fire 
Department, Name-
less Fire Department, 
JCEMS, Gainesboro 
Police Department and 
Upper Cumberland 
Electric.

This snapshot was made available on: Nov.29
As of Nov. 22 Jackson County is in the Red Zone 

Total Active: 53
Total Recovered: 631
Hospitalizations: 24

Deaths: 10
Positivity Rate: 20.4 %

Tennessee newspaper 
reporters congregated in 
a community call with 
Governor Bill Lee on 
Wednesday afternoon 
and heard updates sur-
rounding COVID-19 as 
case numbers, hospital-
izations and deaths con-
tinue to ravage many 
communities.

The day of the tele-
conference, Tennessee 
had a total of 39,406 
active cases, 2,183 hos-
pitalizations and 4,466 
deaths. The state remains 
a hotspot in the country as 
cases continue to rise and 
as of Nov. 6 ranks fifth in 
the country in the number 
of deaths per capita.

“The numbers are 
certainly up,” Lee stated. 
“Our case counts are up. 
Our hospitalizations are 
up. Our healthcare capac-
ity is down.”

Lee explained that the 
state is in a very chal-
lenging situation due to 
hospitals’ capacities. 

Because of these 
challenges he explained 
that it is important to re-
examine the way we live 
in our day-to-day lives 
until there is resolve in 
COVID-19.

“We’re encouraging 
Tennesseans to really 
think about how impor-
tant wearing a mask is,” 
he said. “How important 
gathering when you don’t 
have to is and how im-
portant that simple things 
that we can do and the 
choices that we make… 
Now is the time to begin, 
return to and continue re-

Governor Touts 
Importance Of Masks

MEGAN REAGAN
staff writer 

maining vigilant.”
While he touted the 

importance of mask 
wearing, he maintained 
that keeping masking de-
cisions in the hands of lo-
cal government is what is 
best for the state of Ten-
nessee.

At the time of the 
community call, Jackson 
County had a total of 66 
active cases, 24 hospital-
izations and 10 deaths.

Lee stated that masks 
are an important tool and 
is something that is non-
intrusive in day-to-day 
life.

In other business, he 
informed that vaccination 
efforts would shortly be-
gin trickling down to the 
population in phases and 
the state should see that 
start in early December.

He stated that vac-
cines would be available 
to the public in early 
Spring.

“Folks can begin to 
talk to their doctor to see 
if that would be a good 
choice for them or not,” 
he stated. “Of course in 
this state, it will remain a 
choice.”

Additionally, he com-
mented on the continu-
ation of the upward tra-
jectory of the economy 
as it continues to recover 
across the state.

“We have been very 
encouraged this year,” 
Lee said. “Particularly, 
our economies in our ru-
ral areas are outperform-
ing expectation and are 
doing better than they did 
a year ago.”

With no further busi-
ness to discuss, the con-
ference adjourned.

He Knows If You’ve 
Been Bad Or Good

Santa Claus Is Coming To Town –  The Jackson 

County Christmas parade is Saturday, Dec. 5 at 
5:30 p.m. If it is cancelled due to weather, it will be 
Monday, Dec. 7 at 5:30 p.m.

SENTINEL Photo / File Photo

Many Tennessee coun-
ties experienced changes 
in their unemployment 
rates during October 
2020, according to newly 
released data from the 
Tennessee Department of 
Labor and Workforce De-
velopment (TDLWD).

Unemployment in 93 
of Tennessee’s 95 coun-
ties increased in October. 

Davidson and Sevier 
counties saw their rates 
decrease during the 
month.

During October, two 
counties in the state had 
unemployment rates be-
low 5%, 90 counties had 
rates of 5% or greater, and 
three counties recorded 
rates of 10% or higher. 

Williamson County 
had the state’s lowest un-
employment in October 
with a rate of 4.6%, which 
is up 0.8 of a percentage 
point from its revised 
September rate of 3.8%. 

Shelby County re-
corded October’s highest 
jobless rate in Tennessee. 
At 11%, the county’s un-
employment increased by 
0.7 of a percentage point 
when compared to the 
previous month’s revised 
rate of 10.3%.

Regionally, Smith 
County had the lowest un-
employment rate at 5.5%, 
a 1.1 percentage point in-
crease from the previous 
month.

Overton County had a 
jobless rate of 6%, nearly 
two percentage points 
higher than September’s 
rate.

Jackson County had 
an unemployment rate 
7.4%, a 1.6 percentage 
point increase.

Clay County’s jobless 

County Unemployment Rates Increase
rate increased by nearly 
three percentage points, 
bringing the rate to 8.2%, 
which is the second high-
est in the region next to 
DeKalb County’s 8.4% 
jobless rate.

TDLWD has produced 
a report with a complete 
analysis of Tennessee’s 
October 2020 county un-
employment data. 

Tennessee’s statewide 
unemployment rate in-
creased during October. 
The preliminary, season-
ally adjusted, statewide 
unemployment rate for 
October 2020 is 7.4%, an 
increase of 0.9 of a per-
centage point from Sep-
tember’s revised rate of 
6.5%. 

Nationally, unem-

ployment decreased from 
September’s revised rate 
of 7.9% to 6.9% in Octo-
ber. The U.S. rate is 3.3 
percentage points higher 
than it was in October 
2019. 

Tennessee employ-
ers are ready to help the 
state’s economy rebound 
by hiring individuals to 
meet their business needs. 
Jobs4TN.gov, Tennes-
see’s workforce develop-
ment website, currently 
has over 240,000 open 
positions for workers of 
varying skill levels.

Jobs4TN.gov also of-
fers online assistance with 
writing a resume that will 
catch the attention of em-
ployers, advice on how to 
engage and impress dur-

ing job interviews and 
details about potential job 
training opportunities.

There are more than 
80 American Job Cen-
ters across Tennessee 
that are open for business 
and offering job seekers 
one-on-one personalized 
assistance. Career spe-
cialists are ready to work 
with individuals to devise 
a reemployment plan that 
will help them rejoin the 
state’s workforce. 

All the assistance is 
free to anyone who needs 
help finding a new job or 
career path.

The state of Tennessee 
will release the unemploy-
ment rate for November 
2020 on Thursday, Dec. 
17 at 1:30 p.m. 

Home Fire Total Loss 

Total Loss – On Nov. 19 at approximately 2 p.m. there was a structure fire at 
390 Holleman Bend Lane in Granville. When the fire departments arrived on 
scene the home was fully engulfed. No one was injured in the fire. The owner 
stated, “It may have started from the basement from the wood stove.” Fire de-

partments responding were, Dodson Branch Tanker 86, Granville FD Engine 
31, Flynns Lick Tanker 56, Smith County 201 District 2 Forks River, Central 
Fire Department and Nameless Fire Department.
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EDITORIAL 
POLICY

Letters to the editor must 
be signed and include 
the address of the writer.  
The name will be pub-
lished with the letter, but 
the address will be with-
held.  Unsigned letters 
will not be considered.

It is our right to reject 
any and / or all letters 
we deem questionable.  
Readers are encouraged 
to write letters to the 
editor as this is your 
forum.

Editorials do not neces-
sarily reflect the opinions 
or ideas of the publishers 
or editors of the Jackson 

County Sentinel.
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38562 by Holler Media, LLC.  All information herein is protected 
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Brown’s Recycling
1500 Shepardsville Hwy., 

Granville, TN 38564
Monday-Friday 7:00-4:00

Saturday 7:00-4:00 • Sunday 1:00-4:00

We buy all scrap 

aluminum & metal
Roll off container bins available for landfill

 & scrap metal

Office (931) 653-4355 • Cell (931) 510-4138

From Gainesboro, take Hwy. 56 South, turn right on Shepardsville 
Hwy./290, go 8 miles and turn left at 1500 Shepardsville Hwy.

3 Rooms Carpet and Pad

$69900
Installed

based on 468
sq. ft. plus
tax, see store
for details

Bowman’s Carpet Outlet
275 S. Willow Ave.

931-528-5728

FINANCING

AVAILABLE

Blast From The Past 

JC Courthouse – This is the second of a total of four courthouses that Jackson County has had. This 
courthouse stood from 1903-1926.

The Foundation for 
Rural Service (FRS) to-
day announced the recip-
ients of 23 grants totaling 
$104,000 to advance the 
quality of life and enable 
economic development 
in communities served 
by members of NTCA–
The Rural Broadband 
Association. 

Twin Lakes is pleased 
to announce Baxter Fire 
Department and Jackson 
County Middle School as 
two of these grant recipi-
ents. Baxter Fire Depart-
ment received $5,000 

Rural Service Grant Award
Awarded To Area Places

to purchase a thermal 
imaging camera to pro-
vide firefighters with the 
ability to see objects and 
people in the dark and 
smoke-filled environ-
ments. Jackson County 
Middle School received 
$4,900 to purchase iP-
ads, Apple Pencils, and 
a 360-degree camera to 
provide better instruc-
tion and access for vir-
tual students.

“Especially during 
the ongoing pandemic, 
the work or projects 
these grant recipients are 

going to accomplish will 
make a significant impact 
in their communities,” 
said FRS Executive Di-
rector Pam Becker. “It 
is more important than 
ever before to expand 
telemedicine options and 
ensure that students have 
access to technology. We 
are grateful for all our 
recipients’ hard work, 
the NTCA members 
that endorsed them and 
continue to help their 
communities, and to our 
grant sponsor Womble 
Bond Dickinson.” 

Tennessee has been 
selected as one of four 
states to participate in 
a pilot program for de-
livery of the Pfizer Inc. 
COVID-19 vaccine now 
under development. This 
program is designed to 
address distribution chal-
lenges posed by require-
ments for ultra-cold stor-
age of the vaccine.

“We have a robust 
plan in place for distri-
bution of this vaccine, 
and we’re honored to be 
chosen to help establish 
a model for other states 
in providing COVID-19 
vaccine to their residents 
once it’s approved,” said 
Tennessee Health Com-
missioner Lisa Piercey, 
MD, MBA, FAAP.

Tennessee will par-
ticipate in the pilot along 
with New Mexico, Rhode 
Island and Texas, states 
chosen based on their dif-
ferences in size, popula-
tion diversity and immu-

Tennessee Selected As 
Participant For Vaccine Pilot

nization infrastructure. 
Lessons learned through 
this program will help 
support all states in de-
velopment of effective 
immunization programs 
for this COVID-19 vac-
cine.

Once the vaccine is 
approved, Tennessee and 
other states participating 
in the pilot will not re-
ceive vaccine doses ear-
lier than other states by 
virtue of the pilot. Pfizer 
is working with Opera-
tion Warp Speed and the 
Centers for Disease Con-
trol and Prevention to 
ensure that following ap-
proval, their COVID-19 
vaccine can be provided 
to those most in need as 
quickly and equitably as 
possible.   

TDH in coordination 
with other state and local 
agencies submitted an ini-
tial draft of the COVID-
19 Vaccination Plan for 
Tennessee to the CDC on 

Oct. 16. This plan will be 
modified as more is un-
derstood about the virus 
and the availability of ap-
proved vaccines currently 
in development. Tennes-
see is preparing to begin 
distribution of COVID-
19 vaccine as early as 
December 2020.

TDH is working to 
onboard hospitals, phar-
macies, clinics and other 
partners capable of stor-
ing vaccine and adminis-
tering it to priority popu-
lations. TDH will ensure 
distribution of vaccina-
tion sites across all 95 
counties, especially in 
rural counties and areas 
with high concentrations 
of people in vulnerable 
populations. Providers 
who wish to administer 
COVID-19 vaccine may 
find more information 
online at www.tn.gov/
health/cedep/ncov/covid-
19-vaccine-information.
html.
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118 East First St. • Cookeville, TN
931-528-6403 • 800-339-2899

Mon-Thurs: 8 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Fri: 8 a.m. to noon

Please call to schedule a free 
consultation. There is no fee 
unless you win your case.

Social Security

Disability
Need help with your claim?

Melaney G.
Madewell

118 East First St. • Cookeville, TN
931-528-6403 • 800-339-2899

Mon-Thurs: 8 a.m. to 3 p.m.
Fri: 8 a.m. to noon

Attorney-at-Law
Please call to schedule a free 
consultation. There is no fee 
unless you win your case.

Lanny Bart Kirby
Lanny Bart Kirby, 61, 

of Gainesboro, passed 
away on Nov. 23 at his 
residence. Funeral servic-
es were held Nov. 29 at 
Anderson Upper Cum-
berland Funeral Home 
with Bro. Don Bryant 
officiating. Interment fol-
lowed in the Fox-Chaffin 
Cemetery.

He was born Jan. 6, 
1959 in Jackson County. 
He retired from William 

Carlene Wade 
Hensley

Carlene Wade Hensley, 
77, of Cookeville, passed 
away Nov. 20 at Cookev-
ille Regional Medical 
Center. Funeral services 
were held Nov. 23 at 
Anderson Upper Cum-
berland Funeral Home 
with Dale Crossman and 
Douglas Hensley officiat-
ing. Interment followed in 

the Hensley Cemetery.
She was born April 19, 

1943 in Baxter. She was 
a fabric and shoe sales-
person and also worked 
in health care services. 
She loved to sew and to 
be called “Nannoo.” She 
was a member of the Zion 
Church of Christ.

She was preceded in 
death by: parents, Floyd 
Wade and Bertha Jared 

Wade; infant son; broth-
ers, Lester Wade, Gerald 
Wade, James Henry Wade 
and Joe Ray Wade; and 
sisters, Nell Dean Terry, 
Betty Sue Russel and 
Ruth Lee Scarlett.

Surviving relatives in-
clude: husband, Carrol F. 
Hensley of Cookeville; 
daughters, Sonya Hensley 
and husband, Kenny Pate 
of Cookeville and Dianne 

Hensley of Cookeville; 
grandchildren, Douglas 
Hensley and wife, Kim-
berly of Sparta and Hil-
lary Flatt and husband, 
Sean of Cookeville; great 
grandchildren, Zane Flatt 
and Pate Flatt, both of 
Cookeville and Liliauna 
Hensley of Sparta; and 
a host of nieces, neph-
ews, other relatives and 
friends.

Matilda Ann Scott 
Stewart

Matilda Ann Scott 
Stewart, 85, of Cookeville, 
passed away Nov. 23 at 
her residence. Funeral ser-
vices were held Nov. 28 at 
Anderson Upper Cum-
berland Funeral Home 
with Bro. Danny Scott 
officiating. Interment fol-
lowed in the Smith’s Cha-
pel Cemetery in Putnam 
County. Pallbearers were 
Ronnie Scott, Tim, Scott, 
Harold Scott, Jeff Scott, 
Michael Burris and John-
ny Pearson.

She was born Jan. 1, 
1935 in Jackson County. 
She was a homemaker and 
her hobbies included gar-
dening, sewing, shopping 
and visiting with her fami-
ly and friends. She attend-
ed the Fairview Church of 
Christ in Putnam County.

She was preceded in 
death by: parents, Morgan 
and Mamie Scott; hus-
band, Oplis Armel Stew-
art; stepdaughter, Rita De-
weese; stepson, Tommy 
Stewart; brothers, Andy 
Scott, Jerry Scott, Hamp 
Scott, Walton Scott and 

Curtis Scott; and sisters, 
Mary Scott Pound, Sally 
Scott Masters and Myrtle 
Scott Phillips.

Surviving relatives in-
clude: children, Patricia 
Lafever Johnson (Kirby) 
of Cookeville, Joann 
Abrams (Eric) of Kings-
ton, Ga., Peggy Stewart 
of Gainesboro and Gerald 
Stewart of Cookeville; 
grandchildren, Brooke 
Young (Josh), Kelly Rice 
(Chanse), Justin Lafe-
ver (Sarah), Shane and 
Betsy Stewart and Jewel 
Beaty; stepchildren, Faye 

Ramsey of Cookeville, 
Janie White (Bill) of 
Oak Ridge, Gary Stew-
art (Pam) of Cookeville 
and Donna Lafever (Hal) 
of Silver Point; brothers, 
Odell Scott (Marie) of 
Cookeville and Richard 
Scott of Gainesboro; sis-
ters, Carolyn Scott Burris 
of Gainesboro and Cathy 
Scott Stafford of Algood; 
several great grandchil-
dren, step-grandchildren 
and step-great grandchil-
dren; and several nieces, 
nephews, other relatives 
and friends.

Bonnell after 39 years 
and was a member of 
the Lakeview Church of 
Christ. He liked to hunt 
and enjoyed UT Foot-
ball. 

Lanny was so proud 
of his family. He was the 
best father and father-
in-law to Heath (Krista), 
Torrey, and Ethan (Ol-
ivia) and the best grand-
father to Amara. He was 
always supporting them 
anyway he could, helping 

them with their cars and 
homes, and offering ad-
vice, generosity, encour-
agement, comfort, and 
many, many laughs.

He was preceded in 
death by: parents, Wil-
liam Kirby and Valmon 
Lambert Kirby; and sis-
ter, Debbie Moss.

Surviving relatives 
includes: wife, Kay Kir-
by of Gainesboro; sons, 
Heath (Krista Billings-
ley) Kirby of St. Peters-

burg, Fla., Torrey Kirby 
of Gainesboro and Ethan 
(Olivia) Kirby of Whit-
leyville; grandchild, 
Amara Ellawyn Kirby-
Billingsley; brother, Ken-
ny Kirby of Cookeville; 
sisters, Donna Mabery of 
Gainesboro, Sherry Thur-
man of Cookeville and 
Renee Martin of Gaines-
boro; granddogs, Bash, 
Finn, Chester and Sam; 
and other relatives and 
friends.

David Earl Byers
David Earl Byers, 79, 

of Cookeville, passed 
away Nov. 23 at Vander-

bilt University Medical 
Center. Funeral services 
were held Nov. 28 from 
the chapel of Crest Lawn 
Funeral Home with Bro. 
David Flatt officiating. 
Interment followed in 
the Byers Cemetery. 

He was born July 
26, 1941 in Gainesboro. 
He loved country mu-
sic, dancing, camping, 
spending time with fam-
ily, butterscotch candy 
and riding the roads.

He was preceded in 

death by: parents, Wil-
liam and Laura (Haney) 
Byers; first wife, Edith 
(Pippin) Byers; daughter, 
Sharon Hickey; mother in 
law, Rosie Pippin; sisters 
in law, IV Byers, Peggy 
Jackson, Betty Randolph 
and Peggy Pippin; and 
brother-in-law, Fred Pip-
pin.

Surviving relatives 
include: wife, Glenna 
Byers of Cookeville; 
daughters, Karen and 
Michael Buckner of 

Knoxville, Patti and Ken 
Smith of Cookeville and 
Melissa Elrod of Cookev-
ille; sons, Billy and Sta-
cey Byers of Cookeville, 
Dwayne Jones of Sparta 
and Darrell Jones of Liv-
ingston; 13 grandchil-
dren; six greatgrandchil-
dren; sister, Wanda and 
Gary Epling of Nash-
ville; brothers, Louis 
Byers of Cookeville and 
Roy and Charlene Byers 
of Cookeville; and a host 
of nieces and nephews

December 5, 1974

Unemployment Claims 
Double Last Year’s
Claims for unemploy-

ment compensation filed 
in the Cookeville office 
that handles claims from 
Jackson County and five 
other counties are run-
ning more than double 
last year’s rate.

The Cookeville of-
fice handles claims from 
Jackson, Overton, Put-
nam, Clay, Pickett and 
Fentress Counties.

Claims Manager Clyde 
Warren of the Cookeville 
Office said that they pro-
cess 1,880 claims during 
the week ending Nov. 23. 

A Week In Jackson County  History

Last year they processed 
800 claims at this time. 
Monument Erected To 

Honor War Vets
A monument to honor 

all who served and those 
who gave their life for 
their country was erected 
on the courthouse lawn 
here last Wednesday. The 
marker, made possible by 
the citizens of Jackson 
County, was constructed 
and erected by Young’s 
Marble and Granite of 
Hilham.

The inscription on 
the front of the monu-
ment reads, “In honor of 
all who served our coun-
try and dedicated to the 
memory of those who 

made the Supreme Sacri-
fice—Erected by the citi-
zens of Jackson County 
1974.”

Jaycee Club Being 
Organized Here

Thursday, Nov. 21, a 
group of interested young 
men, ages 18-35 met in 
the community room of 
the Jackson County Bank 
for the purpose of form-
ing a local Chapter of the 
International Jaycee.
Tips For Shopping For 

Perfect Toys
With the thousands of 

toys displayed for Christ-
mas, it’s not hard to un-
derstand why many par-
ents, family and friends 
looking for the “perfect” 

toy for a child can be eas-
ily bewildered.

What makes a toy 
“perfect?” Important cri-
teria for buying toys for 
children are that they are 
both fun and safe, points 
out the Health Insurance 
Institute.

Brown Meadows 
Furniture Company

Speed Queen Washer 
and Dryer $485.00.

Amana Trash Com-
pactor $199.95.

3 Piece White French 
Bedroom Suite $249.95.

18” Admiral Portable 
Black and White T.V. 
$119.95.

Dycus Super Market
Morton Pot Pies 4 for 

$1.00.
Florida Juicy Oranges 

3 dozen $1.00.
Colonial Milk 1/2 gal-

lon  $.69.
Pampers Diapers 12-

15 ct $1.09.

Engagements, Weddings 

& Birth Announcements

are NO CHARGE 

Deadline: 4 p.m. Friday prior to following week’s edition.

Email jcsentineloffice@twlakes.net or bring them by the 
office at South Main Street, Gainesboro.

Share your life events with Sentinel Readers!

First comes LOVE...

Then comes marriage...

T hen comes baby in the 

baby carriage
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Breakfast Is

Served!
185 S. Grundy Quarles Hwy • Gainesboro, TN 

931-268-2286

Giovanni’s Pizza 
& Italian Restaurant

452 N. Grundy 

quarles hwy.

931-268-3404

Jackson County

Farm Bureau
268-0305

P.O. Box 129 • 203 South Church Street
931-823-1274

LIVINGSTON

ENTERPRISE

GLADDICE
MISSIONARY BAPTIST

NEW HOPE
BAPTIST CHURCH

NEW ZION MISSIONARY
BAPTIST CHURCH

SPRING CREEK
THE BAPTIST CHURCH

DODSON BRANCH 
SOUTHERN BAPTIST 

CHURCH

GAINESBORO FIRST 
BAPTIST CHURCH

CUMMINS MILL
BAPTIST CHURCH

ST. THOMAS AQUINAS

BEECH GROVE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

BAGDAD
CHURCH OF CHRIST

 
BURRISTOWN

CHURCH OF CHRIST

CENTER GROVE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

CHURCH OF CHRIST

DUDNEY’S HILL
CHURCH OF CHRIST

FREEWILL COMMUNITY
CHURCH OF CHRIST

FLYNN’S CREEK
CHURCH OF CHRIST

GIBSON AVENUE
CHURCH OF CHRIST

HAYDENBURG
CHURCH OF CHRIST

HURRICANE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

FREESTATE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

LAKEVIEW

CHURCH OF  CHRIST

LIBERTY

CHURCH OF  CHRIST

MCCOINSVILLE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

MORRISON CREEK

CHURCH OF CHRIST

NEW SALEM 

CHURCH OF CHRIST

NORTH  SPRINGS

CHURCH  OF CHRIST

PLEASANT HILL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

 

RICHMOND CHAPEL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

SHILOH

CHURCH OF CHRIST

STONE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

SUGAR CREEK

CHURCH OF CHRIST

WHITE’S BEND

CHURCH OF CHRIST

 

UNION HILL

CHURCH OF CHRIST

WHITLEYVILLE

CHURCH OF CHRIST

ZION CHURCH OF CHRIST

JEHOVAH’S WITNESSES

CURRY CHAPEL UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

FAIRVIEW FREE
METHODIST CHURCH

GAINESBORO FIRST
UNITED METHODIST

GRANVILLE UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

MOUNT UNION UNITED
METHODIST CHURCH

WARTRACE COMMUNITY
CHURCH

MOUNTAIN CHAPEL 
MINISTRY

SONLIGHT CHURCH  

POSTON’S COMMUNITY
CHAPEL CHURCH

 
MT. PLEASANT 

COUNTRY
CHURCH OF GOD

OLD ANTIOCH
COMMUNITY CHURCH

NEW HOPE  COMMUNITY

WORLD OUTREACH 
 

PLEASANT GROVE
PRESBYTERIAN 

CHURCH
 

BURRISTOWN
ASSEMBLY OF GOD

DILLARD’S CREEK
COMMUNITY CHURCH

THE LIFE HOUSE CHURCH

JC CHRISTIAN 
FELLOWSHIP

BAPTIST CHURCH OF CHRIST

METHODIST

OTHER

JEHOVAH’S WITNESS

CATHOLIC

CHURCH OF CHRIST

H & H 
Hardware

and 
Lumber

312 Birch St.
931-268-9444

Upper Cumberland

Real Estate, LLC
101 E. Gore Ave. 

(Historic Public Square)

Gainesboro, TN 38562

(Office) 
931-268-6767

(Fax) 

931-268-1313

(Toll Free) 

1-800-268-8002

R.L. Meadows
Insurance Agency

205 S. Main Street • GaineSboro
931-268-0434

All lines of 

insurAnce

OwNER - 
Gary C. Gill

SwallowsInsurance.com

We Concentrate on SERVICE.

We Concentrate on YOU.

• Auto • Home  • Health 
• Business • Liability • Life

Cookeville
Radiator Shop
435 W. Broad street, cookeville

931-526-2013

open: Mon.-fri. 7 am-5 pm; 

sat. 8 am-12 pm

 • New & Rebuilt 
radiators in stock

• Gas Tanks Cleaned & 
Repaired & Coated

Anderson-Upper Cumberland 
Funeral Home

2131 S. Grundy Quarles
931-268-1550  
931-858-7474  
931-268-0266
Obituary Line:  
931-268-1551

Gaw Family Dentistry
GENERAL • COSMETIC

931-268-2869   WWW.GAWDENTISTRY.COM 
New patients welcome!

Winter can be an 
awe-inspiring time of 
year. Snow-covered 
landscapes and opportu-
nities to enjoy sports like 
skiing and snowboarding 
make winter a favorite 
time of year for nature 
enthusiasts and athletes.

as fun as winter can 
be, many people strug-
gle with the transition 
from warm weather and 
long, sunny days to cold 
weather and reduced 
hours of sunlight. Some-
times mistaken or mis-
identified as the “winter 
blues,” this phenomenon 
is known as seasonal 
affective disorder, or 
SaD.

What Is Seasonal 
Affective Disorder?
according to the Na-

tional institutes of Men-
tal Health, SaD is a type 
of depression. The NiH 
notes that a person must 
meet full criteria for ma-

Strategies To Overcome Seasonal Affective Disorder
jor depression coincid-
ing with specific seasons 
for at least two years to 
be diagnosed with SaD. 
The american Psychi-
atric association says 
symptoms of SaD can 
be distressing and over-
whelming and even in-
terfere with daily func-
tioning.

The aPa notes that 
SaD has been linked 
to a biochemical imbal-
ance in the brain that’s 
prompted by shorter 
daylight hours and less 
sunlight in winter. as the 
seasons change, a shift in 
a person’s biological in-
ternal clock or circadian 
rhythm can lead to them 
being out of step with 
their normal routines. 
That can contribute to 
various symptoms, in-
cluding:

Feeling sad or de-
pressed, loss of interest 
or pleasure in activities 

once enjoyed, Changes 
in appetite, usually eat-
ing more and craving 
carbohydrates, loss of 
energy or increased fa-
tigue despite increased 
sleep hours, increase 
in purposeless physi-
cal activity or slowed 
movements or speech 
that may be noticed by 
others, Feeling worth-
less or guilty, Difficulty 
thinking, concentrating 
or making decisions, 
Thoughts of death or 
suicide

Overcoming SAD
The weather can’t be 

changed, but people can 
speak with their physi-
cians about the follow-
ing strategies to over-
come SaD.

Light Therapy
according to the 

aPa, light therapy in-
volves sitting in front of 
a light therapy box that 
emits a very bright light. 

in the winter, patients 
typically sit in front of 
the box for 20 minutes 
each morning, and they 
may see some improve-
ments within one to 
two weeks of beginning 
treatment. light thera-
py is usually continued 
throughout the winter.

Medication
The aPa notes that 

selective serotonin 
reuptake inhibitors, or 
SSris, are a type of 
antidepressant that are 
sometimes prescribed to 
treat SaD.

Spending Time 
Outdoors

People with SaD 
who don’t typically 
spend much time out-
doors when the tem-
peratures dip may notice 
their symptoms improve 
if they make a concerted 
effort to spend time out-
doors in winter.

Rearrange Rooms In 

The Home
The aPa notes that 

rearranging rooms and 
furniture in a home or 
office to allow more 
natural light in during 
the daytime can help 
improve symptoms of 
SaD.

SaD is a legitimate 
concern for millions of 
people across the globe. 
Working with a physi-
cian to overcome SaD 
can help people success-
fully transition to days 
with fewer hours of sun-
light. 

Seasonal Mood Disorder – SAD is a legitimate 
concern for millions of people across the globe. 
Working with a physician to overcome SAD can help 
people successfully transition to days with fewer 
hours of sunlight.  



See this week’s 
answers in next 
week’s edition of 

the Sentinel 

CROSSWORD

ARIES 

Mar 21/Apr 20

Aries, this week you 

feel more energized and 

ready to hit the ground run-

ning with a special project 

at work. It’s also a great 

time to do something for 

yourself.

TAURUS

Apr 21/May 21

Taurus, a couple of 

days this week you may 

need to roll over and catch 

a couple extra minutes 

with your head on the pil-

low. Being extra tired may 

indicate you need to scale 

back.

GEMINI

May 22/Jun 21

A social butterfly, you 
are eager to socialize this 

week, Gemini. Figure out 

a day when a few friends 

are available to get togeth-

er and catch up. Then plan 

an event.

CANCER

Jun 22/Jul 22

Cancer, it is essential 

to practice self-care; oth-

erwise, you easily can run 

yourself ragged. Put your-

self ahead of others some-

time this week, even if it 

feels indulgent.

LEO

Jul 23/Aug 23

Leo, take an opportu-

nity to share your big heart 

with someone who may 

need an extra emotional 

boost. Spend some quality 

time with this individual.

VIRGO

Aug 24/Sept 22

Virgo, you are eager to 

get caught up in all the de-

tails. This can keep you on 

track and orderly, but you 

may miss some spontane-

ity if you’re always fol-

lowing the rules.

LIBRA

Sept 23/Oct 23

Relationships are in-

portant to you, Libra. You 

may be eager to develop 

some new friendships in 

the days to come. Think 

about pursuing new hob-

bies or interests.

SCORPIO

Oct 24/Nov 22

Scorpio, everyone 

around you knows if they 

put you in charge you will 

get the job done success-

fully. But others may not 

be in tune with who you 

are, so open up a little bit.

SAGITTARIUS

Nov 23/Dec 21

Sagittarius, you are al-

ways eager to learn new 

things. This week take 

time to explore the world 

around you and pick up 

some facts along the way.

CAPRICORN

Dec 22/Jan 20

It can be challenging 

to find a balance between 
giving your all at work and 

enjoying your personal 

life. That’s because you’re 

such a hard worker. Devote 

more time to home.

AQUARIUS

Jan 21/Feb 18

The smallest steps can 

lead to the greatest results, 

Aquarius. Don’t discount 

any strides you make in the 

direction of success. You 

will get there eventually.

PISCES

Feb 19/Mar 20

Be mindful of where 

your dollars are going, 

Pisces. This will help you 

strike a greater balance 

between spending and sav-

ing.

ACROSS
1 “Grand”
5 Letterman’s network
8 Out of control
12 Suspend
13 Weeding tool
14 Wise one
15 Killer whale
16 Lineage
18 Astronauts’ descent   
 to  Earth
20 Locations
21 Comic DeLuise
22 Satchel
23 “Forget it!”
26 Nation
30 Lawyers’ org.
31 Sly one
32 Nay opponent
33 Racism, e.g.
36 Aden’s land
38 Bill and --
39 Adams or 
 Ameche

40 Clean software
43 Turducken, e.g.
47 Immoderate devotion
49 Met melody
50 Taj Mahal city
51 Trouble
52 Ring up
53 Lecherous look
54 Possess
55 Duel tool

DOWN
1 Valhalla VIP
2 Aesopian also-ran
3 Formerly
4 Landlocked African   
 nation
5 Amulet
6 Skeletal
7 Moment
8 Delegate
9 Dillon or Damon
10 Shrek, for one
11 Jailer’s janglers
17 Jacob’s brother

19 Plaything
22 Carton
23 Apprehend
24 Japanese 
 sash
25 Witty one
26 Coquettish
27 Scot’s hat
28 Deli bread
29 Longing
31 To and --
34 Eye-related
35 Forum garment
36 Second person
37 Intertwine
39 Senior member
40 Soap brand
41 Advantage
42 Drill
43 Front of a ship
44 Snare
45 Irritate
46 New Haven campus
48 Pair
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The Blue Devils bas-
ketball teams of Jackson 
County High School 
took the court to face 
Watertown, on Tuesday, 
Nov. 24.

The Lady Blue Devils 
lost to the Lady Purple 
Tigers 60-30.

Scoring for the girls 
against Watertown were: 
Ericka Davidson with 
six, Riley Thomas with 
six, Nikki Ragland with 

three, Lilly Chaffin with 
five, Rebecca Harris with 
one, Emma Chaffin with 
one, Emma Stepp with 
five and Rachel Harris 
with three.

“We played ok the 
first half. We missed a lot 
of shots early and made a 
few miscues defensively. 
We played better than 
we did our first game. 
Hopefully we can keep 
improving each game,” 
Coach Jim Brown said.

The JCHS Blue Dev-
ils also lost to the Purple 

Tigers 90-75.
Scoring for the boys 

against Watertown were: 
Hayden Stacy with four, 
Jordan Arroyo with two, 
Ramon Cuevas with 22, 
Eli Burris with 26, Chris 
Pigg with 11, Andrew Al-
len with six, and Braden 
Jones with four.

“We had another poor 
effort defensively along 
with too many turnovers 
in the backcourt for easy 
buckets for them that led 
to us taking the loss. We 
have to regroup because 

we have another athletic 
team coming here Sat-
urday at 3 p.m.,” Coach 
Kevin Thomas said.

Following the game 
against Watertown was a 
game against Mt. Pleas-
ant on Saturday, Nov. 28.

The Lady Blue Devils 
beat the Lady Tigers 56-
27.

Scoring for the girls 
against Mt. Pleasant 
were: Ericka Davidson 
with 13, Riley Thomas 
with two, Nikki Ragland 
with four, Lilly Chaffin 

with 10, Rebecca Harris 
with four, Emma Chaffin 
with six, Emma Crockett 
with seven, Emma Stepp 
with four and Erin Da-
vidson with two.

The JCHS Blue Dev-
ils also beat the Tigers 
65-49.

Scoring for the boys 
against Mt. Pleasant 
were: Hayden Stacy with 
four, Jordan Arroyo with 
22, Ramon Cuevas with 
25, Eli Burris with five, 
Chris Pigg with four, 
Drew Clinard with three 

and Alex Johnson with 
two.

“We played better de-
fense tonight especially 
in the 3rd quarter holding 
them to six points. That 
really helped us get some 
separation at that point in 
the game,” Coach Kevin 
Thomas said.

The Blue Devils will 
take the court again 
Monday, Nov. 30 at Wa-
tertown at 6 p.m. and 
Tuesday, Dec. 1 at home 
against Cascade at 6 
p.m.

Jackson County Blue Devils Split Games 

Pass It – Emma Chaffin looks for a teammate to pass the ball to.

Foul Shot – Lilly Chaffin looks to make a free throw against Mt. Pleasant.

Inbound – Eli Burris looks to inbound the ball against Mt. Pleasant.

Are All Churches the Same?
There are many churches and many different teachings. 

There are different teachings on every subject in the Bible. 

The church you attend decides the teachings that you are 

taught, and churches come to these decisions in different 

ways. There are many who try to disregard these differences 

by suggesting that, while the churches are teaching different 

things, we all love God and that is what matters. The Bible 

doesn’t support this idea. John 14:21: “He who has My com-

mandments and keeps them, it is he who loves Me.” Jesus 

did not bring different commandments for different churches. 

The Bible tells us that we should all have the same teach-

ings. I Cor 1:10: “Now I plead with you, brethren, by the name 

of our Lord Jesus Christ, that you all speak the same thing, 

and that there be no divisions among you, but that you be 

perfectly joined together in the same mind and in the same 

judgement.” Churches with different teachings cannot be uni-

fied in judgement.
God does not approve of division. The only way this divi-

sion can be fixed is if we all agree to follow the command-

ments handed down in the Bible. Many churches are cur-

rently following the commands of men and not God. Many 

people who think they are following God are learning how 

little God has to do with the teachings of their church. Presby-

terian, United Methodist, and Episcopalians have all watched 

their church’s doctrine change to follow the Supreme Court’s 

ruling on same-sex marriage, while ignoring the Bible. God 
didn’t change the Bible, man changed. When the apostles 

Peter and John were warned to stop teaching about Jesus 

by religious leaders, they responded in Acts 4:19 “Whether 

it is right in the sight of God to listen to you more than to 

God, you judge. 20 For we cannot but speak the things which 

we have seen and heard.” Man’s rulings went against God’s 

commands. Peter and John said they have no choice except 
to follow God. Many churches do not feel the same way.

All churches are not the same. God wants us to teach the 

same thing. We can do it if we all commit to following the Bi-

ble. It may seem difficult, and sometimes it is, but God won’t 
ask us to do something we can’t do. 1 John 5:3: “For this is 

the love of God, that we keep His commandments. And His 

commandments are not burdensome.” Let us find the truth 
together. Come study the Bible with us and see what it says. 

Isaiah 1:18: “‘Come now, and let us reason together,’ says the 

LORD.”

Gipson Avenue Church of Christ

121 Pecan Street P.O. Box 503

Gainesboro, TN 38562

Minister Joe Kase 931-979-4092

SENTINEL Photos / Matthew Stafford
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IN THE CIRCUIT 

COURT JACKSON 

COUNTY, 

TENNESSEE AT 

GAINESBORO

JORJENNA LEE 

CHRISMAN,

PLANTIFF/WIFE

VS. Case No. 2020-
DV-1

JEMINI RAY 

CHRISMAN,

DEFENDANT/

HUSBAND

ORDER FOR 

SERVICE BY 

PUBLICATION

In this action, it ap-
pearing to the satisfac-
tion of the Clerk, from 
the Plaintiff’s Complaint, 
which is sworn to and 
Motion and Order that 
has been filed in this 
Court, that the Defendant 
JEMINI RAY CHRIS-
MAN’s residence is un-
known and cannot be 
ascertained upon diligent 
inquiry so that the ordi-
nary process of law can-
not be personally served 
upon him. It is, therefore, 
ordered that publication 
be made in the Jack-
son County Sentinel, a 
newspaper published in 
the Town of Gainesboro, 
Tennessee, for four (4) 
consecutive weeks, com-
manding said Defendants 
to serve upon Jacquelyn 
M. Scott, Plaintiffs’ At-
torney, whose address is 
P.O. Box 283/216 North 
Main Street, Carthage, 
Tennessee 37030 a copy 
of his Answer to the 

Complaint on or before 
THIRTY DAYS of the 
date of the last publica-
tion of this notice and 
also file the original An-
swer to the Complaint 
with the Circuit Court 
Clerk at his office at 101 
E. Hull Ave, Gainesboro, 
TN 38562 within THIR-
TY DAYS from the last 
publication of this notice. 
If you fail to do so judg-
ment by default will be 
taken against you for the 
relief demanded in the 
complaint.

ENTERED this the 
9th day of October 2020.

JEFF HARDY, 
JACKSON CO. 

CIRCUIT COURT 
CLERK

JACQUELYN M. 
SCOTT, ATTORNEY 

FOR PLANTIFF
11-10, 11-17, 11-24, 

12-1 4TP

STATE OF 

TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 

JACKSON COUNTY 

AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Joe M. 
Jones

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 17th day of 
November, 2020, Letter 
of Testamentary, in re-
spect to the estate of Joe 
M. Jones, deceased, who 
died November 14, 2020 
were issued to the un-
dersigned by the Probate 
Court of Jackson County, 

Tennessee.
All persons, resident 

and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 17th day of 
November 2020.

Cathy Brown, 
Executrix

Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 
Clerk and Master

William L. Draper, 
Attorney for Estate                                                                                                                                  

11-24, 12-1 2TP

STATE OF 

TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 

JACKSON COUNTY 

AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: David 
Lester Butler

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 18th day of 
November, 2020, Let-
ter of Testamentary, in 
respect to the estate of 
David Lester Butler, de-
ceased, who died Octo-
ber 25, 2020 were issued 
to the undersigned by the 
Probate Court of Jackson 
County, Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-

lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 18th day of 
November, 2020.

Rita G. Moret, 
Executrix

Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 
Clerk and Master

Gregory L. Grothe, 
Attorney for Estate                                                                                                                                 

11-24-, 
12-1 2TP

STATE OF 

TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 

JACKSON COUNTY 

AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Wayne 
M. Mosher

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 17th day 
of November, 2020, Let-
ter of Testamentary, in 
respect to the estate of 
Wayne M. Mosher, de-

ceased, who died Octo-
ber 16, 2020 were issued 
to the undersigned by the 
Probate Court of Jackson 
County, Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 17th day of 
November, 2020.

Laura Lea Mosher, 
Executris

Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 
Clerk and Master

Lee G. Richardson, 
Attorney for Estate

11-24, 12-1 2TP

STATE OF 

TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 

JACKSON COUNTY 

AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 

CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Ronnie 
Ithel Skipper

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 20th day 
of November, 2020, Let-
ter of Testamentary, in 
respect to the estate of 
Ronnie Ithel Skipper, de-
ceased, who died Octo-
ber 15, 2020 were issued 
to the undersigned by the 
Probate Court of Jackson 
County, Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 

505 North Main St. • Carthage, TN
735-2244    Firm # 2547

Website:  www.poindexterrealty.com

Email: poindexterrealty@comcast.net

C. D. “DIGGER”

You can also view our listings at www.realtor.com

or www.realtracs.com.

Just enter the MLS number on the ad.

Just a few hun
dred feet to Cordell Hull Lake. We 
have 2.64 acres being mostly open 
and offering a great lake view. This 
property is septic approved and 
has city water available. Selling for 

 With a beautiful 
lake view we are offering this large 
brick split level home. This home of
fers an eat-in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, basement, den, ga
rage, paved and gravel drives. This 
home has 3 full baths and has been 
used for 4 bedrooms. You can walk 
across the road to the lake to fish. 
This home is priced at only 
$1,000 selling agent bonus with full 
price offer. 

 Unobstructed year 
round view of Cordell Hull Lake is 
just what this cute three bedroom, 
two bath vinyl sided home has to of
fer.  This home is ideal for a starter 
home or a lake house to get away 
to. Priced to sell at 

Offering a nice view 
of adjoining countryside we are of
fering 1.92 acres of pasture.  This 
tract is septic approved and has 
city water available. This nice tract 
is priced at only 
great possibilities.

Lakeview doesn’t describe the 
great view of the Cordell Hull Lake 
just across the road from this 2.68 
acres of level to gently sloping pas
ture land. This property is septic 
approved and has city water avail
able. This view can be yours for 

 REDUCED! Joining 
the Camp Discovery we have this 
28.12 acres with long road and 
Corps of Engineers frontage. This 
open and wooded acres offers five 
home sites septic approved and has 
beautiful views of Cordell Hull Lake. 

Overlooking Cordell Hull Lake we 
have this large corner lot being 
mostly wooded and slightly sloping 
to level. Public water and electric 
is available. This property is within 
walking distance of Salt Lick Camp
ground. Priced to sell at 

Within walking distance of Cordell 
Hull Lake we have this beautiful 126 
acres of mostly wooded land with 
marketable timber & the balance in 
pasture. This farm is on a dead end 
lane and offers great hunting. There 
is an old farm house and 3 barns 
on this property. A great retreat and 
hunting tract for 

CDP171 - CUMBERLAND 
VALLEY DRIVE

CDP155 - CARL 
DIXON LANE

CDP164 - HERMAN 
SMITH LANE

CD967 - HIGHWAY 56

In a great location, we have 

1.16 acres improved with a 

large concrete slab and a 

paved driveway and parking 

area. This property was used 

as a market and garage in the 

past. There is a small por-

table bank building on site, 

along with a septic system 

and water tap. Natural gas 

is available. This would be 

a great place for a business. 

Priced at only $50,000.00. 

MLS # 1817603

Offering a nice lake view, 

we have a .74 acre sloping 

lot. This lot has light restric-

tions and would be great for 

your full-time home or get-

away cabin. The lot is septic 

approved for two bedroom 

system, and has city water 

available. Priced to sell at 

$39,900.00. Owner terms 

available.

Offering a seasonal lake view 

and the lake just across the 

road we have this nice three 

bedroom, two bath brick 

home with a new metal roof 

and really nice kitchen with 

granite counter tops and 

stainless steel appliances. 

Other amenities are a two-

car garage, 28x48 barn, and 

a large front deck overlook-

ing the Corp property that 

you can sit and watch the 

various wildlife. This home is 

priced at $274,900.00. 

Overlooking the city of 

Gainesboro, we have 3.2 

acres on both sides of the 

street. This property is in 

the city limits and city wa-

ter and sewer available. This 

property is a great buy at 

$18,900.00.

505 North Main St. • Carthage, TN

Just a few hun
dred feet to Cordell Hull Lake. We 
have 2.64 acres being mostly open 
and offering a great lake view. This 
property is septic approved and 
has city water available. Selling for 

 With a beautiful 
lake view we are offering this large 
brick split level home. This home of
fers an eat-in kitchen, living room, 
dining room, basement, den, ga
rage, paved and gravel drives. This 
home has 3 full baths and has been 
used for 4 bedrooms. You can walk 
across the road to the lake to fish. 
This home is priced at only 
$1,000 selling agent bonus with full 
price offer. 

 Unobstructed year 
round view of Cordell Hull Lake is 
just what this cute three bedroom, 
two bath vinyl sided home has to of
fer.  This home is ideal for a starter 
home or a lake house to get away 
to. Priced to sell at 

Offering a nice view 
of adjoining countryside we are of
fering 1.92 acres of pasture.  This 
tract is septic approved and has 
city water available. This nice tract 
is priced at only 
great possibilities.

Lakeview doesn’t describe the 
great view of the Cordell Hull Lake 
just across the road from this 2.68 
acres of level to gently sloping pas
ture land. This property is septic 
approved and has city water avail
able. This view can be yours for 

 REDUCED! Joining 
the Camp Discovery we have this 
28.12 acres with long road and 
Corps of Engineers frontage. This 
open and wooded acres offers five 
home sites septic approved and has 
beautiful views of Cordell Hull Lake. 

Overlooking Cordell Hull Lake we 
have this large corner lot being 
mostly wooded and slightly sloping 
to level. Public water and electric 
is available. This property is within 
walking distance of Salt Lick Camp
ground. Priced to sell at 

Within walking distance of Cordell 
Hull Lake we have this beautiful 126 
acres of mostly wooded land with 
marketable timber & the balance in 
pasture. This farm is on a dead end 
lane and offers great hunting. There 
is an old farm house and 3 barns 
on this property. A great retreat and 
hunting tract for 

Overlooking Cordell Hull, we 

have 4.89 ac. +/- being most-

ly wooded. This property is 

septic approved and has city 

water and electric available. 

This property has long road 

frontage and lots of wildlife. 

Price is $16,000.00. MLS # 

1813155

CD926 - CAMP 
DISCOVERY

LANE

CDP152 - WEBSTER 
ROAD

Convenient to Cordell Hull 

Lake and Indian Creek Camp-

ground, we have approx. 84 

acres +/- with long road front-

age. This property is mostly 

wooded and offers bench and 

ridge fields that are grown up 
currently but can be cleared 

back out. City water and 

electric is available and wild-

life is plentiful. Priced to sell 

at $141,000.00.

615-735-2244

PUBLIC NOTICE
NOTICE OF PUBLIC MEETING

DALE HOLLOW RPO

Pursuant to Chapter 442, Tennessee Public Act of 

1974, “The Sunshine Law” the Dale Hollow Rural Planning 

Organization will hold a meeting on Thursday, December 
17th, 2020. The meeting will be held virtually at 10:00 AM 
(CST). Anyone who is interested in attending will need to 

contact Mark Dudney at (931) 476-4152 or mdudney@

ucdd.org for more details. 

The Dale Hollow RPO is responsible for comprehensive 

transportation planning for Clay, Fentress, Jackson, Macon, 

Overton, Pickett, Smith, and Trousdale counties.

This is an open public meeting. To request an 

agenda, please call Dale Hollow RPO Coordinator Mark 
Dudney at (931) 476-4152. If you need assistance or 
accommodations due to disability, please contact Mark 
by Tuesday, December 15th, 2020. 
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LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL LEGAL

HELP WANTED

REWARD FOR LOST CAT

Vincent, a cream colored, blue-eyed, 

neutered cat with a black-ringed tail. 

Missing since 11-20-20 from home at 

1105 Dry Fork Martin Creek Rd. Liberty 

Community. 

Vincent is shy with strangers, but might 

respond to food. Call Bobby or Suzanne 

Stafford at 931-653-4422.

Serving all your real estate needs

Clint Conner

Broker/Auctioneer

Samantha Conner

Realtor®

208 S. Jefferson Avenue Cookeville, TN 38501

(931) 644-7149
connerproperty@gmail.com

(931) 510-0746
connerexitrealty@gmail.com

Now Applications

FOX RIDGE
NOW ACCEPTING 

APPLICATIONS

DEER RUN I
APARTMENTS

100 Deer Run Lane

Gainesboro, TN 38562

931-268-1426
TDD 771

(931) 268-9857
“This institute is an equal opportunity provider and employer.”

Now Applications

FOX RIDGE
NOW ACCEPTING 

APPLICATIONS

DEER RUN II
APARTMENTS

100 Deer Run Lane

Gainesboro, TN 38562

931-268-1426
TDD 771

(931) 268-9857
“This institute is an equal opportunity provider and employer.”

Applications

FOX RIDGE
Now Accepting Applications

Elderly Disabled Community

FOX RIDGE 
APARTMENTS

100 Fox Ridge Lane
Gainesboro, TN 38562

(931) 268-9857
TDD 771

(931) 268-9857
“This institute is an equal opportunity provider and employer.”

Now 
“School News Hotline”

For up to date

information about

Jackson County 

Schools, call

268-4050
931.445.5554 call or text

BASIC 
DEER
PROCESSING

$80 3255 Jennings Creek Hwy.

Whitleyville, TN 38588

Now Open in 

Jackson County

Kyle Peterson, owner

401 N. Spring St., Livingston • Of�ice: 931.823.3340 • Cell: 931.445.5305

We Service All Brands 
FREE Estimates

24 Hour Service 

Electric & Plumbing Available

Used 

Appliances 

with a 30-day 

Warranty. 

Call for details.

TN CMC Licensed 

Contractor & 

Insured

Contractors 

License

931.265.3575
Septic Tanks • Field Line

Septic Pumping 
Excavating •Skid Steer Work

 Tyler Smith     Monroe, TN

Smith’s Septics
WARDEN’S BACKHOE & LOADER SERVICE

127 Big Branch Rd. • Granville, TN 38564

Ted Warden, Owner Phone: (931) 268-0075

 Cell: (931) 267-9763

WARDEN’S BACKHOE & LOADER SERVICE

127 Big Branch Rd. • Granville, TN 38564
Water Lines Septic Tanks Field Lines

Dirt Hauling (Field Dirt & Top Soil) Basements Bush Hog & Spraying

Pond Cleaning & Digging Free Estimates Land Clearing

38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 20th day of 
November 2020.

Zachary R. Skipper
Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 

Clerk and Master
Kayla Collin-Cant-

rell, Attorney for Estate                                                                                                                              
11-24, 

12-1 2TP

STATE OF 
TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 
JACKSON COUNTY 
AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Juanita 
Brown

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 20th day 
of November 2020, Let-
ter of Testamentary, in 
respect to the estate of 
Juanita Brown, deceased, 
who died September 14, 
2020 were issued to the 
undersigned by the Pro-
bate Court of Jackson 
County, Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-

lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 20th day of 
November 2020.

Malinda Brown, 
Personal Representative

Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 
Clerk and Master
R. Luke Chaffin, 

Attorney for Estate                                                                                                                           
11-24, 

12-1 2TP

STATE OF 
TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 
JACKSON COUNTY 
AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Harold 
D. Lynn

Notice is hereby 
given that on the 23rd 
day of November, 2020, 
Letter of Testamentary, 
in respect to the estate 
of Harold D. Lynn, de-
ceased, who died Octo-
ber 27, 2020 were issued 
to the undersigned by the 
Probate Court of Jackson 
County, Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 23rd day of 
November, 2020.

Patty Scott, Executrix
Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 

Clerk and Master
John D. Langford, 

Attorney for Estate                                           
  12-1, 

12-8 2TP

STATE OF 
TENNESSEE

PROBATE COURT OF 
JACKSON COUNTY 
AT GAINESBORO

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

ESTATE OF: Robert 
K. Masters

Notice is hereby giv-
en that on the 23rd day of 
November, 2020, Letter 
of Testamentary, in re-
spect to the estate of Rob-
ert K. Masters, deceased, 
who died September 5, 
2020 were issued to the 
undersigned by the Pro-
bate Court of Jackson 
County, Tennessee.

All persons, resident 
and non-resident, hav-
ing claims, matured or 
unmatured, against the 
estate are required to file 
same with the Clerk of 
the above named Court 
at the Jackson County 
Court House, P.O. Box 
342, Gainesboro, TN 
38562 within the earlier 
of four (4) months from 
the date of the first pub-
lication of this notice, 
or twelve (12) months 
from the decedent’s date 
of death, otherwise their 
claims will be forever 
barred. 

This the 23rd day of 
November, 2020.

Terry G. Masters, 
Personal Representative

Sherrie Pippin-Loftis, 
Clerk and Master

Julie E. Officer, 
Attorney for Estate

12-1, 
12-8 2TP

 

 HELP WANTED: An-
sei America is accept-
ing applications for the 
following position: 1st 
shift Assembly position, 
starting $9.50 an hour, 
2nd shift Assembly po-
sition, starting $9.65 an 
hour. Hourly pay rate 
will increase after 90 day 
probation. Health Insur-
ance, paid holiday’s, 
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HELP WANTED

STATEWIDE

STATEWIDE STATEWIDE STATEWIDE STATEWIDE STATEWIDE

sick, vacation after a 90 
day probation. All ap-
plicants must provide a 
High School Diploma 
or GED upon submitting 
your application. Please 
submit applications 
Monday thru Friday 8 
a.m. – 2 p.m. at 1659 
North Grundy Quarles 
Hwy, Gainesboro, TN 
8-13, TFC

GET THE WORD OUT 
about your next auction! 
Save Time & $$$. One 
Call For All. Your ad can 
appear in this newspaper 
+ 101 other TN news-
papers. For more info, 
contact this newspaper’s 
classified dept. or call 
931-624-8916. (TnScan)

AT&T TV - The Best 
of Live & On-Demand 
On All Your Favorite 
Screens. CHOICE Pack-
age, $64.99/mo plus taxes 
for 12months. Premium 
Channels at No Charge 
for One Year! Anytime, 
anywhere. Some restric-
tions apply. W/ 24-mo. 
agmt TV price higher 
in 2nd year. Regional 
Sports Fee up to $8.49/
mo. is extra & applies. 
Call IVS 1-844-794-0819 
(TnScan)

DISH NETWORK. 
$59.99 for 190 Chan-
nels! Blazing Fast Inter-
net, $19.99/mo. (where 
available.) Switch & Get 
a FREE $100 Visa Gift 
Card. FREE Voice Re-
mote. FREE HD DVR. 
FREE Streaming on 
ALL Devices. Call to-
day! 1-844-274-6074 
(TnScan)

DIRECTV - Every live 
football game, every 
Sunday - anywhere - on 
your favorite device. 
Restrictions apply. Call 
IVS - 1-844-230-4803 
(TnScan)

THE COVID CRISIS 
has cost us all something. 
Many have lost jobs and 
financial security. Have 
$10K In Debt? Credit 
Cards. Medical Bills. Car 
Loans. Call NATIONAL 
DEBT RELIEF! We can 
help! Get a FREE debt 
relief quote: Call 1-855-
717-6490 (TnScan)

DENTAL INSURANCE 
from Physicians Mu-
tual Insurance Company. 
Coverage for 350 plus 
procedures. Real den-
tal insurance - NOT just 
a discount plan. Do not 
wait! Call now! Get your 
FREE Dental Information 
Kit with all the details! 
1-844-278-8285 www.
dental50plus.com/tnpress 
(TnScan)

HEARING AIDS!! 
Buy one/get one FREE! 
High-quality recharge-
able Nano hearing aids 
priced 90% less than 
competitors. Nearly in-
visible! 45-day money 
back guarantee! 888-621-
5719 (TnScan)

ATTENTION VIA-

GRA USERS: Generic 
100 mg blue pills or Ge-
neric 20 mg yellow pills. 
Get 45 plus 5 free $99 + 
S/H. Guaranteed, no pre-
scription necessary. Call 
Today 1-844-677-8780 
(TnScan)

RECRUITING HEAD-

ACHES? WE CAN 
Help! Advertise your job 
opening in this newspa-
per + 101 newspapers 
across the state - One 
Call/Email for All! Con-
tact our classified dept.
or email bmoats@tnpress.

com (TnScan)

NEW STARTING 

BASE PAY - .50 cpm w/ 
option to make .60 cpm 
for Class A CDL Flatbed 
Drivers, Excellent Ben-
efits, Home Weekends, 
Call 800-648-9915 or 
www.boydandsons.com 
(TnScan)

ELIMINATE GUTTER 

CLEANING FOREV-

ER! LeafFilter, the most 
advanced debris-blocking 
gutter protection. Sched-
ule a FREE LeafFilter 
estimate today. 15% off 
Entire Purchase. 10% 
Senior & Military Dis-
counts. Call 1-855-389-
3904 (TnScan)

THE GENERAC PWR-

CELL, a solar plus bat-
tery storage system. 
SAVE money, reduce 
your reliance on the grid, 
prepare for power outag-
es and power your home. 
Full installation services 
available. $0 Down Fi-
nancing Option. Request 
a FREE, no obligation, 
quote today. Call 1-877-
337-1340 (TnScan)

GENERAC STANDBY 

GENERATORS. The 
weather is increasingly 
unpredictable. Be pre-
pared for power outages. 
FREE 7-year extended 
warranty ($695 value!) 
Schedule your FREE 
in-home assessment to-
day. Call 1-888-869-
5542 Special financing 
for qualified customers. 
(TnScan)

AT&T INTERNET. 
Starting at $40/month 
w/12-mo agmt. Includes 
1 TB of data per month. 
Get More For Your High-
Speed Internet Thing. 
Ask us how to bundle 
and SAVE! Geo & svc 
restrictions apply. Call us 
today 1-866-420-5593. 
(TnScan)

HUGHESNET SATEL-

LITE INTERNET - 25 
mbps starting at $49.99/
mo! Get More Data   

FREE Off-Peak Data. 
FAST download speeds. 
WiFi built in!  FREE 
Standard Installation for 
lease customers! Limited 
Time, Call 1-844-233-
4950 (TnScan)

EARTHLINK HIGH 

SPEED INTERNET. As 
Low As $14.95/month 
(for the first 3 months.) 
Reliable High Speed Fi-
ber Optic Technology. 
Stream Videos, Music 
and More! Call Earthlink 
Today 1-888-337-9611 
(TnScan)

AMAZING ORANGE 

GIFT for the Holidays. 
Delicious oranges fresh 
from the grove! Four fa-
vorite varieties. High in 
Vitamin C. December 
holiday delivery. SAVE 
43%! Just $19.99 (plus 
s/h.) Call 1-855-899-8849 
to order item 496X and 
mention code HNVH-
E152 for savings or visit 
halegroves.com/ME152 
(TnScan)

PITTMAN & DAVIS 
Mixed-fruit medley for 
the Holidays! Give the 
gift of Winter Sunshine! 
6 Rio Ruby Red Gems. 4 
Tiny Tim Navels. 6 Mini 
Fuji Apples. Call NOW 
and SAVE 33% OFF. Pay 
just $19.99. FREE Ship-
ping! Call 1-844-620-
1606 to order item MXSP 
and mention code PN-
VH-E136 for savings or 
visit pittmandavis.com/
ME136 (TnScan)

ENJOY 100% guaran-
teed, deliveredâ€“to-
the-door Omaha Steaks! 
Get 4 FREE Pork Chops 
and 4 FREE CHICK-
EN BREAST Order the 
Omaha Steaks Classic 
- ONLY $129.99. Call 
1-833-939-0275 and use 
code 66762MYH or visit 
www.omahasteaks.com/
dinner398
 (TnScan)

YOUR LOW COST 

ADVERTISING SO-

LUTION! One call & 
your 25 word ad will ap-
pear in 102 Tennessee 
newspapers for $275/wk 
or 47 Middle TN news-
papers for $120/wk. Call 
this newspaper’s classi-
fied advertising dept. or 
go to www.tnadvertising.

biz. (TnScan)

GET THE WORD OUT 
about your next auction! 
Save Time & $$$. One 
Call For All. Your ad can 
appear in this newspaper 
+ 101 other TN news-
papers. For more info, 
contact this newspaper’s 
classified dept. or call 
931-624-8916. 
(TnScan)

AT&T TV - The Best 
of Live & On-Demand 
On All Your Favorite 
Screens. CHOICE Pack-
age, $64.99/mo plus taxes 
for 12months. Premium 
Channels at No Charge 
for One Year! Anytime, 
anywhere. Some restric-
tions apply. W/ 24-mo. 
agmt TV price higher 
in 2nd year. Regional 
Sports Fee up to $8.49/

mo. is extra & applies. 
Call IVS 1-844-794-0819 
(TnScan)

DISH NETWORK. 
$59.99 for 190 Chan-
nels! Blazing Fast Inter-
net, $19.99/mo. (where 

available.) Switch & Get 
a FREE $100 Visa Gift 
Card. FREE Voice Re-
mote. FREE HD DVR. 
FREE Streaming on 
ALL Devices. Call to-
day! 1-844-274-6074 
(TnScan)

PUBLIC NOTICE
NOTICE OF MEETING OF

THE LEGISLATIVE BODY 

OF JACKSON COUNTY, TENNESSEE

Notice is hereby given that the Legislative Body of 

Jackson County, Tennessee, will meet in regular public 

session Monday, December 14th, 2020 at 7:00 p.m. for 

the purpose of considering and transacting all business 

which may come before such body. 

 Additional information concerning the above may be 

obtained from the County Mayor’s Office (931) 268-

9888.

Agricultural Land for Lease,
Cordell Hull Wildlife

Management Area

The Tennessee Wildlife Resource 

Agency announces the intention to award 

Revenue leases on agricultural parcels in 

Cordell Hull WMA and Refuge in Jackson 

and Smith Counties for the term of 5 

years. The agricultural areas to be lease 

consist of approximately 1,000 acres over 

10 separate contracts. 

Bids will be accepted from December 

15, 2020 to January 12, 2021. Submitted 

bids will be opened at 10 a.m. on January 

13, 2021 at the TWRA Regional Office, 
464 Industrial Blvd., Crossville, TN 

38555. 

To receive an invitation to bid or for 

more information on this leasing program, 

call Johnny Poston at (615)342-9307 or 

email at johnny.poston@tn.gov.

INSIDE SALE
Above Anderson and Haile Drug Store

Thursday, Dec. 3 and Friday, Dec. 4  7:30- ?
Saturday, Dec. 5 7:30 - 12 noon

Lots of good used and new stuff. 
Clothes all sizes. Christmas decor. 

For your safety and ours masks are required.
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