
Hood County News

A SPECIAL ADVERTISING SECTION

SATURDAY, Jan. 29, 2022

inside HEALTH — EXPERTS SAY TO BROADEN OUR DEFINITIONS  |  COVID-19 — BUSTING 

VACCINE MYTHS  |   ASTHMA — HOW TO LIVE A NORMAL LIFE WITH THE AFFLICTION  |  TUNA 

TRUTHS — WHAT CONSUMERS NEED TO KNOW ABOUT THEIR FAVORITE CANNED FOOD  |  

HEALTHY SOUPS — SAVORY SOUPS THAT WILL MAKE YOU FEEL BETTER  |  SPA DAY — DR. 

CARRIE MORRIS OFFERS COSMETIC AND RECONSTRUCTIVE SURGERY  |  MEDICINE SAFETY — 

HOW TO KEEP PRESCRIPTION MEDICATIONS OUT OF YOUR CHILDREN’S EXPLORING HANDS  | RX 

RESOLUTIONS — TURN 2022 INTO YOUR HEALTHIEST YEAR  | PREGNANCY —  WHAT ARE THE 

RISKS IN AMERICA?  |  MENOPAUSE — SKIN CARE FOR WOMEN IS JUST AS IMPORTANT



COURTESY PHOTO

C2    Hood County News SATURDAY, Jan. 29, 2022

www.hcnews.com

(StatePoint)

M
any Americans 
view health as a 
product of the 
medical care they 

receive. However, public 
health experts say that’s just 
one piece of the puzzle.

“In reality, our health is 
shaped more by the zip code 
we live in than the doctor we 
see. In fact, where we live, our 
financial circumstances, our 
access to affordable, nutri-
tious foods, and other non-
medical factors overwhelm-
ingly influence our physical 
and mental health,” said 
Dr. Shantanu Agrawal, chief 
health officer at Anthem, Inc.

These factors that Agrawal 

refers to are known as “social 
drivers of health” (SDoH), and 
they determine up to 80% of 
our health outcomes, accord-
ing to Robert Wood Johnson 
Foundation research.

As part of “What’s Driv-
ing Our Health,” Anthem’s 
campaign to start a national 
conversation around whole 
health, the healthcare com-
pany recently conducted a 
study to learn more about 
Americans’ perceptions of 
what health really means. 
Here are some of the study’s 
top findings:
n While 46% of Americans 

are unaware of the concept 
of social drivers of health, 
once given the definition, 60% 
agree that their local com-

munity is facing at least some 
health issues related to them.
n Americans of color are 

disproportionately affect-
ed by the consequences of 
SDoH. While 58% of white 
respondents report that their 
local community is facing 
at least some health issues 
related to SDoH, 69% of His-
panic and Latino respondents 
report the same, as do 68% of 
Asian respondents and 68% 
of Black/African American 
respondents.
n Poor nutrition can con-

tribute to a range of chronic 
health conditions, and 50% of 
those surveyed say it is hard 
to find affordable, healthy 
food in their local commu-
nity.

n Though 70% of Ameri-
cans live near at least one 
hospital or medical center, 
one in five say that lack of 
transportation has kept them 
from medical appointments. 
What’s more, nearly one-third 
struggle with access to health 
services and care.
n Internet access not only 

determines whether one is 
able to use important health 
services such as telemedi-
cine, it deeply impacts educa-
tional outcomes and access 
to economic opportunities, 
including employment. Yet 
only 39% of Americans be-
lieve it significantly impacts 
their health.
n Some additional factors 

that can drive health out-

comes in the short and long 
term include access to green 
spaces, educational opportu-
nities, economic stability and 
living in a safe community.

WHERE TO START
More than 80% of those sur-

veyed believe that healthcare 
entities, local government, 
private citizens and employ-
ers share responsibility to ad-
dress the many social drivers 
of health. While these issues 
are complex and no one en-
tity can fully address all the 
social drivers alone, here is 
what you can do today:

1. Connect the dots. Visit 
WhatsDrivingOurHealth.
com to read the full report 
and learn more about whole 

health and its drivers.
2. Spread the word. Share 

what you’ve learned about 
the ways social drivers affect 
you and your community and 
follow the conversation on 
social media using #Drivin-
gOurHealth.

3. Join the conversation. 
Understanding is the first 
step in making positive 
change. Engage with friends, 
family, and community mem-
bers about the many ways to 
address health-related social 
needs in your community.

“The sooner we broaden 
our definition of health, the 
sooner we can address the 
many factors that affect 
people’s ability to thrive,” 
Agrawal said.

HEALTH 
WHY EXPERTS SAY WE MUST 

BROADEN OUR DEFINITION
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C
OVID-19 vaccines 
are overwhelmingly 
safe and highly ef-
fective at reducing 

the risk of severe disease, 
hospitalizations and death. 
Unfortunately, misinforma-
tion and pervasive myths 
continue to sow doubt, leav-
ing many unprotected.

Roughly 99% of deaths 
linked to COVID-19 in the 
latest wave — and the vast 
majority of cases involving 
severe symptoms that re-
quire hospitalization — were 
among the unvaccinated, 
according to the Centers for 
Disease Control and Preven-
tion.

“With high levels of com-
munity spread of COVID-19, 
we’re once again fighting a 
two-front war: against the vi-
rus and against rampant mis-
information,” said American 

Medical Association presi-
dent Gerald E. Harmon, M.D.

Here are some of the top 
myths that physicians are 
hearing and what you need 
to know:

Q: Can COVID-19 vaccines 
impact fertility? 

A: Risks to fertility or the 
ability to become pregnant 
after receiving a COVID-19 
vaccine were disproven 
through clinical trials and 
real-world data points. While 
pregnant women weren’t spe-
cifically targeted for vaccine 
trials, several participants 
became pregnant without is-
sue during the trial duration, 
and there’s been no demon-
strated real-world impact on 
fertility. 

Moreover, COVID-19 itself 
carries significant risks for 
pregnant women, includ-
ing higher risks of preterm 
labor and stillbirth, and 

higher risks of hypertension 
and pneumonia for preg-
nant women. There’s also no 
evidence showing that CO-
VID-19 vaccines affect male 
fertility.

Q: Can vaccinated people 
“shed” spike proteins, affect-
ing those close to them? 

A: Vaccine shedding can 
only occur when a vaccine 
contains a weakened version 
of the virus. None of the COV-
ID-19 vaccines authorized for 
use in the U.S. contain a live 
virus, so it’s not biologically 
possible for a vaccinated per-
son to affect an unvaccinated 
person by proxy or by “shed-
ding” spike proteins.

Q: I’ve already had COV-
ID-19. Do I need the vaccine? 

A: Yes, the data shows that 
unvaccinated individuals are 
more than twice as likely to 
be reinfected with COVID-19 

than those who were fully 
vaccinated after initially con-
tracting the virus. Getting 
the vaccine is the best way to 
protect yourself and those 
around you.

Q: Why do I need the vac-
cine if breakthrough infec-
tions are possible? 

A: Some fully vaccinated 
people will still get sick be-
cause no vaccine is 100% ef-
fective. However, data show 
that vaccination may make 
COVID-19 symptoms less se-
vere. The vaccines have also 
been shown to provide sub-
stantial protection against 
death and hospitalization in 
cases of breakthrough infec-
tion.

Q: I’m young and healthy. 
Do I really need the vaccine? 

A: Many young, previously 
healthy people have got-
ten seriously ill or died from 

COVID-19, and those num-
bers are increasing with new, 
more transmissible variants. 
There’s no way to predict 
how you’ll respond to infec-
tion. 

Additionally, vaccines help 
prevent you from carrying 
the virus and transmitting it 
to others. Reducing the num-
ber of unvaccinated people 
will mitigate transmission of 
the virus.

Q: I have allergies. Should 
I be worried about a reaction 
to the vaccine? 

A: There have been very 
rare (2.5 to 5 people per mil-
lion) reports of severe (ana-
phylactic) allergic reactions 
to COVID-19 vaccines. Hav-
ing severe allergic reactions 
to certain foods, bee stings 
or oral medications doesn’t 
mean you will have an allergic 
reaction to a COVID-19 vac-
cine. The vaccination sites 

are prepared to evaluate and 
handle these situations on in-
dividual basis.

“The evidence around vac-
cinations is abundantly clear; 
they’re safe, effective and will 
help protect you and your 
loved ones from severe CO-
VID and death,” Harmon said. 
“If you have questions about 
the vaccine, its safety, or ef-
fectiveness, please speak to 
your physician. We are here 
for you, eager to answer your 
questions, and get you pro-
tected from this virus.”

More fact-based vaccine 
information can be found 
by visiting cdc.gov or 
getvaccineanswers.org 
online.

COVID-19 
VACCINE MYTHS BUSTED
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A
sthma is a lung 
disease that makes 
breathing difficult 
for more than 24 

million Americans. 
While there’s no cure, there 

are steps you can take to help 
control it so you can lead a 
normal, healthy life. 

The Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention’s 
(CDC) National Asthma Con-
trol Program developed the 
“six EXHALE strategies” that 
help contribute to better 
asthma control.

By putting all six activi-
ties into place, you and your 
loved ones can feel better, 
avoid the hospital or emer-
gency room, and avoid miss-
ing school or work. 

According to the Ameri-
can Lung Association, here’s 
everything you need to know 

about the six EXHALE strate-
gies:

WHAT IS IT?
What are the EXHALE strat-

egies? The EXHALE strate-
gies are for both children and 
adults and can be used one 
at a time or in combination 
with one another to help you 
gain better control of asthma. 
They are:
n Education on asthma 

self-management
n Extinguishing smoking 

and secondhand smoke
n Home visits by asthma 

experts who can teach you 
asthma control skills as well 
as help you eliminate asthma 
triggers in your house
n Achievement of guide-

lines-based medical manage-
ment. This means following 
your doctor’s advice.
n Linkages and coordina-

tion of care across settings. 

Be sure all your healthcare 
providers are on the same 
page regarding your care.
n Environmental policies 

or best practices to reduce 
asthma triggers from indoor, 
outdoor and occupational 
sources. Are your home and 
workplace free of asthma 
triggers like smoke and pol-
lutants?

IMPLEMENTING STRATEGY
How can I use the EXHALE 

strategies on a daily basis? 
Check out the CDC’s guide 
for people living with asthma 
on how to use the EXHALE 
strategies at www.cdc.gov:
n Keep your asthma under 

control by learning the seven 
asthma self-management 
skills. Work with your health-
care provider to develop and 
maintain an asthma action 
plan that will remind you 
what to do when asthma 

symptoms get worse and how 
to properly use your medi-
cine.
n Tobacco smoke can trig-

ger asthma symptoms for 
many. Limit your exposure 
to secondhand smoke and 
support smoke-free policies 
in your community that help 
people quit smoking.
n Work with a nurse or 

community health worker to 
help reduce or remove trig-
gers in your home.
n Take your asthma medi-

cines exactly as prescribed 
and check with your health-
care provider to make sure 
you’re using the inhaler(s) 
correctly.
n Involve all of your health-

care providers in your asth-
ma care or your child’s care 
so everyone is on the same 
page. Bring a copy of your or 
your child’s asthma action 
plan to each doctor. Also, 

make sure other caregivers, 
your child’s school or your 
workplace has a copy too, so 
they can help in an emer-
gency.
n Make a few home up-

dates to reduce asthma 
triggers. Remove mold and 
pests, make your home and 
vehicles smoke-free and talk 
with leaders in your commu-
nity about putting policies in 
place that help people living 
with asthma.

HELP FROM LUNG 
ASSOCIATION

How can the American 
Lung Association help me? 
The Lung Association is 
implementing the EXHALE 
strategies in its Promoting 
Asthma Friendly Environ-
ments through Partnerships 
and Collaborations project. 
You can learn more about 
their work and programs by 

visiting www.lung.org/AFE.
Children and adults living 

with asthma can also par-
ticipate in one of the Lung 
Association’s asthma self-
management programs, such 
as Open Airways for Schools, 
Kickin’ Asthma or Breathe 
Well, Live Well.

Additionally, the Lung As-
sociation has many programs 
and initiatives to help people 
follow the above tips.

Finally, you can get help 
quitting smoking or helping 
someone quit using Lung As-
sociation resources, such as 
Freedom From Smoking, Not 
on Tobacco (N-O-T) and the 
Lung HelpLine. Learn more 
about creating an asthma-
friendly home by visiting 
www.lung.org online.

ASTHMA 
LIVE A NORMAL, HEALTHY LIFE

OUR VISION FOR OUR 

HOME IS TO PROVIDE 

A SAFE, LOVING 

ENVIRONMENT FOR 

THOSE WE CHERISH

NOW ADMITTING RESIDENTS!

• ALL PRIVATE ROOMS WITH 3/4 BATHROOMS

• 24 HOUR CAREGIVER ASSISTANCE

• DIETICIAN APPROVED MEALS

• ACTIVITIES PROGRAM

• HOUSEKEEPING AND LAUNDRY PROVIDED

• REGISTERED NURSE ON STAFF

• DIRECT TV SERVICE

• PRIVATE PAY

• COVID-19 SAFETY PLAN IN PLACE

Assisted Living and Memory Care Home
1900 Acton Hwy, Granbury, TX 76049

CALL JUHREE AT 817-886-4109 OR 817-602-9798

Move฀in Special
Be one of the first five residents to move into our home, 

and get $1,000 off the admission fee and your loved one’s 
3rd month of care for FREE

With almost 33 years of expe-

rience and over 200 locations, 

BeeHive Homes is a leader in 

the assisted living and memory 

care services. BeeHive Homes 

is a senior living home in a 

residential setting. Uniquely 

designed, our senior living 

services offer residents more 

access to personal care. By 

keeping our homes smaller 

with professional, skilled care-

givers, our residents can have 

their needs addressed person-

ally. We truly believe that in 

order to provide the very best 

care for our residents, we must 

get to know them well and 

discover what their individual 

needs are–and that’s exactly 

what we do!

Comprehensive Diagnostic Hearing Evaluations 
Tinnitus Treatment 

Hearing Loss Rehabilitation 
 Dementia Risk/Cognitive Function

Hearing Clarity 
Hearing Aid Technology 
 Repairs & Maintenance 

Cochlear Implant Mapping  Hearing Protection Devices 
Audiology for Children & Newborns

Dr. Terri Jo Edwards

Granbury, TX, Hearing Center
4425 E. Hwy 377, Ste. 106

(817) 854-8068
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An active lifestyle is a

healthy lifestyle!
We'll take care of
you so you can do
more of the things
you love.

Independent Living

Assisted Living

Memory Care

Call today for
more information!

817-243-9735

Full Service Orthopedic 
Rehabilitation Specialists

Medically Supervised 
Gym/Fitness Center

5310 Acton Highway, Suite 106  |  Granbury, Texas 76049  |  www.FreedomPhysicalTherapy.com

817-326-1375
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W
hen sweater 
weather arrives, 
there’s nothing 
quite as comfort-

ing as a pot of something sa-
vory and delicious simmer-
ing on the stove.

As you turn to hearty 
soups this winter, having the 
right seasonal staples means 
you’ll be well on your way to 
having piping hot meals on 
the table, quickly and hassle-
free.

Keep your pantry and 
fridge stocked with essential 
ingredients like onions, car-
rots and celery, along with 
a collection of earthy, zesty 
spices and versatile, all-pur-
pose seasonings. You’ll also 
need a rich and all-natural 
stock handy, such as Kitchen 
Basics Unsalted Chicken 
Stock. Simmered all day with 
chicken, vegetables and Mc-

Cormick herbs and spices, 
this deeply flavored stock 
can bring a burst of savory 
warmth to countless dishes. 
It’s low in sodium so it’s a 
good-for-you start to many 
delicious meals beyond 
soup, like rice, sauces, and 
more.

To help you embrace the 
colder weather, try a recipe 
for a hearty classic loaded 
with tender veggies, chick-
en, egg noodles and robust 
flavor that puts this stock — 
aka “liquid gold” — front and 
center. Yep, you guessed it, 
Savory Homemade Chicken 
Noodle Soup. Nostalgic and 
nourishing, all you need is 
10 minutes of prep time and 
20 minutes cooking on your 
stovetop.

(StatePoint)

D
o you always look 
for the “dolphin-
safe” and “sustain-
ably caught” labels 

on your tuna? If so, you’re 
probably already thinking 
about how your meals impact 
marine life and the environ-
ment. 

A new report shows that 
protecting human rights 
within the tuna industry is 
not only just as important as 
sustainability, but that the 

two issues are actually inter-
related.

According to Greenpeace 
USA’s latest report, “The High 
Cost of Cheap Tuna: U.S. Su-
permarkets, Sustainability 
and Human Rights at Sea,” 
American demand for tuna 
has risen steadily while fish 
stocks have declined due to 
overfishing and ocean warm-
ing driven by climate change. 
As commercial fishing es-
calates to meet demand, so 
have reports of forced labor 
and human rights violations 

aboard fishing vessels. The 
report highlights how loop-
holes in human rights poli-
cies governing U.S. retailers’ 
supply chains have left many 
migrant fishers vulnerable to 
such exploitative labor prac-
tices as forced labor, debt 
bondage and physical abuse.

Advocates say that al-
though major U.S. retailers 
don’t directly employ fishers, 
these companies can help put 
an end to this cycle by buying 
tuna only from ethical suppli-
ers. Unfortunately, all 16 of 

the retailer chains surveyed 
in the Greenpeace report re-
ceived failing scores. The re-
port, which for the first time 
assesses the human rights 
policies applied to retailers’ 
tuna supply chains, found 
that many companies have 
ignored this issue or have 
opted for only surface-level 
changes that have not deliv-
ered meaningful impacts.

Despite these results, there 
is some good news.

“The seafood industry has 
come under more scrutiny as 

consumers better understand 
the links between environ-
mental damage and human 
rights abuses,” said John Ho-
cevar, oceans campaign direc-
tor, Greenpeace USA. “Con-
sumers are demanding that 
their retailers act sustainably 
and ethically. The report of-
fers some encouragement 
that we are progressing in the 
right direction. However, it is 
clear that a large amount of 
work lies ahead to get these 
corporations to make the 
changes necessary to ensure 

they are protecting human 
lives and the environment.”

To read the entire report 
and view the ranking, visit: 
http://www.greenpeace.org/
usa/tuna-scorecard.

“Retailers and the consum-
ers they serve can become 
voices for change,” says Ho-
cevar. “We urge retailers to 
take ownership of human 
rights and sustainability is-
sues at the same time, and 
we encourage consumers to 
demand that they do.”

SAVORY HOMEMADE 
CHICKEN NOODLE SOUP 

Ingredients:
n 2 tablespoons vegetable 

oil
n 1 cup chopped yellow 

onion
n 1 cup chopped carrots
n 1 cup chopped celery
n 2 tablespoons McCor-

mick Garlic, Herb and Black 
Pepper and Sea Salt All Pur-
pose Seasoning
n 1/2 teaspoon McCormick 

Ground Turmeric
n 1 pound boneless skin-

less chicken breast
n 2 cartons (32 ounces 

each) Kitchen Basics Unsalted 
Chicken Stock
n 2 cups uncooked medi-

um egg noodles
n 1/2 cup frozen peas

Instructions:
1. Heat oil in large sauce-

pan on medium heat until 

shimmering. Add onion, car-
rots and celery; cook and stir 
3 minutes or until softened. 
Stir in seasoning and tur-
meric; cook 30 seconds until 
fragrant. Add chicken and 
stock. Bring to boil. Reduce 
heat; simmer, covered, 15 to 
20 minutes until chicken is 
cooked through and tender.

2. Transfer chicken to me-
dium bowl; shred using two 
forks. Set aside. Stir noodles 
into broth; cook 6 minutes or 
until tender. Return shredded 
chicken to saucepan. Gen-
tly stir in peas. Sprinkle with 
parsley to serve, if desired.

For more great ways to 
warm up this season, visit 
mccormick.com/kitchen-
basics.

During the short, dark days 
of winter, healthy soups like 
this will feed your body and 
warm your soul.

 
TUNA

WHAT TO KNOW 
ABOUT YOUR 
SANDWICH

SOUP
HEALTHY, 

HOMEMADE

Personal Health Care for Personal Health Care for 
the Entire Familythe Entire Family

C. Brooks Smith, M.D. & AssociatesC. Brooks Smith, M.D. & Associates

F A M I LY  P R A C T I C E

1204 Medical Plaza Ct. . Granbury  817.573.5688

SAME-DAY 

APPOINTMENTS 

AVAILABLE

Accepting Most Major 

Insurance Plans
Complete Medical Services

• Occupational Medicine •

• Pediatrics •

• Gynecology •

• Adult Medicine •

• Physical Exams •

• Health Maintenance •

• Sports Medicine •

www.granburydr.com
1204 Medical Plaza Ct. • Granbury

C. BROOKS SMITH, MDC. BROOKS SMITH, MD
• Greater Mental Clarity

• Increased Libido

• Decreased Body Fat

• Increased Muscle Tone

• Enhanced Energy 

Levels
Bio-identical Hormone Therapy

CERTIFIED PRACTITIONER

• Greater Mental Clarity

• Increased Libido

• Decreased Body Fat

• Increased Muscle Tone

• Enhanced Energy Levels

Abella Wellness
You’re as young as you feel!You’re as young as you feel!

817-573-5688817-573-5688
www.granburydr.com
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Dr. Carrie Morris, an oculo-
facial and reconstructive sur-
geon, said she has performed 
thousands of successful cos-
metic and reconstructive sur-
geries of the face, eyelid, eye 
socket and tear ducts.

As of this year, her practice, 
Carrie Lynn Morris, MD, PLLC 
and Radiance Wellness Spa, 
has added some innovative 
new services at the Granbury 
location along with increased 
availability. Some of the new 
services include: radiofre-
quency skin tightening, the 
only FDA-approved mi-
croneedling procedure (Skin-
pen), permanent makeup, 
and eyelash lifts and tints. 

“It’s basically like having 
mascara without having to re-
apply it; it usually lasts about 
six weeks,” Dr. Morris said. “It 
looks very natural.”

Patients can now also re-
quest to have their makeup 
permanently tattooed on 
their face using processes 
like microblading for the 
brow and eyeliner and lip 
tint. 

The Skinpen microneedling 
procedure improves scars 
and wrinkles with only one 
day of downtime. It can be 
performed year-round with-
out avoiding the sun. 

The NuEra Tite radiofre-
quency treatment has no 
side effects or downtime and 
takes only 20-30 minutes per 
session to perform. It can 
treat loose skin, cellulite and 
decreases fat on any area on 
the body.  

The Granbury office also 
extended its availability for 
med-spa service to Tuesday 
through Friday, which in-
clude facials, chemical peels, 
dermaplaning and Skinpen 
microneedling, permanent 
makeup and eyelash lifts and 
tints.

Dr. Morris is the only 
board-certified oculofacial 
plastic surgeon in the sur-
rounding five counties and 
the only physician who is 
board-certified in cosmetic 
laser surgery procedures in 
the Dallas-Fort Worth area.

She has extensive expertise 

and experience in blepharo-
plasty (“eyelid lifts”), pto-
sis repair, brow lifts, neck 
lifts, CO2 laser resurfacing, 
Smartlipo laser liposuction, 
Femtouch, Botox and filler 
injections.

“With the CO2 laser, I can 
remove what we call be-
nign or non-worrisome skin 
without having to cut them 
away, and it causes less scar-
ring,” she said. “I also use 
a different kind of laser to 
do Smartlipo ‘laser liposuc-
tion’ that actually melts the 
fat. Traditional liposuction, 
you’re stuck with the loose 
skin. This laser will shrink 
and tighten the skin after the 
fat is removed.” 

When asked how will pa-
tients know if it’s the right 
time to call and schedule an 
appointment, Dr. Morris said, 
“If it’s crossed your mind, it’s 
a good idea to call.” 

“You can only do so much 
research online, and some of 
the information you’re get-
ting may not be completely 
correct,” she said. “You want 
to have the treatment cus-
tomized. Unlike other med 
spas, I, the physician, am in-
jecting the Botox and fillers 
to the patient and supervis-
ing any treatment recom-
mendations and procedures. 
Sometimes people say that 
they need Botox, but they 
really need filler or a laser 
procedure. I think anytime 
someone is thinking about re-
juvenation, it doesn’t hurt to 
come and explore it.” 

Dr. Morris wants to empha-
size that if she deems a pro-
cedure medically necessary, 
Carrie Lynn Morris, MD, PLLC 
will accept most insurances. 

Morris said her goal is to 
operate regularly at Lake 
Granbury Medical Center, 
catering to patients who may 
not want to travel. 

Dr. Morris said that she 
graduated at the top of her 
class from the University of 
Alabama School of Medicine, 
and completed an ophthal-
mology residency program 
at Duke University Medical 
Center. She successfully com-
pleted a two-year American 
Society of Oculofacial Plastic 
and Reconstructive Surgery 

Fellowship in Memphis and 
Nashville, Tennessee.

She has authored more 
than 15 peer-reviewed ar-
ticles and has been a reviewer 
for four plastic surgery and 
aesthetic surgery journals. 
She recently published a 
chapter in the Duke Plastic 
Surgery Manual. Dr. Morris 
teaches other physicians and 
optometrists in the area, lec-
turing to the Dallas Optomet-
ric Society in February 2022. 
She is one of 10 named to the 
list of Southlake Style Most 
Inspirational, Accomplished, 
and Engaging Women for 
2020. She is a Key Opinion 
Leader for a global medical 
laser device company. 

“Our goal is to offer a one 
stop-shop in terms of aes-
thetics. We offer the full spec-
trum including noninvasive 
skin care, minimally invasive 
procedures to help either 
prevent or address aging, and 
plastic and laser surgery both 
aesthetic and reconstructive,” 
she added. “We have very 
qualified providers and offer 
the latest FDA-approved tech-
niques to have a customized 
experience that’s tailored to 
our patients. I feel like our 
team is very patient-centered, 
so our patients really enjoy 
coming in; it’s a warm feel-
ing.”  

If anyone would like to 
learn more about the ser-
vices, Radiance Wellness Me-
dispa is hosting a “Show the 
Love” Event on Friday, Feb. 11 
from 10 a.m.–7 p.m. Appoint-
ments are available, or walk 
in from 5-7 p.m. 

For more information or 
to schedule an appointment, 
call 817-326-3134 or 
email refreshedface@
carriemorrismd.com. 
Individuals can also make an 
appointment on the website: 
radiancewellnessmedispa.
com.

ashley@hcnews.com | 
817-573-1243
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SPA DAY
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CARRIE L. MORRIS, M.D.
OCULOFACIAL AESTHETIC & RECONSTRUCTIVE PLASTIC SURGERY

 COSMETIC LASER SURGERY

THERE’S 

ALWAYS 

TIME FOR 

SELF-CARE

817-326-3134
600 S. Harbor Court | Granbury, TX 

817-326-3134
Refreshedface@carriemorrismd.com
www.radiancewellnessmedispa.com

Eyelid & 

Facial Plastic Surgery 

C02 Laser Resurfacing 

Laser Liposuction   

Botox • Filler • Facials

FIRST AND ONLY 

PHYSICIAN SUPERVISED 

MEDSPA IN HOOD COUNTY

Share the Love

February 11

Granbury Office

Can bank specials or products. 

Buy and save now-use later.

BUY A HYDRAFACIAL PACKAGE (3) GET 
A MOISTURIZER AND CLEANSER 

FREEFREE

FEBRUARY SPECIALS

Get A

COLORSCIENCE LIPSHINE 
WITH ANY FILLER

FREEFREE

ANY SMARTLIPO SURGERY

$500 OFF$500 OFF
Buy a package of Chemical peels (3) 

Get one 

FREEFREE

$500 OFF
FEMTOUCH VAGINAL REJUVENATION 

$500 OFF$500 OFF
$950

(BANK UNITS FOR LATER USE)
$950$950

BOTOX BANK
Get 100 units for
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A 
recent study found 
that approximate-
ly three in four 
emergency room 

visits for accidents related 
to over-the-counter cold and 
flu medicines among young 
children were made after a 
child got into the medicine 
on their own. 

Are all of your medicines 
kept somewhere safe? With 
a potentially tough cold and 
flu season upon us, experts 
are urging parents and care-
givers to remember to keep 

medicines up and away and 
out of sight and reach of 
young children.

“During cold and flu sea-
son, seven in 10 people will 
reach for over-the-counter 
medicines to treat fevers, si-
nus headaches and other un-
welcome symptoms. That’s a 
lot of additional medication 
in the home. Kids are curi-
ous, so parents and caregiv-
ers should take care to put 
medicines up and away, out 
of reach and sight of young 
children — after every dose,” 
said Mary Leonard, managing 
director, Consumer Health-

care Products Association 
Educational Foundation.

The Up and Away cam-
paign is an initiative of the 
Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention and its PRO-
TECT Initiative, in partner-
ship with the Consumer 
Healthcare Products Associa-
tion Educational Foundation. 
The campaign aims to pre-
vent accidental ingestion of 
medicine in young children 
by reminding families to fol-
low these tips:
n Keep medicines, includ-

ing those carried in purses, 
bags, pockets or pill organiz-

ers, in a safe location that is 
too high for curious, young 
children to reach or see.
n Never leave medicines 

or vitamins out on a coun-
ter, table or at a sick child’s 
bedside. To a young child, 
pills can look like candy and 
liquid medicines can look like 
sugary drinks.
n At home or away, keep 

medicines in child-resistant 
containers until right before 
you take them.
n If your medicine has a 

locking cap that turns, twist 
it until you can’t twist any-
more or hear the “click.”

n Teach children what 
medicine is and why you or 
another caregiver must be 
the one to give it to them.
n Remind babysitters, 

houseguests and visitors to 
keep purses, bags, suitcases 
or coats that have medicines 
in them up and away and out 
of sight when they’re in your 
home.

Save the Poison Help num-
ber (800-222-1222) in your 
phone, so you have it when 
and if you need it. Make 
sure that babysitters, older 
children, grandparents and 
frequent family visitors have 

this information too, in case 
there’s an emergency when 
they’re in charge. Call Poison 
Help right away if you think 
your child might have gotten 
into a medicine or vitamin, 
even if you are not complete-
ly sure. You can also visit poi-
son.org. To learn more and 
for additional free resources, 
visit upandaway.org.

This cold and flu season 
and year-round, keep chil-
dren safe by keeping medi-
cine up and away and out of 
the sight and reach of young 
children.

A

MEDICINE
SAFETY

TIPS FOR PARENTS
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W
hile diet and 
exercise resolu-
tions typically top 
New Year’s lists, 

experts say that focusing a 
few of your resolutions on 
forming good habits relating 
to your pharmacy routine can 
improve your overall health.

Susan Peppers, RPh, vice 
president, Express Scripts 
Pharmacy, suggests these 
resolutions to make the most 
of your pharmacy care.

RESOLVE TO… ASK MORE 
QUESTIONS

Many of us are hesitant to 
speak up when we have ques-

tions about prescribed medi-
cations or therapies. Don’t 
be. Pharmacists have clinical 
expertise and can play an 
important role in your whole 
health.

RESOLVE TO… NEVER MISS 
A DOSE

The best way to see im-
provement in both chronic 
and short-term conditions 
is to take medication as pre-
scribed — the right dose at 
the right time in the right 
way. Try using a pill contain-
er or a dose reminder or tak-
ing your medication as part 
of your daily routine, such as 
brushing your teeth. Talk to 
your pharmacist about the 

best time to take your medi-
cation.

You should also consider 
ongoing home delivery so 
you never run out of medica-
tion due to a missed phar-
macy trip. Your prescriptions 
will be refilled at the right 
time, so your medicine will 
always be on hand.

RESOLVE TO… TAKE YOUR 
MEDICATIONS SAFELY

Taking medication the 
wrong way or without knowl-
edge of their effects can be 
dangerous. Read and under-
stand the instructions print-
ed on your prescription label, 
so you can be sure you’re tak-
ing your medicine exactly as 

intended. For example, taking 
certain medications on an 
empty stomach if you’re sup-
posed to take it with a meal 
can reduce their effective-
ness.

You’ll also want to be sure 
you don’t mix your medica-
tion with certain other drugs 
or alcohol, or even engage in 
specific activities, like driv-
ing, if the label warns you 
against doing so.

RESOLVE TO… CLEAN OUT 
YOUR MEDICINE CABINET

Many people find they’re 
more likely to take medica-
tions properly if they have 
a well-organized medicine 
cabinet. Go through and 

properly dispose of expired 
medications or those you’re 
no longer taking.

RESOLVE TO… CHECK-IN 
WITH YOUR DOCTOR

Your health can change, 
and your prescriptions 
should change along with it. 
Schedule time at least once 
annually to go over every-
thing you’re being prescribed. 
It’s a good chance to talk to 
your doctor about what’s 
working, what’s not and what 
might need adjustments. In 
turn, keeping all medications 
at a single pharmacy when 
possible allows your pharma-
cist to have the most accurate 
information to help keep you 

safe from drug interactions 
or medication issues. Be sure 
your physician knows which 
pharmacy you use.

RESOLVE TO… UPDATE 
YOUR INSURANCE 
INFORMATION

The beginning of a new 
year is the perfect time to en-
sure you have updated insur-
ance information accessible 
in case you need to reference 
it. Replace old cards with new 
ones as soon as you can to 
save time and reduce confu-
sion when filling prescrip-
tions.

RX
RESOLUTIONS

IMPROVE YOUR HEALTH IN 2022
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I
t surprises a lot of people 
to learn that the U.S. 
is the most dangerous 
place to give birth in the 

developed world. 
Women in the U.S. are more 

likely to die from pregnancy-
related complications than 
women in Libya and Kazakh-
stan, and the U.S. is the only 
industrialized nation to expe-
rience an increase in mater-
nal mortality over the last 
two decades.

Pregnancy is especially 
dangerous for women of 
color. Black women in the U.S. 
lose their lives in childbirth at 
three to four times the rate of 
white women.

But there is good news. 
Experts say we can reduce 
deaths among moms and ba-
bies by improving health poli-
cies and changing the way 
care is delivered.

MomsRising, an online 
and on-the-ground organiza-
tion working to improve the 
health and economic security 

of moms and families, is urg-
ing federal and state lawmak-
ers to invest in research into 
the reasons pregnancy and 
childbirth are so dangerous 
in the U.S.

The group is pressing to 
improve prenatal care, bet-
ter train doctors and nurses, 
diversify the perinatal health 
care workforce, make it 
easier for working moms to 
breastfeed, improve men-
tal health care for pregnant 
women and new moms, en-
sure that pregnant women 

on Medicaid can keep their 
health insurance for a year 
after giving birth, and guar-
antee paid leave. Right now, 
one in four women go back to 
work just two weeks after giv-
ing birth because they can’t 
afford to take any additional 
unpaid time off to recover 
from childbirth and care for 
their infant.

“The early weeks of a 
baby’s life are critical for 
families. Insufficient paid 
leave for moms and dads is 
harmful for the health and 

well-being of both babies and 
parents,” said Tina Sherman, 
MomsRising’s senior cam-
paign director for maternal 
justice. “Families need that 
time to bond, moms need it 
to heal from birth and estab-
lish breastfeeding routines, 
and it’s crucial for infant de-
velopment.”

Learn more at www.
momsrising.org.

“Making pregnancy and 
childbirth safer is especially 
important as we recover from 
the pandemic, which has 

caused tremendous strain 
for many of us,” Sherman 
adds. “The U.S. is the richest 
country in the world, and it’s 
past time we make pregnancy 
and childbearing as safe as 
possible for everyone. When 
we do, moms and kids will be 
healthier, communities stron-
ger, and businesses and our 
economy more successful.”

PREGNANCY
RISKY BUSINESS IN AMERICA
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B
y 2025, there will be 
over 1 billion women 
experiencing meno-
pause in the world, 

which will be 12% of the en-
tire world population. 

Most women hit meno-
pause by their 50s. However, 
changes in the body start to 
appear earlier than you might 
think, often many years be-
fore a woman officially hits 
menopause. 

This time in a woman’s 
life can bring bothersome 
and debilitating symptoms 
which can significantly affect 
a woman’s health and daily 
routines.

Women may notice physi-
cal changes in their skin as 
one of the first symptoms as 

they age. 
“When you’re young, your 

body produces an abun-
dance of collagen, the main 
skin-supporting protein 
that keeps your face supple 
and hydrated,” said natural 
health physician and author, 
Dr. Fred Pescatore. “Studies 
show that women lose about 
30% of their skin’s collagen 
during the first five years of 
menopause due to hormonal 
shifts.”

With collagen loss, skin 
becomes thinner and prone 
to wrinkles. It also loses the 
ability to protect itself, main-
tain hydration and produce 
strong collagen the way it 
once could. Many women 
see these changes reflected 
in increased bags under the 
eyes, sagging neck skin, and 

increased hyperpigmentation 
in the face and hands.

There are several ways for 
women to minimize and man-
age skin health concerns that 
appear during this period.

MINIMIZE SUN EXPOSURE
Try to avoid direct sun 

exposure. Some women ex-
perience increased hyperpig-
mentation on their face and 
hands, often referred to as 
dark spots, leading up to and 
during menopause. This is 
caused by a combination of 
hormonal changes and sun 
exposure. “You can help min-
imize your skin’s exposure 
to the sun by wearing sun-
screen, hats and gloves when 
outdoors,” said Dr. Pescatore.

TAKE SHORTER SHOWERS
Keep showers short and 

not too hot. “Spending too 
much time in water, especial-
ly hot water, strips natural 
oils from your skin, leaving it 
dry,” Pescatore said. 

In the time leading up to 
and during menopause, your 
skin is at increased risk for 
dryness, so try to take short, 
lukewarm showers to keep 
skin optimally hydrated.

ADD A PROVEN SUPPLEMENT
Look for ingredients that 

can stimulate collagen pro-
duction and help improve the 
health of your skin from in-
side and out. Numerous clini-
cal studies have shown that 
daily supplementation with 
the super-antioxidant Pycno-
genol (Pic-noj-en-all) French 

maritime pine bark extract 
can help minimize various 
skin concerns middle-aged 
women experience.

Pycnogenol binds with ex-
isting skin proteins, collagen 
and elastin, stimulates the 
genesis of new collagen and 
hyaluronic acid, and protects 
skin from various harmful 
enzymes, helping to re-
build elasticity for a smooth, 
younger look. 

Additionally, Pycnogenol 
has been shown to reduce hy-
perpigmentation for a more 
even complexion. 

A recent study, published 
in 2021, found that those 
who supplemented with 
100mg of Pycnogenol for 
12 weeks during dry winter 
months experienced a 13% 
improvement in both skin 

elasticity and skin firmness.
“Pycnogenol is one of the 

most studied ingredients on 
the market, with decades of 
research showing the ben-
efits of this natural extract 
for a variety of health appli-
cations,” Pescatore said. “In 
fact, the extract has specifi-
cally been studied on meno-
pausal women, so the skin 
benefits complement its ad-
ditional women’s health ben-
efits nicely.”

Available in more than 
1,000 dietary supplements, 
topical creams, and health 
products worldwide, 
more information about 
Pycnogenol can be found by 
visiting pycnogenol.com.

MENOPAUSE
EVOLVING SKIN CARE


